
STEWARD'S REPORT

Shepparton
Thursday, 01 Feb 2024

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: M. Bayliss

Stewards: R. Fazulla, I. Taylor & J. Smith

Judges: S. Colliver

Lure Drivers: S. Baldwin

Starter: S. Evans & N. Groom

Kennel Supervisor: J. Jubb

Kennel Attendants: A. Groom, K. Stevens & M. Fothergill

Veterinarian: Dr. Nadun De Silva

Race 1
SPORTSBET GO THE BLUE DOG 

1:00 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Mr. D. Boots was issued with a warning under GAR156(f) for negligence, after the greyhound Ando's Jae
was placed in the incorrect kennel during the kennelling process.

Club Officials were reminded of their responsibilities after the greyhound Ando's Jae was placed in the
incorrect kennel during the kennelling process. This matter was referred to the Club Manager for further
consideration and remediation.

Aston Apatite and Munakka were quick to begin.

Munakka (severely checked and fell on the first turn), underwent a post–race veterinary examination and
was found to have a right deltoid muscle injury and a left abraded carpal pad. A 7 day stand down period
was imposed.

A post–race sample was taken from Rapidfire Jayda – the winner of the event. 

Race 2
LIKE GRVictoria ON FACEBOOK

1:15 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Little Speckle – New declared weight of 26.2kg, last raced at 24.7kg.

Regal Phonic and Crash Zambora were slow to begin. One Knee Noni, Pirate's Brew and Little Speckle
were very slow to begin.

Stewards spoke to Mr. Jordan Formosa regarding the racing manners of One Knee Noni in the home
straight. After hearing submissions from Mr. Formosa, viewing the available race footage and having their
own observations, the Stewards issued a warning to connections. 

A post–race sample was taken from Run Pebbles Run – the winner of the event. 

Race 3
FOLLOW @TheWatchdogTips ON X

1:33 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Sunshine North, Rolling Coal and Aileen's Lad were slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Typhoon Cameron – the winner of the event. 

Race 4
ELITE COLLARS & LEADS

1:50 pm
450m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Ducks A Flying and Belsar were slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Belsar – the winner of the event. 

Race 5
RACERS FUNCTION CENTRE

2:09 pm
390m

Grade 5 T3

Blue Tick Maya was quick to begin. Mr. Freddie Lee and Market Mate were slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Mango Man – the winner of the event. 

Race 6
homesanddomes.com.au

2:25 pm

Colour Me and Herd 'Em Up were slow to begin.

Millie Marlaine (severely checked and fell approaching the home turn), underwent a post–race veterinary
examination and was found to have a left shoulder injury and a right hip injury. A 7 day stand down period



390m
Grade 5 T3

was imposed.

A post–race sample was taken from Press Start – the winner of the event. 

Race 7
MMS ACCESS 

2:44 pm
450m

Grade 5 T3

Gracious Gift was quick to begin. Bear Lee Bond, Coach Beard and Clear Springs were slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Gracious Gift – the winner of the event. 

Race 8
REJUVENATE @ STUD

3:00 pm
450m

Grade 5 T3

Pursuant to GAR 75(6), Kennel Attendant Mr. K. Stevens did not act in any official capacity that may have in
any way affected the outcome of this event.

Mum Said Albert stumbled at box rise and was slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Ramblin' Man – the winner of the event. 

Race 9
gvshelving.com.au 

3:19 pm
450m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

Pursuant to GAR 75(6), Kennel Attendant Mr. M. Fothergill did not act in any official capacity that may have
in any way affected the outcome of this event.

Mr. D. Burkett requested an early race endorsement for Detriot. Stewards approved the request after an
examination prior to racing by the on–track veterinarian. Detriot will compete in early races until further
notice.

Detriot was slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Finders Keepers – the winner of the event. 

Race 10
SHEPPARTON WORKWEAR & SAFETY

3:37 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

A pre–race sample was unable to be obtained from Our Boy Billy, a post–race sample was subsequently
taken.

Big Trucker was slow to begin.

Ms. Madison Carter failed to appear at the kennels by the appointed time to retrieve and prepare Our Boy
Billy for racing. A warning was issued pursuant to GAR 97(2).

A post–race sample was taken from Our Boy Billy – placed 4th in the event. A post–race sample was taken
from Spoiler Alert – the winner of the event. 

Race 11
GPP LASER3300

3:59 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

Slingshot Roxy was quick to begin.

Cherry Red (severely checked and fell on the first turn), underwent a post–race veterinary examination and
was found to have a right carpal sprain injury. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

A post–race sample was taken from Redemption Rock – the winner of the event. 

Race 12
SPORTSBET MAKE IT LOOK EASY 

4:17 pm
390m

Grade 5 T3

My Bro Jill – New declared weight of 35.2kg, last raced at 36.8. Brother Yap – New declared weight of
32.5kg, last raced at 31.0kg.

Shaye was slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Argyle Emma – the winner of the event. 

Satisfactory Trials:

Trial 1:

Harbour Lights – Seizure – Solo, Distance: 390m, Weight: 29.1kg, Box 1,  Time Run 22.638 – Comment:
Cleared All Tracks.

To watch this Satisfactory Trial, copy SHP THU 01 FEB 24 ST1 into the search engine of YouTube.

Trial 2:

Aston Bolivar – Fail To Pursue – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 31.8kg, Box 1, Placed 1st, Time Run
22.62 – Comment: Not Cleared visibly eased on the home turn. 

Aurelia – Fail To Pursue – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 27.0kg, Box 2, Placed 2nd, Time Run 22.66 –
Comment: Cleared All Tracks except, Sale.

Kraken Rock – Fail To Pursue – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 31.6kg, Box 3, Placed 3rd, Time Run
22.70 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks.

Orson Girl – Unsatisfactory Performance – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 25.6kg, Box 4, pulled up in
the home straight – Comment: Not Cleared.

Orson Girl underwent a post–race veterinary examination – no apparent injury was reported. 

Kraken Loop – Fail To Pursue – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 26.3kg, Box 7, Placed 4th, Time Run
22.75 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks.



He Is Chill – Blinkers On – Field of 6, Distance: 390m, Weight: 31.6kg, Box 8, Placed 5th, Time Run 22.77 –
Comment: Not Cleared turned its head inwards in the home straight. 

To watch this Satisfactory Trial, copy SHP THU 01 FEB 24 ST2 into the search engine of YouTube.




