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Race 1
www.tab.com.au

7:13 pm
730m

Handicap

Lektra Jay and Wiradjuri Rush collided on the first turn. Wiradjuri Rush and Mimicking collided
approaching the second turn. Lektra Jay and Adelle Bale collided approaching the second turn. Adelle
Bale and Wiradjuri Rush collided in the back straight. Empire Mariah checked off Mimicking on the fifth
turn.

Race 2
RSN

7:35 pm
525m

Grade 5

Raid The Bank and Chilly Babe were slow to begin. Raid The Bank and Chilly Babe collided soon after the
start. Call The Police and Ta collided soon after the start. Burcov Nicole and Leo The Line collided on the
first turn. Carey Bale and Raid The Bank collided on the first turn. Ta checked off Carey Bale on the first turn
checking Chilly Babe. Burcov Nicole and Leo The Line collided approaching the second turn checking
Burcov Nicole and Inescapeable. Leo The Line and Call The Police collided approaching the second turn.
Burcov Nicole and Inescapeable collided entering the back straight. Carey Bale checked off Raid The
Bank on the third turn checking Inescapeable. Ta and Carey Bale collided approaching the home turn and
again in the home straight.

Race 3
AWM ELECTRICAL

7:55 pm
525m

Grade 5

Eucla Charlie was slow to begin. Jimi Krakcorn and Just Casual collided soon after the start checking Just
Casual. Dyna Denny and Dyna Elric collided approaching the first turn. Dyna Denny checked off So Manic
on the first turn checking Dyna Elric and Eucla Charlie. Bardot Bale crossed to the rail on the first turn
checking Just Casual. Dyna Denny and Eucla Charlie collided approaching the second turn. Just Casual
checked off So Manic approaching the second turn. Jimi Krakcorn and Bardot Bale collided on the third
turn. checking Jimi Krackcorn. So Manic and Jimi Krakcorn collided approaching the home turn checking
So Manic. Just Casual and So Manic collided on the home turn. Just Casual and Dyna Elric collided
entering the home straight.

Race 4
DEE WINTER AT STUD SPRING

SERIES FNL
8:15 pm
525m

S/E Final

Rod's Super, Burcov Caviar, Seebohm and Drama were slow to begin. Rod's Super and Burcov Caviar
collided approaching the first turn. Flaming Shiraz and Space Power collided approaching the first turn.
Rod's Super, Burcov Caviar, Seebohm and Drama collided on the first turn severely checking Burcov
Caviar and Drama. Burcov Caviar stumbled approaching the second turn. Space Power and Tian Mi Mi
collided on the third turn. Seebohm checked off Tian Mi Mi approaching the home turn checking Flaming
Shiraz. Flaming Shiraz and Rod's Super collided entering the home straight checking Rod's Super. Burcov
Caviar was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to its right
back muscle, a 5 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards issued a warning to D. Fisher, the trainer
of Burcov Caviar regarding the greyhound's racing manners approaching the second turn. A sample was
taken from Taxi Sono Qui - the winner of the event.

Race 5
SKY RACING FINAL (GOBIS)

8:35 pm
730m

Grade 5 Final

Light Fantastic, Bagget Bale and Double Jeopardy were slow to begin and collided soon after the start.
Classique Garcon checked off Yowyeh on the first turn checking Erica Allen and severely checking
Dewana Sienna. Yowyeh and She's Purring collided on the third turn. Light Fantastic, Bagget Bale and
Dewana Sienna collided on the fifth turn checking Light Fantastic, Bagget Bale and Erica Allen. Yowyeh
and She's Purring collided on the home turn. Bagget Bale and Dewana Sienna collided on the home turn.
Classique Garcon and Double Jeopardy collided in the home straight. A sample was taken from She's
Purring - the winner of the event.

Race 6
GRV VBIS MAIDEN SERIES FINAL

(GOBIS)
8:57 pm

Elmer's Gift, Lektra Radiant and Crystal Hand were slow to begin. Zelemar Pace and Galahad collided
soon after the start checking Zelemar Pace. Lektra Radiant and Engine Alley collided approaching the first
turn. Zelemar Fever and Elmer's Gift collided on the first turn. Zelemar Pace, Lektra Radiant, Engine Alley
and Crystal Hand collided on the first turn checking Engine Alley and severely checking Crystal Hand.
Kracken Magic and Zelemar Fever collided approaching the second turn checking Kracken Magic,



525m
Maiden Final

Zelemar Pace, Zelemar Fever, Engine Alley and Lektra Radiant. Zelemar Fever, Kracken Magic and Lektra
Radiant collided on the home turn checking Zelemar Fever and Zelemar Pace. Zelemar Fever and Engine
Alley collided in the home straight. A sample was taken from Galahad - the winner of the event.

Race 7
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS

9:22 pm
525m

Mixed 4/5

All Inn Brady, Gino Keeping and Went Wooshka were slow to begin. Take Me Home was quick to begin.
Alana Bale, All In Brady and Gus Bale collided soon after the start checking All Inn Brady. Gino Keeping
and Went Wooshka collided soon after the start. Running Smart and Gus Bale collided approaching the
first turn. Alana Bale and All Inn Brady collided on the first turn and again in the back straight checking
Alana Bale. Went Wooshka checked off Gino Keeping in the back straight. Gino Keeping and Went
Wooshka collided on the third turn. Running Smart and Gus Bale collided in the home straight.

Race 8
MACRO MEATS

9:42 pm
525m

Free For All

Ed Pacino and Heston Bale were slow to begin and collided soon after the start. Razza Bale and Dyna
Steal collided soon after the start. Sapporo, Ed Pacino and Heston Bale collided approaching the first turn.
Sapporo and Flip Bale collided approaching the first turn. Don Chendo and Razza Bale collided on the first
turn. Sapporo checked off Don Chendo on the first turn checking Ed Pacino and Heston Bale. Sapporo
checked off Razza Bale approaching the second turn. Sapporo checked off Razza Bale on the third turn
checking Ed Pacino and Heston Bale.

Race 9
SCOTTY'S MEATS FINAL

10:05 pm
525m

Grade 5 Final

Pop's Max, Yoshimitsu and Daintree Warrior were slow to begin. Paper Chaser was quick to begin. Pop's
Max and Yoshimitsu collided soon after the start. Allen Gaspar, Mahogany Boy, Bizarre Escape and
Daintree Warrior collided soon after the start checking Mahogany Boy and Daintree Warrior. Pop's Max and
Yoshimitsu collided approaching the first turn checking Yoshimitsu. Bizarre Escape and Allen Gasper
collided approaching the first turn. Hurunui Hitman and Bizarre Escape collided on the first turn. Pop's Max
and Allen Gasper collided on the first turn checking Allen Gasper. Paper Chaser and Pop's Max collided on
the third turn. Mahogany Boy checked off Daintree Warrior on the third turn. Yoshimitsu and Allen Gaspar
collided approaching the home turn. Daintree Warrior and Paper Chaser collided in the home straight.

Race 10
HUDSON PACIFIC

10:27 pm
600m

Mixed 4/5

Simple Class was slow to begin. Where's Betty, Whodat Lass and Gold Affair Two collided approaching the
first turn checking Where's Betty and Whodat Lass. Cool Cred and Simple Class collided on the first turn
and again in the front straight. Whodat Lass raced wide in the front straight. Cool Cred checked off Simple
Class approaching the second turn checking Whodat Lass. Gold Affair Two checked off Turkoglu on the
forth turn. Turkoglu checked off Simple Class approaching the home turn.

Race 11
GEOTECHNICAL LABORATORIES

10:47 pm
525m

Grade 5

Zipping Duke and Ronald Weasley were slow to begin. Glamorous Keisha and Pop Hand collided soon
after the start. Nelson Park, Glamorous Keisha and Pop Hand collided soon after the start. Imani Bale and
Zipping Duke collided approaching the first turn. Nelson Park, Glamorous Keisha, Pop Hand and Imani
Bale collided approaching the first turn. Zipping Duke checked off Glamorous Keisha on the first turn. Imani
Bale checked off Pop Hand approaching the second turn. Glamorous Keisha and Zipping Duke collided on
the third turn checking Glamorous Keisha. Restless Teddy and Nelson Park collided on the home turn.
Restless Teddy and Zipping Duke collided in the home straight.

Race 12
AJS CORPORATION

11:05 pm
525m

Grade 5

Pursuant to GAR 104 starter Robert Lesueur did not act in any official capacity for this event. Big Black Mac
was quick to begin. Chunuk Bair, Jaraman, Whatta Joke, Nikita's Elite and Giselle Bale collided soon after
the start checking Jaraman, Whatta Joke and Nikita's Elite. Oomoo and Chunuk Bair collided approaching
the first turn. Giselle Bale and Felix Felicis collided approaching the first turn. Whatta Joke and Nikita's Elite
collided on the first turn. Jaraman and Whatta Joke collided approaching the second turn. Chunuk Bair and
Felix Felicis collided on the third turn checking Whatta Joke and severely checking Chunuk Bair. Nikita's
Elite collided with Jaraman approaching the home turn. Chunuk Bair and Whatta Joke collided
approaching the home turn. Oomoo checked off Big Black Mac in the home straight.




