
STEWARD'S REPORT

Healesville
Sunday, 16 Jul 2023

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: L. Fahry

Stewards: D. Barber, L. Pearson & S. Colliver

Judges: L. Schulze

Lure Drivers: L. Gough

Starter: T. Varichione

Kennel Supervisor: M. Jenkins

Kennel Attendants: D. Parker & B. Harrison

Veterinarian: Dr Andrew Kalinowski

Race 1
SPORTSBET HT1

11:20 am
300m

Maiden Heat

Pursuant to GAR 75(7), Steward Ms D. Barber did not act in any official capacity for this event.

Asia and Irish Brew were slow to begin.

Minikin Mikado raced ungenerously approaching the winning post, underwent a post-race veterinary
examination and was found to have a left gastrocnemius muscle. A 7 day stand down period was
imposed. Stewards spoke to Ms M. Barber regarding the racing manners of Minikin Mikado approaching
the winning post. After hearing submissions from Ms. Barber, viewing the available race footage and
having their own observations, Stewards took no further action.

Race 2
SPORTSBET HT2

11:37 am
300m

Maiden Heat

Pursuant to GAR 75(7), Steward Ms D. Barber did not act in any official capacity for this event.

Cake was quick to begin. Pacific Lily and Aussie Savannah were slow to begin.

Race 3
SPORTSBET HT3

11:53 am
300m

Maiden Heat

Kid Kinloch went up with the lids and was slow to begin.

Burn The Witch raced wide soon after the start.

Race 4
SPORTSBET HT4

12:17 pm
300m

Maiden Heat

A sample was taken from Hello Buddy upon arrival at the course.

Meehan Boston and Unique Artist were quick to begin. Tonk Almighty was slow to begin. 

Race 5
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

12:39 pm
350m

Mixed 6/7

A pre-race sample was taken from Extremely Potent.

Shine On Lilly was quick to begin. Rio Blazer and Rumour Confirmed were slow to begin.

Race 6
CROYDON HOMING PIGEON CLUB

12:57 pm
350m

Grade 5

Jachar and Mepunga Echo were slow to begin.

Blacklisted faltered at the 100m mark and lost ground, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and
was found to have a fractured right hock. A 90 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Our Tie Breaker - the winner of the event.



Race 7
WILD GRAINS BAKERY DAMSELS

DASH
1:15 pm
350m

Grade 5

Hallee's Reef was quick to begin. Pure Promise, Abdominis and Ally Melba were slow to begin. Aston
Miedema began awkwardly and was slow to begin. 

Race 8
FOLLOW @GRV_NEWS ON TWITTER

1:31 pm
350m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Shall Not.

Reeling Dollars was quick to begin.

This event was delayed by approximately 2 minutes due to operational matters.

Race 9
FOLLOW @TheWatchdogTips ON

TWITTER
1:57 pm
300m

Mixed 6/7

Pacific Goldie was quick to begin. Power Charge, Flying Avenue and Viking were slow to begin. 

Viva Audacious visibly turned its head to the outside approaching the 250m mark, underwent a post-race
veterinary examination and was re-examined following event 11. Viva Audacious was found to have a right
glutealsmuscle injury. A 14 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to Ms R. Busuttil
regarding Viva Audacious' racing manners approaching the 250m mark. Acting under the provisions of
GAR 125, Viva Audacious was charged with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of
injury). Ms. Busuttil pleaded guilty to the charge. Viva Audacious must perform a Satisfactory Trial in
accordance with GAR 125, and pursuant to GAR 132, before any future nomination will be accepted.

Flying Avenue faltered soon after the start and tailed off, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and
was found to have be injured in the left sartorius muscle.  A 10 day stand down period was imposed. In
accordance with GAR 122, the Stewards requested Ms A. Peat to report as soon as practicable anything
that may have affected the running of Flying Avenue in the event, which was not noted by Stewards during
or immediately after the event.

Race 10
healesville.grv.org.au

2:15 pm
300m

Free For All

Change – Late scratching at 10:31am on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 92) due to
dehydration. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Cosmic Holiday – New declared weight of 32.5kg, last raced at 30.8kg.

A pre-race sample was taken from Blue Cristalle.

Race 11
PITSTOP MOWER REPAIRS

2:34 pm
300m

Grade 5

Star Hawk was quick to begin.

A post-race sample was taken from Maxed Out - the winner of the event. 

Race 12
JASON McKEOWN PHOTOGRAPHY

2:54 pm
300m

Grade 5

Mystic Love and Don't Tell Him were quick to begin. 

Meeting Comments:

Stewards spoke to licenced participant Mr A. Gwynne and reminded him of his responsibilities pursuant to
GAR 84(2) that no other animal other than a greyhound engaged or trialing at an event can be on course.

Satisfactory Trial:

Speedy Magpie - Fail to chase – Field of 4, Distance: 300m, Weight: 26.5kg, Box 1, Placed 3rd, Time Run
17.13 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks.

Major Bomber - Fail to chase - Field of 4, Distance: 300m, Weight: 33.0kg, Box 8, Placed 2nd, Time Run
17.00 – Comment: Cleared straight tracks only.

To watch this Satisfactory Trial, copy HVL SUN 16 JUL 23 ST1 into the search engine of YouTube.




