
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Thursday, 02 Nov 2023

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Soft 6

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Curry

Stewards: P. Watson, C. Hon & B. Blood

Judges: N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: J. Haigh

Starter: D. Robertson

Kennel Supervisor: C. Hopkins

Kennel Attendants: G. White S. Bull & M. Hunter

Veterinarian: Dr Sarah Doornbusch

Race 1
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

5:18 pm
390m

Maiden

Who's Nanna Pat, Aston Sheeran and Urith Bale were quick to begin. Linda Lobster and Aston Iggy were
slow to begin.

Aston Congo lame post race, underwent a post–race veterinary examination and was found to have a right
hindleg split webbing injury. A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
TUDOR ELECTRICAL

5:41 pm
390m

Maiden

Aston Aurelia – Late scratching at 12.36pm when Mr B Magri reported the greyhound to have diarrhoea
(GAR 76). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards will require a veterinary certificate pursuant
to GAR 19(3)(w) before any future nominations will be accepted.

Fifty Short – representative Mrs M Turner was queried as significant betting fluctuations were observed by
Stewards. The comments of Mrs M Turner were noted, pre–race sample was unable to be obtained from
Fifty Short, a post–race sample was subsequently taken.

Aston Truman and Ginnivan were slow to begin. 

Aston Truman severely checked and fell first turn, underwent a post–race veterinary examination and was
found to have abrasions to head and right metacarpals.  A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

 

Race 3
SPORTSBET FINAL

5:56 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7 Final

Queston Bale, Glow and Slipstream Beam were quick to begin. 

A post–race sample was taken from Aston Zoom – the winner of the event.

Race 4
A1 SIGNAGE GDR

6:20 pm
660m

Special Event

An out of competition sample was taken from Misty Black on 27.10.2023 pursuant to GAR 139.

Untapped and Zoha Bale were quick to begin. Misty Black was slow to begin. 

A post–race sample was taken from Zoha Bale – the winner of the event.

Race 5
SJC CONCRETING (1-3 WINS)

6:41 pm
450m

Restricted Win

Patch You Later was quick to begin. Orli Bale and Moraine Marvel were slow to begin. 

Grandpa - checked and fell first turn, underwent a post–race veterinary examination and was found to have
a left hindleg sesamoid injury. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 6
SOUTHERN SHEETMETAL

6:58 pm
450m

Grade 5

Divine Nature was slow to begin.



Race 7
EUREKA CONCRETE

7:16 pm
450m

Grade 5

Mr D Elliot failed to appear at the kennels by the appointed time to retrieve and prepare Fiery Flirt for
racing. A warning was issued pursuant to GAR 97(2).

A pre–race sample was unable to be obtained from Fiery Flirt, a post–race sample was subsequently
taken.

Where Is He, Moraine Nadia and Let Fly were quick to begin. Max Power and Pepper Rush were was slow
to begin.

Race 8
PAUA OF BUDDY AT STUD

7:31 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

Spartan Legend was slow to begin.

Race 9
SWEET NETTY'S CATERING

7:46 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

Moraine Sofia was quick to begin. Outsmart was slow to begin.

Moriane Sofia checked and lost ground on the first turn, underwent a post–race veterinary examination –
no apparent injury was reported.

Stewards spoke to trainer Mr G Judd regarding Moriane Sofias racing action on the first turn and over the
concluding stages. In accordance with GAR 122, the Stewards requested Mr G Judd to report as soon as
practicable anything that may have affected the running of Moraine Sofia in the event, which was not noted
by Stewards during or immediately after the event.

Fergus Bale - turned in the boxes, underwent a post–race veterinary examination and was found to have
both left and right foreleg shin soreness.  A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Fergus Bale – Turned in the boxes, took no competitive part in the race and was placed on a Satisfactory
Trial in accordance with GAR 106(1) and pursuant to GAR 132.

Supplementary Report 03.11.23: Trainer Mr G Judd, notified Stewards in accordance with GAR 122 that
Moraine Sofia was free from injury but will continue to monitor over the coming days.

Race 10
TOWN & COUNTRY LINE MARKING

8:01 pm
390m

Mixed 4/5

Pursuant to GAR 75(6), starter Ms. D. Robertson did not act in any official capacity that may have in any
way affected the outcome of this event.

Life's A Riot was slow to begin was slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Zella Bale – the winner of the event.

Race 11
dreamchasersfestival.com.au

8:16 pm
390m

Grade 5

Deloris Bale – Late scratching at 4.35pm on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 92) due to right
gracilis muscle injury. A 28 day stand down period was imposed.

A pre–race sample was taken from Carajillo.

Vinny Dewalt was quick to begin. Disguise and Cawbourne Group were slow to begin.

Race 12
SPORTSBET BET WITH MATES

8:31 pm
390m

Grade 5

Zippy Wiesman was quick to begin.Breeze Breaker was slow to begin.




