
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Saturday, 23 Sep 2023

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Spence

Stewards: C. Day, S. Sutton & F. Mitoiu

Judges: R. Drew & L. Schulze

Lure Drivers: C. Chilcott

Starter: P. Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: S. Brincat

Kennel Attendants: D. Pryse, M. Wlodarczyk, A. Robertson, & J. Mullavey

Veterinarian: Dr. Michael Bell

Race 1
SPORTSBET BET WITH MATES

6:39 pm
525m

Grade 7

A pre–race sample was taken from Grand Tourer.

Caboa Elderberry, Grand Tourer and It's Been Time were slow to begin.

Race 2
SKY RACING

6:57 pm
525m

Grade 6

My Shout Boys – Late scratching at 9.59am when Trainer Mr C. Keith reported the greyhound to have an
illness (GAR 76). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards will require a veterinary certificate
pursuant to GAR 19(3)(w) before any future nominations will be accepted.

A pre–race sample was taken from Crimson Cannon.

So Special faltered on the first turn, lost ground and took no further part, underwent a post–race veterinary
examination and was found to have a right hock fracture. A 90 day stand down period was imposed.

Following the running of this event, Stewards inspected the track on the turn out of the front straight and
deemed it satisfactory for racing.

Race 3
POTTER FAMILY REUNION

7:19 pm
525m

Grade 5

Glenn Rounds was issued with a warning pursuant to GAR 156(f)(ii) for negligence, in that he presented
Peaky Joe for pre-race identification with the incorrect race rug.

Dawny Dream was quick to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Dawny Dream – the winner of the event.

Race 4
SPORTSBET HT1

7:38 pm
600m

Grade 5 Heat

Kadence Bale and Rock Me Rocco were slow to begin.

A post-race sample was taken from Benalla Bandit - winner of the event.

Race 5
SPORTSBET HT2

7:56 pm
600m

Grade 5 Heat

A pre–race sample was taken from Little Prince.

Garry Stun On was quick to begin. Go Far Star was slow to begin.

The finish-lynx timing system malfunctioned when displaying to the semaphore board for this event. The
judges reverted to the back-up iso-lynx timing system after confering with the Steward-In-Charge.

Race 6
SPORTSBET HT3

8:16 pm
600m

Grade 5 Heat

A pre–race sample was taken from Whitley Bale.

Redeemer Blue, Desired Path and Bern By were slow to begin.



Race 7
SPORTSBET BET WITH MATES FINAL

8:35 pm
525m

Grade 5 Final

Zulu Blast and Indiana Phones were slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from Aston Luciano – the winner of the event.

Indiana Phones (faltered turning out of the front straight and lost ground) underwent a post–race veterinary
examination and was found to have a right back muscle injury. A 60 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 8
GORSKI TIPPERS & TRAILERS

8:55 pm
730m

Mixed 4/5

Osprey Diva was slow to begin.

Trending Yale (tired over the concluding stages) underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was
found to have a right calf injury. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Dirt Farmer (checked and fell turning out of the back straight on the first occassion) underwent a post-race
veterinary examination and was found to have a spike wound to the right wrist, no stand down period
imposed.

Lakeview Patsy (checked by the fallen Dirt Farmer and continued to lose ground throughout the event)
underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was re-examined following race 10. Lakeview Patsy
was found to have a right shoulder and right hip injury. A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 9
VICTOOLSHOP.COM

9:17 pm
525m

Free For All

An out of competition sample was taken from Dark Label on 21st of September 2023 pursuant to GAR 139.

A pre–race sample was taken from Captain Larry.

The start was delayed by approximately one minute due to holding for Globe Derby Harness.

Race 10
HOUDINI BOY @ STUD

9:40 pm
525m

Grade 5

An out of competition sample was taken from Camp Fire on 21st of September 2023 pursuant to GAR 139.

Colin Bermingham was fined $50 for failing to ensure the registration card was produced for Ricky Bobby
Riot, pursuant to GAR 88.

My Bonneville was quick to begin. Camp Fire was slow to begin.

A post–race sample was taken from My Bonneville – the winner of the event.

Dr. Falkor (checked on the first turn) underwent a post–race veterinary examination and was found to have
a right back muscle injury. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
CITY VIEW BISTRO

9:55 pm
525m

Grade 5

Cheeky Wink was quick to begin.

Ninetymile Rose (turned head inwards entering the home straight) underwent a post-race veterinary
examination - no injury reported. Stewards spoke to representative Mr N. Rooney regarding the
greyhound’s racing manners entering the home straight. Acting under the provisions of GAR 124,
Ninetymile Rose was charged with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment. Mr. Rooney pleaded
guilty to the charge. Ninetymile Rose was suspended for 28 days at Meadows only and must perform a
satisfactory trial in accordance with GAR 127, and pursuant to GAR 132, before any future nomination will
be accepted.

Race 12
SPORTSBET WE LET THE DOGS OUT 

10:17 pm
525m

Grade 5

A pre–race sample was taken from Chapel Road.

Long Johnny and Scott Me were slow to begin.




