
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sale
Sunday, 12 Aug 2012

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
SALE SHOPFITTERS (GOBIS)

5:15 pm
650m

Maiden

Ava Matilda and There You Are were slow to begin. White Sugar and There You Are collided soon after the
start. Ronald, Hot Seat and Why Not Renae collided soon after the start. Have A Dip, Hot Seat, Ava Matilda
and There You Are collided on the first turn. Belron Bingle and Why Not Renae collided approaching the
home turn checking Belron Bingle. Belron Bingle and There You Are collided on the home turn. Have A Dip
and Why Not Renae collided entering the home straight. A sample was taken from Ronald - the winner of
the event.

Race 2
NODDY'S MENSWEAR (VICBRED) HT1

5:37 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Extra Special, Daintree Jade, Dr. Bunsen and Markev Boy were slow to begin. Daintree Jade, Dr. Bunsen
and Markev Boy collided soon after the start checking Markev Boy. Orlando Jay. Daintree Jade and Dr.
Bunsen collided on the first turn. Markev Boy galloped on Daintree Jade on the first turn checking both
greyhounds. Miss Alouette eased approaching the home turn checking Braemar Lass. Orlando Jay
checked off Braemar Lass on the home turn. Miss Alouette was vetted following the event. It was reported
that there was no apparent injury found. Trainer, Mr. K. Ward, declined his option to have the greyhound
revetted. Acting under GAR 69(1)(b) stewards charged Miss Alouette with failing to pursue the lure with
due commitment and suspended the greyhound for 28 days at Sale and directed that the greyhound
perform a Satisfactory Trial All Tracks, pursuant to GAR 69(2)(a) before any future nomination will be
accepted.

Race 3
BALEC ELECTRICAL (VICBRED) HT2

5:58 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Buckley Rose and Taabinga Dream were quick to begin. Seven Degrees was slow to begin. Siabod, Seven
Degrees and Talk's Cheeky collided soon after the start. Damaged Goods and Taabinga Dream collided on
the first turn checking Taabinga Dream and Siabod. Smurf's Zandra checked off Taabinga Dream
approaching the home turn.

Race 4
MORELLIS FURNITURE (VICBRED)

HT3
6:19 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

It's Kool Danny, Ultimate Refund and Miss Jenny were slow to begin. Lucy Dream was very slow to begin
(3 Lengths). Ultimatum, Smurf's Cool and Zeva Waters collided approaching the first turn checking Zeva
Waters. Smurf's Cool, It's Kool Danny and Ultimate Refund collided on the first turn checking Ultimate
Refund and Miss Jenny. Ultimate Refund, Lucy Dream and Zeva Waters collided approaching the home
turn checking Zeva Waters. Wild Conan and It's Kool Danny collided approaching the winning post.

Race 5
SALE MOTOR GROUP (1-4 WINS)

6:42 pm
650m

Restricted Win

Atropos was quick to begin. Dewana Summer was slow to begin. Dewana Summer and Paris Montana
collided soon after the start. Wicked Warlord and Spicy Bling collided approaching the first turn checking
Spicy Bling. Dewana Summer and Paris Montana collided on the first turn checking Paris Montana. Spicy
Bling checked off Paris Montana on the first turn. Atropos raced wide on the home turn and entering the
home straight. Spicy Bling, Five Star List and Dewana Summer collided several times in the home straight.

Race 6
ACTION OFFICE MACHINES

7:04 pm
440m

Free For All

Diesel Drive and Dr. Dufus were slow to begin. Explosive Milne was very slow to begin (3 Lengths). Dr.
Dufus galloped on Diesel Drive approaching the first turn. Cocky Boy, Kasundi and Liberty collided on the
first turn checking Kasundi and Liberty. Explosive Milne and Dr. Dufus collided on the first turn severely
checking both greyhounds. A sample was taken from Cocky Boy - the winner of the event.



Race 7
MEGASPORTS

7:24 pm
520m

Grade 5

Phantom Kahn and Walkaway True were slow to begin. Philism was very slow to begin (4 Lengths). Bonnie
Whelan and Blowin' Smoke collided in the back straight checking Blowin' Smoke. Walkaway True checked
off Blowin' Smoke approaching the second turn checking Philism. Paddy's Brooke and Bonnie Whelan
collided on the second turn severely checking Paddy's Brooke which stumbled checking Greysynd Rain.
Phantom Kahn checked off Paddy's Brooke approaching the home turn. Walkaway True checked off
Philism approaching the home turn checking Greysynd Rain. Greysynd Rain galloped on Walkaway True
entering the home straight. Phantom Kahn was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no
apparent injury found. A sample was taken from Sonny's Jet - the winner of the event.

Race 8
RODWELL & GALLAGHER (GOBIS)

7:49 pm
520m

Free For All

Launchinator, Worth Noting and Horror Fantasy were slow to begin. Launchinator and Gangbusters
collided approaching the first turn. Tom Tukan, Mr. Macquire and Beyond Brooklyn collided entering the
back straight checking Mr. Macquire. Mr. Macquire and Worth Noting collided on the second turn checking
Worth Noting severely checking Mr. Macquire. Mr. Macquire was vetted following the event. It was reported
that there was no apparent injury found. A sample was taken from Beyond Brooklyn - the winner of the
event.

Race 9
SALE AUTOMOTIVE (VICBRED) HT4

8:09 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Smurf's Senorita was quick to begin. Omega Joshua, No Brainer and Big Fast Fairy were slow to begin.
Smurf's Senorita, Cantankerous, Madame Patricia and Coonawarra collided on the first turn checking
Cantankerous, Madame Patricia and Coonawarra. Cantankerous, Madame Patricia and Coonawarra
collided approaching the home turn checking Coonawarra. Cantankerous and Madame Patricia collided
approaching the home turn and again on the home turn severely checking Cantankerous and
Coonawarra; Coonawarra raced wide as a result. Cantankerous was vetted following the event. It was
reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 10
CENTRA POWDER COATING

(VICBRED) HT5
8:34 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Laverne Lee and Flaming Waters were slow to begin. Laverne Lee galloped on Tango Man on the first turn
checking both greyhounds. Tango Man galloped on Flaming Waters approaching the home turn checking
Flaming Waters, Tango Man and Laverne Lee. Dr. Lynette raced wide on the home turn. Tango Man was
vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound was found to have soreness in the right hock,
a 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
BRING YOUR CLUB TO SALE

(VICBRED) HT6
8:57 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Dr. Wangdang and Sweet Galo were quick to begin. Elle's Hope was slow to begin. Koobla Kahn and Miss
Benbridge collided on the first turn checking Miss Benbridge. Miss Benbridge checked off Somma Storm
approaching the home turn. Elle's Hope and Somma Storm collided approaching the home turn. Miss
Benbridge and Sweet Galo raced wide on the home turn.




