
STEWARD'S REPORT

Traralgon
Tuesday, 03 Jan 2023

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S. Sutton

Stewards: M. Hayden-Evans, C. Berkhout & B. Martin

Judges: L. Schulze

Lure Drivers: T. Adamson

Starter: A. Andrews

Kennel Supervisor: M. Toner

Kennel Attendants: S. Nachorny, H. Lothinger & M. Mayle

Veterinarian: Dr. Sarah Doornbusch

Race 1
LV FORKLIFTS

2:18 pm
350m

Tier 3 - Maiden

We Push On – Underwent a kennelling veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. Late
scratching at 1:10pm due to weight variation (GAR 101). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Trainer
Mr. Guy Bartlett was fined $100.00.

Be Yourself was quick to begin. Senorita Cruz and Sky's Delight were slow to begin.

Be Yourself lost ground turning into the home straight, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and
was found to have a left back muscle injury. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Following the running of this event, Stewards were made aware of an incident in the catching pen shed
prior to the start of this event involving registered participants Ms Kate Gorman and Ms Kerry Minne. After
hearing submissions from Ms Gorman, Ms Minne, and several witnesses to the incident, Stewards imposed
the following penalties after considering all the available evidence:

Ms Kate Gorman - Pleaded guilty to a charge of GAR 165(a) in that she engaged in conduct that was
detrimental to the image of greyhound racing. Stewards imposed a penalty of $250.00.

Ms Kerry Minne - Pleaded not guilty to a charge of GAR 165(a) in that she engaged in conduct that was
detrimental to the image of greyhound racing. Stewards found Ms Minne guilty and imposed a penalty of
$250.00, with half suspended for a period of 12 months pending no similar offences or further breaches of
the relevant rule.

Race 2
CATCH THE THIEF @ STUD

2:39 pm
350m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Mt. View Hanna and Mt. View Bentley were slow to begin.

Mt. View Hanna lost ground turning off the back straight, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and
was found to have injuries to the pectineus and adductor muscles. A 10 day stand down period was
imposed.

Mt. View Bentley underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.
Stewards spoke to trainer Mr. Trevor Whitford regarding the racing manners of Mt. View Bentley on the
home turn. After hearing submissions from Mr. Whitford, viewing the available race footage and having
their own observations, Stewards took no further action.

Race 3
R & A PRECISION AUTOMOTIVE

3:00 pm
395m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Smooth Vixen and On The Cusp were quick to begin. Why Not Emily was slow to begin.

Peach Fan Tango contacted the inside running rail turning out of the back straight, underwent a post-race
veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Race 4
SINCLAIR CONTRACTING

3:18 pm
395m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

A pre-race sample was taken from Donald Lane.

Donald Lane, Taking A Toll and Flywheel Cracker were slow to begin.

Race 5
SPORTSBET GO THE BLUE DOG

3:41 pm
395m

Grade 5 T3

Mechanics Kismet was slow to begin.

A post-race sample was taken from Mechanics Kismet - the winner of the event.



Race 6
HOOKED ON SCOTCH @ STUD

4:02 pm
350m

Grade 5 T3

Travelling Sands – New declared weight of 29.4 kg, last raced at 28.1 kg. 

A pre-race sample was taken from Travelling Sands.

A post-race sample was taken from Clan McMillan - the winner of the event.

Race 7
MCMAHON BUILDERS

4:24 pm
395m

Grade 5 T3

A pre-race sample was taken from Style Key.

He's A Brute was quick to begin. Never Sweet, Why Not Jules and Under His Spell were slow to begin.

Style Key performed below market expectations, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was
found to have a right back muscle injury. A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 8
SPORTSBET GREEN TICKS

4:47 pm
350m

Grade 5 T3

Chilly Bin, Balmoral and Elswyk Shadow were slow to begin.

A post-race sample was taken from Next Teardrop - the winner of the event.

Race 9
HARD STYLE RICO @ STUD

5:07 pm
350m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Echo Chamber was quick to begin. Hurricane Daisy was slow to begin.

Golden Coast underwent a post-race veterinary examination at the trainer's request and was found to have
a papilloma on the left hindleg. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 10
ZACK MONELLI @ STUD (1-2 WINS)

5:32 pm
395m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

Catch The Outlaw – Late scratching at 13:42 on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 92) due to a
puncture wound at the base of the greyhound's ear. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Rev Up Chloe lost ground turning off the back straight, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and
was found to have injuries to the right deltoid muscle and right groin, as well as left-fore shin soreness. A
14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
FENECH CURTAINS AND BLINDS (2-3

WINS)
5:54 pm
350m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

My Mate Sid was quick to begin. Mt. View Bee was slow to begin.

My Mate Sid faltered and lost ground turning into the home straight, underwent a post-race veterinary
examination and was found to have injuries to the right deltoid and pectoral muscles, and an injury to the
left back muscle. A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

Satisfactory Trial Results:

Trial 1:

Xanadu – Marring/Blinkers On – Field of 4, Distance 395m, Weight 29.4kg, Box 1, Placed 1st, Time Run
22.162 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks except Hobart.

Scotch And Coke – Marring/Right-Side Blinker On – Field of 4, Distance 395m, Weight 33.5kg, Box 2,
Placed 3rd, Time Run 22.662 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks except The Meadows.

Magic Bee – Unsatisfactory Performance – Field of 4, Distance 395m, Weight 26.6kg, Box 5, Placed 4th,
Time Run 22.885 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks.

To watch this satisfactory trial, copy TRA TUE 03 JAN 23 ST1 into the search engine of YouTube.

Trial 2:

Mt. View Sublime – Failing to Pursue – Field of 4, Distance 350m, Weight 27.2kg, Box 4, Placed 3rd, Time
Run 20.766 – Comment: Cleared All Tracks except Warragul.

Tenerife – Unsatisfactory Performance – Field of 4, Distance 350m, Weight 26.5kg, Box 8, Placed 2nd, Time
Run 20.551 – Comment: Not Cleared (turned head and visibly eased).

To watch this satisfactory trial, copy TRA TUE 03 JAN 23 ST2 into the search engine of YouTube.




