
STEWARD'S REPORT

Shepparton
Thursday, 10 Mar 2022

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: T. Gibbins

Stewards: R. Fazulla, M. Bayliss & D. Barber

Judges: S. Colliver

Lure Drivers: S. Baldwin

Starter: S. Evans

Kennel Supervisor: S. Baker

Kennel Attendants: A. Groom, G. Glass & R. Glass

Veterinarian: Dr. Chad Baali

Race 1
FOLLOW @GRV_NEWS ON TWITTER

11:19 am
385m

Maiden

All persons attending today wore facemasks when required, checked in, observed social distance
requirements, and provided satisfactory evidence of double vaccination or exemption under the State
Government’s mandatory vaccination directions (as of 26 November 2021) that in-turn, permitted entry to
the venue.

Break Ranks – Late scratching at 10.44am on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to
kennel cough. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Placid Paws, Bank Heist, Halloumi and Elite Patty collided soon after the start checking Placid Paws,
Halloumi and Elite Patty. Placid Paws crossed to the outside approaching the first turn and collided with
Halloumi. Our Magic Miss and Spy Craft collided approaching the first turn. Our Magic Miss, Spy Craft and
Aston Director collided on the first turn severely checking Our Magic Miss which fell as a result. Bank Heist
turned its head outwards and collided with Aston Director in the home straight and again approaching the
winning post.

Bank Heist underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an injury to the left
triceps. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to representative, Jason Wickham
regarding the greyhounds racing manners in the home straight. Acting under the provisions of GAR 69B
(1), Bank Heist was charged with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of injury).  Mr
Wickham pleaded guilty to the charge, Bank Heist was found guilty and must perform a Satisfactory Trial  in
accordance with GAR 69B (1) and pursuant to GAR 72, before any future nomination will be accepted.

Our Magic Miss underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an injury to the right
triangle muscle. A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
ELITE COLLARS & LEADS

11:35 am
385m

Maiden

Mission Oasis – Late scratching at 10.42am on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to
kennel cough. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Heat Wave was quick to begin.

Aston Cassidy and Rollin' In It collided soon after the start. Keep It Classy faltered on the first turn and lost
ground. Aston Cassidy and Silver Valley collided on the first turn checking Aston Cassidy. Heat Wave and
Rollin' In It collided on the first turn checking Rollin' In It. Rollin' In It and Silver Valley collided approaching
the home turn. Sweet As Candy and Silver Valley collided approaching the home turn checking both
greyhounds. Sweet As Candy galloped on the heels of Silver Valley on the home turn checking both
greyhounds.

Race 3
BYERS ELECTRICAL

11:53 am
385m

Maiden

Mighty Thanos was very slow to begin (4 lengths).

What A Ride, Splash Of Light and Magic To Burn collided soon after the start checking Splash Of Light and
Magic To Burn. Splash Of Light and Magic To Burn collided approaching the first turn and again on the first
turn checking both greyhounds.

Dioptase underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a suspected fractured
humerous. A 28 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 4
CKH PAINTING

12:10 pm
450m

Maiden

Barooga Boy – New declared weight of 36.5kg, last raced at 35.1kg.

Diversify and Magic Ride were quick to begin.

Barooga Boy and Hi Ena collided soon after the start checking Hi Ena. Long Shadow and Brightly Staring
collided approaching the first turn checking Long Shadow. Hi Ena and Long Shadow collided on the first
turn checking both greyhounds. Barooga Boy and Magic Ride collided on the first turn checking Magic
Ride. Magic Ride and Panadero Warrior collided on the home turn checking Magic Ride.

A post-race sample was taken from Barooga Boy - the winner of the event.



Race 5
RACERS FUNCTION CENTRE

12:30 pm
450m

Grade 7

A pre-race sample was taken from Kraken Rita.

Deltora Quest was slow to begin.

Affair Beauty, My Believer and My Name's Lindy collided soon after the start checking Affair Beauty and My
Name's Lindy. Affair Fantasy and My Name's Judy collided approaching the first turn. Kraken Rita turned its
head outwards and visibly eased on the first turn checking Kraken Rita, Inside Out and My Believer. My
Name's Judy and My Believer collided approaching the home turn. Affair Fantasy and My Believer collided
in the home straight. Kraken Rita turned its head inwards and marred My Believer in the home straight and
again approaching the winning post checking Affair Fantasy, Kraken Rita and My Believer.

Kraken Rita underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an injury to the right
triceps. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to Mr Kevin Eyles, the trainer of Kraken
Rita regarding the greyhound’s racing manners on the first turn. Acting under the provisions of GAR
69A(1) Kraken Rita was charged with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment. Mr
Eyles pleaded guilty to the charge, Kraken Rita was found guilty and suspended for 28
days at Shepparton and must perform a Satisfactory Trial in accordance with GAR 69A (2) and pursuant to
GAR 72, before any future nomination will be accepted.

Race 6
TAB - LONG MAY WE PLAY

12:47 pm
450m

Grade 7

Dry Lightning – Late scratching at 10.46am on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to
kennel cough. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Rose Danae and Sartana were slow to begin.

Aston Oscar and Twilight Sofia collided soon after the start. Rose Danae and Aston Oscar collided
approaching the first turn checking Rose Danae. Aston Oscar and Flying Frank collided approaching the
home turn. Aston Oscar and Twilight Sofia collided in the home straight.

Race 7
RAW ABILITY @ STUD

1:04 pm
450m

Grade 6

 Mrs Julie Chilcott was fined $50 for failing to ensure the registration card was produced for the greyhound,
Chillout Cookie pursuant to GAR 33.

It was noted that the muzzle of Hillbilly Lass became dislodged during the running of the event.

Extravagance and Beastly Boy collided soon after the start checking both greyhounds. Hillbilly Lass,
Chillout Cookie and Rare Sapphire collided soon after the start checking Chillout Cookie and Rare
Sapphire. Chillout Cookie, Rare Sapphire and Extravagance collided approaching the first turn checking
Rare Sapphire. Chillout Cookie galloped on the heels of Extravagance on the first turn checking both
greyhounds. Hillbilly Lass and Twilight Harry collided on the first turn and again approaching the home turn
checking both greyhounds. Hillbilly Lass and Twilight Harry collided in the home straight. Chillout Cookie
raced wide in the home straight.

Race 8
SHEPPARTON WORKWEAR & SAFETY

1:22 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Slingshot Zoe.

Wharfie and Slingshot Zoe were slow to begin.

Axedale Pirate and Perfect Flossy collided soon after the start checking Perfect Flossy. Nangar Troy and
Two Up Tommy collided soon after the start checking both greyhounds. Wharfie, Perfect Flossy and Emma's
Image collided on the first turn checking Two Up Tommy and Wharfie.

Race 9
GIPP'S SHIPPING CONTAINERS

1:47 pm
385m

Grade 7

Carajillo – New declared weight of 36.5kg, last raced at 35.1kg.

Magic Murray and Ria collided approaching the first turn. Chuck Attack, Magic Murray and Ria collided on
the first turn checking Magic Murray and Ria. Magic Murray and Ria collided several times approaching the
home turn checking Ria.

A post-race sample was taken from Carajillo - the winner of the event.

Race 10
HONE IN @ STUD

2:07 pm
385m

Mixed 6/7

Unassuming, Mid Point, Without Reason and It's Coming Home collided soon after the start checking Mid
Point and It's Coming Home. Unassuming and It's Coming Home collided approaching the first turn
checking It's Coming Home. Unassuming and Without Reason collided on the first turn checking Tuscan
Style and It's Coming Home severely checking Unassuming. Unassuming and It's Coming Home collided
entering the home straight.

It's Coming Home underwent a post-race veterinary examination at the trainers request and was found to
have a fractured toe on the left hind paw. A 28 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
WHISKEY RIOT @ STUD

2:22 pm
385m

Grade 6

A pre-race sample was taken from Over Slips.

Over Slips and Aston Arena were quick to begin.

Oriental Onyx, Easy Breezy and Aston Arena collided approaching the first turn checking Easy Breezy and
Aston Arena. Easy Breezy, Sheriff Demon, Gunai Girl and Engaging collided on the first turn checking Easy
Breezy, Sheriff Demon and Engaging. Easy Breezy, Sheriff Demon and Engaging collided approaching the
home turn checking Easy Breezy and Sheriff Demon, severely checking Engaging. Aston Arena and Gunai
Girl collided approaching the home turn. Easy Breezy and Sheriff Demon collided approaching the home
turn. Easy Breezy and Sheriff Demon raced wide on the home turn and again in the home straight.



Race 12
HARD STYLE RICO @ STUD

2:49 pm
385m

Grade 6

A pre-race sample was taken from Hasten Jet.

Stylish Ken was quick to begin.

King Chad, Hasten Jet and Jagger's Lady collided soon after the start. Radiant Betty, King Chad, Hasten
Jet and Shania's Dream collided on the first turn checking all four greyhounds. King Chad and Hasten Jet
collided approaching the home turn checking both greyhounds.

Meeting Comments:

All Inn Toffee – FTC (Injury) - Field of 4, Distance 385m, Weight 28.1kg, Box 1, Placed 2nd, Time Run
22.524 - Comment: Cleared All Tracks.

Pandora's Hope – Unsatisfactory Performance - Field of 4, Distance 385m, Weight 27.6kg, Box 5, Placed
4th Time Run 22.702 - Comment: Cleared All Tracks.

Tumbarumba Time – Marring/Blinkers On - Field of 4, Distance 385m, Weight 32.3kg, Box 6, Placed 1st
Time Run 22.517 - Comment: Not Cleared, eased in the home straight.

To watch this Satisfactory Trial, copy SHP THU 10 MAR 22 ST1 into the search engine of YouTube.




