
STEWARD'S REPORT

Traralgon
Saturday, 15 Jan 2022

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Kitching

Stewards: A. Spence, R. Berkhout, C. Berkhout & P. Inger

Judges: J. Alsop & N. Anderson

Lure Drivers: S. Courts

Starter: L. Sullivan

Kennel Supervisor: S. Wellings

Kennel Attendants: B. Toner, C. Moran & K. Thorburn

Veterinarian: Dr Joe Waldron

Race 1
WELCOME BACK TO TRARALGON 

6:07 pm
395m

Maiden

All persons attending today undertook successful health screenings, wore facemasks, checked in,
observed social distance requirements, and provided satisfactory evidence of double vaccination or
exemption under the State Government’s mandatory vaccination directions (as of 26 November 2021) that
in-turn, permitted entry to the venue.

Poppy Choppy - New declared weight of 30.5kgs, last raced at 31.8kgs.

Victory Boy was slow to begin.

Orange Ruffy and Marlee Mikado collided soon after the start checking both greyhounds.  Poppy Choppy
checked off Audacious Stell at the 200m.  Orange Ruffy faltered and shifted outwards approaching the
winning post.  Victory Boy raced wide for most of the event.

Race 2
RUTTER'S BUTCHERY & POULTRY

HT1
6:27 pm
395m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

Ms. Kate Gorman was fined $50 for failing to ensure the registration card was produced for the greyhound
Minoli Magic pursuant to GAR 33.

Mt. View Buck and Get Sushi Carol were slow to begin.

Slim Shadow, Mikado Set and Mystical Zendik collided soon after the start checking Mikado Set and
Mystical Zendik.  Get Sushi Carol clipped the heels of Slim Shadow at the 200m checking Slim Shadow,
Mikado Set and Get Sushi Carol causing Slim Shadow and Mikado Set to race wide.

A post-race sample was taken from Minoli Magic - the winner of the event.

Race 3
BRIDGES ON ARGYLE TRARALGON

HT2
6:52 pm
395m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

A pre-race sample was taken from Deadly Redeemer.

Night Patrol was slow to begin.

Invictus Xavier checked off Annabelle Rocks approaching the 200m, checking Tail's Up.  Annabelle Rocks
and Redgum Flyer collided on the home turn.  Armatree Arrow and Night Patrol collided in the front
straight.

Race 4
R & A PRECISION AUTOMOTIVE HT3

7:11 pm
395m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

Elswyk Shadow - New declared weight of 35.5kgs, last raced at 34.4kgs.

Establishment and Shen Bree Rose were slow to begin.

Gotham Diva faltered soon after the start and lost ground.  Aston Foxtrot, Audacious Flame and Elswyk
Shadow collided approaching the 200m.  Aston Foxtrot and Elswyk Shadow collided at the 150m checking
both greyhounds.  Shen Bree Rose crossed inwards approaching the winning post checking Sweet Life
and Fat Cracker.

Race 5
MCMAHON BUILDERS

7:36 pm
395m

Grade 5

Zimmer Bale, Zeeba's Legacy and Mr. Neo, and Rocks Got Talent, Maxwell and Ivy Isobel collided soon
after the start.  Silver Brute checked off Hill Top Jonah approaching the 200m.  Zimmer Bale shifted
outwards at the 150m checking Zeeba's Legacy.  Mr. Neo checked off Silver Brute in the front straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Ivy Isobel - the winner of the event.

Race 6
FENECH CURTAINS & BLINDS

Got The Torque and Ferdinand Boy were slow to begin.



7:51 pm
395m

Special Event

Massimo and Lots Of Chatter collided soon after the start.  Do Good Davlin checked off Freya Bale
approaching the 300m.  Freya Bale checked off Mr. Fix It at the 250m causing Freya Bale to lose ground
checking Lots Of Chatter.  Got The Torque checked off Mr. Fix It at the 150m.

Race 7
ECOMIST GIPPSLAND

8:14 pm
500m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Zipping Hunter.

Zipping Hunter was slow to begin.

Defensible, Galloping Speed and She Wiggles collided soon after the start.  Aston Matrice and Cashton
Bale collided approaching the 200m, checking Aston Matrice and Galloping Speed, causing Galloping
Speed to race wide.  Defensible checked off Samps De Keats leaving the 150m.

A post-race sample was taken from Mystify Kick - the winner of the event.

Race 8
DOWNLOAD THE NEW WATCHDOG

APP
8:35 pm
500m

Mixed 4/5

Hendrik Bale was slow to begin.

Paua Of Oscar, Fernando Mick and Smooth Talker collided soon after the start.  Hendrik Bale and
Sovereign Wind collided in the front straight.

Race 9
LV FORKLIFTS

8:56 pm
395m

Grade 5

Emma Banjo underwent a pre-race veterinary examination at the trainer's request and was passed fit to
race.

Bourne Burner and Gold Skulltula were slow to begin.

Luca's Jebrynah checked off Emma Banjo at the 300m causing Two Phones to contact the running rail and
lose ground.  Luca's Jebrynah checked off Bourne Burner leaving the 250m.  Bourne Burner, Dr. Ryker and
Mepunga Knight collided passing the winning post.

Two Phones underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a mild webbing
abrasion to the right hind leg.  A 3 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Gold Skulltula - the winner of the event.

Race 10
SINCLAIR CONTRACTING

9:15 pm
395m

Grade 5

Sinful Sid was quick to begin.

Audacious Leila and Impending collided approaching the 250m.  Gotham Duke and She's So Lovable
collided approaching the home turn.

Race 11
HOOKED ON SCOTCH AT STUD

9:39 pm
395m

Grade 5

Enabler was slow to begin.

Hot Shaynna and Fab Rocket collided at the 250m checking Hot Shaynna.  Hurricane Keely and Enabler
collided at the 250m.  Mt. View Audrey and Matilda Flyer collided at the 150m checking Matilda Flyer. 
Locked And Ready galloped on Matilda Flyer approaching the home turn.  Hurricane Keely and Enabler
collided on the home turn checking both greyhounds.

Race 12
CATCH THE THIEF AT STUD

9:57 pm
395m

Grade 5

Our Dreamer was quick to begin.  Almapa Sunshine was slow to begin.

Call Me Harvey and Speed Demon collided at 300m checking Speed Demon.  Cool Stone, Maverick
Nacho and How High Austin collided approaching 200m checking all three greyhounds.  Maverick Nacho
galloped on Colonel Diesel approaching the home turn severely checking Colonel Diesel, Maverick Nacho
and How High Austin.

Call Me Harvey underwent a post-race veterinary examination at the trainer’s request and was found to
have a laceration to left foreleg.  A 21 day stand down period was imposed.




