
STEWARD'S REPORT

Warragul
Tuesday, 31 Aug 2021

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: C. Berkhout

Stewards: I. Kennedy, C. Scarlett, P. Inger & J. Goldenberg

Judges: R. Berkhout

Lure Drivers: A. Inger

Starter: H. Miller

Kennel Supervisor: S. Wellings

Kennel Attendants: R. Lott & M. Virtue

Veterinarian: Dr. Steven Karamatic

Race 1
SUPPORT YOUR LOCAL BUSINESSES

6:45 pm
400m

Maiden

Essential persons (both staff & participants) attending today, undertook successful health screenings, wore
facemasks, observed social distance requirements, and adhered to room density quotients that in-turn,
permitted entry to the venue for exclusive race-day functions and operations.

Vindicated and Blazin’ Lass were quick to begin.  Yield was slow to begin.  Juliette and Intrepid Cruiser
collided approaching the first turn.  Fleet Feet Pete, Juliette and Intrepid Cruiser collided on the first turn
checking Juliette.  Dundee Silk galloped on Intrepid Cruiser on the first turn severely checking both
greyhounds; Intrepid Cruiser faltered as a result and subsequently pulled up. Fleet Feet Pete and Blazin’
Lass collided entering the home straight.

Intrepid Cruiser underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a right shoulder
injury.  A 28 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
AUSTRALIAN QUALITY PET FOODS

7:05 pm
400m

Mixed 6/7

Just One Moment and Starlight Tyson were quick to begin.  Black Beaver was slow to begin. Starlight Tyson
and Mr. Neat collided approaching the first turn and again on the first turn.  Oseye Bale and Starlight Tyson
collided on the first turn.  Oseye Bale and Mr. Neat collided entering the home straight.  Black Beaver
galloped on Mr. Neat entering the home straight checking Mr. Neat.

Mr. Neat underwent a post race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Race 3
KHANS HOSPITALITY SERVICES

7:25 pm
400m

Grade 5

Bag Secured – Late scratching at 11:04am when trainer, Mr Brayden Klemke reported the greyhound to
have an illness (GAR 23).  A 10 day stand down period was imposed.  Stewards will require a veterinary
certificate pursuant to GAR 20(3)(v) before any future nomination will be accepted. 

Hacker was slow to begin.  Moody Girl, Mania and Hacker collided on the first turn severely checking
Moody Girl.  Bigsy, Two Face and She’s Our Rocket collided on the first turn checking Two Face. Moody Girl
and Two Face collided entering the home straight.  Bigsy and Cheri Clownfish collided in the home
straight.

Race 4
TAB.COM.AU (3-6 WINS) HT1

7:45 pm
460m

Restricted Win Heat

Golden Skyrocket was quick to begin.  Callum’s Capers was slow to begin.  Peponi Bale and Willow Ash
collided soon after the start.  Invictus Jaxson and Peponi Bale collided approaching the first turn checking
Peponi Bale.  Peponi Bale and Golden Skyrocket collided entering the home straight checking Golden
Skyrocket.  Peponi Bale and Willow Ash collided in the home straight.  Golden Skyrocket, Get A Job and
Callum’s Capers raced wide in the home straight.

A post race sample was taken from Invictus Jaxson - winner of the event.

Race 5
TOP RUN IMAGES (3-6 WINS) HT2

8:05 pm
460m

Restricted Win Heat

Avery and Real Reward were quick to begin.  Simon Says galloped on Avery on the home turn checking
Simon Says which collided with Killashandra, severely checking Simon Says.  Avery and Real Reward
collided in the home straight checking Real Reward.  Aston Amigo and Real Reward collided approaching
the winning post checking Avery and Real Reward,

A post race sample was taken from Aston Amigo - winner of the event.

Race 6
BLUE STREAM PICTURES

8:25 pm
460m

Mixed 4/5

Rocket Boy was quick to begin.  Charango was slow to begin.  Kingy Lights, Clean Slate and Nera Enough
collided approaching the first turn checking Clean Slate and Nera Enough.  Zipping Hamish brushed the
running rail approaching the first turn checking Zipping Hamish.  Kingy Lights and Nera Enough collided
approaching the first turn.  Clean Slate shifted out on the home turn causing Charango to race wide.



Race 7
THE OAKS FUNCTION CENTRE

8:45 pm
400m

Mixed 4/5

Tan Star was quick to begin.  Elliott Ness was slow to begin.  Jen Jumbo Prawn clipped the heels of Tan
Star approaching the first turn.  Fernandes, Mr. Bob and Fantastic Raven collided approaching the first turn
checking Mr. Bob.  Jen Jumbo Prawn was checked off Rizzo on the first turn checking Jen Jumbo Prawn
and Elliott Ness.  Rizzo galloped on Tan Star on the first turn.  Tan Star and Mr. Bob collided on the home
turn.  Rizzo and Mr. Bob collided entering the home straight checking Mr. Bob.  Fernandes and Fantastic
Raven raced wide entering the home straight.

A post race sample was taken from Fernandes - winner of the event.

Race 8
THE BARN BAR

9:05 pm
400m

Free For All

My Faith – Late scratching at 10.27am when trainer, Mr Brett Mackie reported the greyhound to have injury
(GAR 23). A 10 day stand down period was imposed.  Stewards will require a veterinary certificate
pursuant to GAR 20(3)(v) before any future nomination will be accepted. 

Coolant and Dr. Archer collided approaching the first turn.  Top Faith, Fortuna Bale and Throw Caution
collided approaching the first turn checking Fortuna Bale and Throw Caution. 

A post race sample was taken from Fernando Bluey - winner of the event.

Race 9
PAUA KENNELS (3-6 WINS) HT3

9:29 pm
460m

Restricted Win Heat

Loz’s Bling was slow to begin.  Loz’s Bling crossed in in the home straight.   Howdy Slim and Rose’s
Honey collided approaching the winning post.

Revolution underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a spike wound to the right
hock.  A 3 day stand down period was imposed.

Loz’s Bling underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a right wrist injury.  A 60
day stand down period was imposed.

Race 10
ADOPT A GREYHOUND WITH GAP

9:50 pm
400m

Grade 5

Bearing Gold – Late scratching at 2.49pm when trainer, Mr Christoper Watson reported the greyhound to
have an illness (GAR 23).  A 10 day stand down period was imposed.  Stewards will require a veterinary
certificate pursuant to GAR 20(3)(v) before any future nomination will be accepted. 

Mr Peter Martinovic failed to appear at the kennels by the appointed time to retrieve and prepare
Drakensberg Dot for racing.  A warning was issued pursuant to GAR 46 (2).

Chilly Bin was slow to begin.  Bon Yogi crossed to the rails on the first turn causing Drakensberg Dot to
gallop on Bon Yogi, checking both greyhounds. Beers On Brody was checked off Drakensberg Dot on the
first turn causing Beers On Brody, Chilly Bin and  Extreme Harriet to collide checking Beers On Brody and
Extreme Harriet.  Cha Cha Again and Chilly Bin collided approaching the home turn and again on the
home turn.  Bon Yogi and Extreme Harriet collided in the home straight checking Bon Yogi.  Bon Yogi and
Beers On Brody collided approaching the winning post.

Bon Yogi underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have an abrasion on the right
hind leg.  No stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
FIND US ON FACEBOOK (275+ RANK)

10:07 pm
400m

Grade 5 No Penalty

A pre-race sample was taken from Red Sunset.

Chebika Oasis and Pat My Lass were quick to begin.  Shazbot and Take A Sunflower collided soon after
the start.  Chebika Oasis and Little Nellie collided on the first turn checking Little Nellie.  Get Around Me,
Little Nellie, Cyber Crime and Shazbot collided approaching the home turn checking Little Nellie and Get
Around Me.  Get Around Me and Red Sunset collided approaching the home turn.  Chebika Oasis and
Cyber Crime collided on the home turn checking both greyhounds.

Race 12
SENNACHIE AT STUD (275+ RANK)

10:26 pm
400m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Migration was quick to begin.  Shifty and Grumpy Al collided soon after the start and again approaching the
first turn.  Shifting Sands faltered on the first turn and subsequently tailed off.  Shifty and Grand Mac
collided on the first turn.  Grand Mac clipped the heels of Just Burning approaching the home turn.  Grand
Mac and Take A Daisy collided on the home turn.  Grumpy Al and Shifty collided in the home straight.

Shifting Sands underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have an injured right
triangle muscle.  A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

MEETING COMMENTS: 

Stewards conducted a check of the catcher‘s licences in accordance with LRR 16.2 and all were compliant.




