
STEWARD'S REPORT

Warragul
Friday, 17 Apr 2020

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: M. Lowe

Stewards: H. Harvey, I. Kennedy & R. Berkhout

Judges: P. Tabone

Lure Drivers: J. Barlow

Starter: C. Barnes

Kennel Supervisor: S. Wellings

Kennel Attendants: M. Virtue & R. Lott

Veterinarian: Dr. Steven Karamatic

Race 1
EVERY RACE LIVE ON THE

WATCHDOG APP
6:51 pm
400m

Maiden

Due to Government Social Distancing Laws under COVID-19 and acting in accordance with GAR 51 (10),
the Stewards have directed that the boxing process in Victoria will revert to and continue under the 4-wave
model being 1 & 5 boxed first, followed by 3 & 7, followed by 2 & 6, followed by 4 & 8.  Handlers are
required to exit the area after boxing and maintain their 1.5m distance from other handlers and staff, at all
times.

All persons (both Staff & Participants) attending today, undertook successful health screenings that in-turn,
permitted entry to the venue for exclusive race-day functions and operations.

A pre-race sample was taken from - Fenway Lights.

Fenway Lights was quick to begin.  It Just Is was very slow to begin (3 lengths).  Sassy Keats and Weeona
Polly collided soon after the start.  Pando Patrol was checked off Cherokee Chic on the first turn causing
both greyhounds to contact the running rail.  It Just Is contacted the running rail on the first turn.  Sassy
Keats raced wide on the first turn checking Weeona Polly.  Cherokee Chic was checked off Weeona Polly
approaching the home turn.  Cherokee Chic raced wide approaching the home turn, on the home turn and
in the home straight.

Stewards spoke to Mr. C. Dalton the representative for Cherokee Chic and issued a warning regarding the
greyhound's racing manners on the home turn.

Stewards spoke to Mr. C. Dalton the representative for It Just Is and issued a warning regarding the
greyhound's racing manners on the home turn.

Race 2
WWR SAWDUST (0-1 WIN)

7:12 pm
460m

Restricted Win

Prince Archer was a late scratching at 6.28pm due to non-arrival (GAR 31).  A 28 day stand down period
was imposed.

A pre-race sample was taken from - Incognito.

Stormy Blue faltered on the first turn and lost ground as a result.  Stormy Blue and Leo's My Champ raced
wide in the home straight.

Stormy Blue underwent a post race veterinary examination and was re-examined following race 4. Stormy
Blue was found to have an injured left flexor tendon and left monkey muscle.  A 14 day stand down period
was imposed.

Race 3
AUSTRALIAN QUALITY PET FOODS

7:34 pm
400m

Mixed 6/7

A pre-race sample was taken from - Bubba Jo.

Bubba Jo was quick to begin.  Elsa Rose and Rumour File collided approaching the first turn. Panda Rose,
Biggest Star and Elsa Rose collided on the first turn checking Panda Rose, Biggest Star, Elsa Rose,
Yanderra Rip and Rumour File.  Panda Rose and Yanderra Rip collided approaching the home turn.
 Paula Of Jewels and Blazing Strings collided on the home turn. Rumour File was checked off Bubba Jo in
the home straight.  Blazing Strings raced wide in the home straight.

Race 4
TOP CAT VIDEO (1-3 WINS)

(275+RANK)
7:53 pm
400m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from Heidi Intention.

Awesome Arby and Whistlin Missile were slow to begin.  Heidi Intention crossed in approaching the first
turn checking Chill Out Dusty and Beers On Brody.  Chill Out Dusty was checked off Heidi Intention on the
first turn,  Whistlin Missile raced wide approaching the home turn and on the home turn.  Heidi Intention
galloped on Chill Out Dusty entering the home straight severely checking Heidi Intention.

Race 5
OAKS AT LOGAN PARK (1-3 WINS)

A pre-race sample was taken from It's A Shadow.

Rapid Response crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Falcon Heavy, Loz's Bling, Black Panda



8:14 pm
460m

Restricted Win

and It's A Shadow.  It's A Shadow and Black Panda collided approaching the first turn.  Falcon Heavy and
Mombasa collided approaching the first turn checking Falcon Heavy.  Falcon Heavy and It's A Shadow
collided on the home turn.  Our Blue Spolly and Loz's Bling collided in the home straight.

Race 6
EAST IVANHOE GROCERS

8:34 pm
400m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Why Not Colby.

Why Not Colby, Braydon Lennox and Leo Rose collided soon after the start.  Mia's Hand, Cloncurry Girl
and Hurricane Red collided approaching the first turn checking Cloncurry Girl, Hurricane Red and
Reichman.  Reichman and Cloncurry Girl collided approaching the home turn and again on the home turn.
 Hurricane Red, Reichman and Cloncurry Girl raced wide in the home straight.  Why Not Colby was
checked off Shakalaka approaching the winning post.

Race 7
BLUE STREAM PICTURES

8:54 pm
400m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Sole Elusion.

Ninetymile Hawk and Dundee Ace were slow to begin.  Justin Rose and Ninetymile Hawk collided
approaching the first turn.  Justin Rose and Dundee Ace collided on the home turn.  Ninetymile Hawk
raced wide on the home turn.  Minter Zoom and Mighty Matilda collided on the home turn.  Blair Bale and
Sole Elusion collided approaching the winning post.

Race 8
GREYHOUND CLUBS VICTORIA

9:12 pm
460m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Zipping Wade.

Spotted Panther was quick to begin.  Nera Enough was slow to begin.  Handsome and Parabellum
collided soon after the start.  Spotted Panther, Handsome and Rock Me Gorgeous collided on the first turn
checking Spotted Panther and Rock Me Gorgeous.  Nera Enough and Parabellum collided on the first turn.
 Zipping Wade raced wide on the first turn.  Nera Enough and Zipping Wade collided several times from
approaching the home turn to the home and raced wide.  Mahjong Nickel and Zipping Wade raced wide in
the home straight.

Mahjong Nickel - proved difficult to box and will be boxed first in future events in accordance with GAR 52.

Race 9
GREYHOUND RACING FORMULA

9:34 pm
400m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Typhoon Tessie.

Rouge and Typhoon Tessie collided on the first turn. Welsly Bale and Rock Me David collided on the first
turn.

Race 10
PAUA RACING KENNELS (1-3 WINS)

(275+RNK)
9:54 pm
400m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from - Ragin' Force. 

Teardrop was checked off Phoenix Drive soon after the start.  Phoenix Drive, Symbol For You, Rock Me
Lloyd and Mac's Secret collided soon after the start.  Phoenix Drive and Mac's Secret collided on the first
turn checking Phoenix Drive.  Rock Me Lloyd and Ragin' Force collided on the first turn checking Rock Me
Lloyd and severely checking Ragin' Force which fell as a result.  Phoenix Drive was checked off No
Standing in the home straight.

Ragin' Force underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a fractured left
radius/ulna.  A 90 day stand down period was imposed.

Mac's Secret underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a laceration just above
the webbing on the left front foot.  A10 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
TAB - LONG MAY WE PLAY

10:14 pm
400m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Spolly Bear.

Thandie Bale and She's An Earn were quick to begin.  Woolybully Keats and Spolly Bear collided soon
after the start.  Star Night, Muza's Angel and Usain Spolly collided on the first turn checking Usain Spolly
and Woolybully Keats.  Star Night galloped on She's An Earn approaching the home turn checking both
greyhounds.  Usain Spolly, Woolybully Keats and Spolly Bear collided approaching the home turn.  Usain
Spolly and Woolybully Keats collided in the home straight.

Race 12
TOP RUN IMAGES (275+RANK)

10:35 pm
460m

Grade 5 No Penalty

A pre-race sample was taken from Kiowa Kaema

Sally's Pride was slow to begin.  Xalynn Bale and Kiowa Kaema collided soon after the start.  Sally's Pride
raced wide soon after the start and approaching the first turn.  Run Like Rhys and Kiowa Kaema collided
on the first turn.  Run Like Rhys was checked off Jugungal Black approaching the home turn checking
Kiowa Kaema.  Run Like Rhys and Light The Track collided on the home turn. Sally's Pride raced wide on
the home turn and in the home straight.

Kiowa Kaema underwent a post race veterinary examination and was found to have a split webbing on the
left front foot and a fractured left metacarpal.  A 60 day stand down period was imposed.






