
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 02 Apr 2014

Weather conditions: OVERCAST

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: J.REA

Stewards: B.BLOOD, M.BLOOD

Judges: B.LOUDON/I. BENNETT

Lure Drivers: R.PHILLIPS

Starter: D.KEIRL

Kennel Supervisor: G.WHITE

Kennel Attendants: C.HON

Veterinarian: DR. R.PAGE

Race 1
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT1

6:57 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Toy Princess and Bovelo were slow to begin.

Broden Rain and Leisure Larry collided soon after the start. Presto Destini and Leisure Larry collided
approaching the first turn. Bourbon Club and Dr. Nibette collided approaching the first turn. Presto Destini,
Toy Princess and Bovelo collided approaching the first turn checking Bovelo. Presto Destini checked off
Leisure Larry on the first turn.

Race 2
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT2

7:18 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Boolite Bruiser and Deadly Asset were slow to begin.

Super Dot crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Play A Kazoo, Deadly Asset and Boolite Bruiser.
Boolite Bruiser and Super Dot collided approaching the first turn checking Super Dot. Boolite Bruiser, Punk
Star Lass and Miss Hombre collided approaching the first turn checking Boolite Bruiser and Super Dot.
Boolite Bruiser, Miss Hombre, Blistering Bob and Play A Kazoo collided approaching the home turn
checking Boolite Bruiser, Miss Hombre and Deadly Asset. Miss Hombre and Super Dot collided entering
the home straight checking Miss Hombre.

Miss Hombre was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left thigh. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Super Dot was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Race 3
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT3

7:38 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Jasper Attack and Rocky Toy were slow to begin. Why Not Jetta went up with the lids at box rise and was
slow to begin.

La Trobe Lass crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Dynamo's Lady. Rocky Toy checked off
Kimberly Prince approaching the first turn. Jasper Attack, Dynamo's Lady and Rocky Toy collided several
times approaching the first turn checking Jasper Attack and severely checking Dynamo's Lady. La Trobe
Lass brushed the running rail approaching the first turn. Rocky Toy contacted the running rail approaching
first turn. La Trobe Lass checked off Kimberly Prince approaching the first turn. Rocky Toy contacted the
running rail on the first turn causing the greyhound to lose considerable ground as a result. La Trobe Lass
checked off Kimberly Prince on the first turn. Dynamo's Lady and Rocky Toy collided approaching the home
turn. Kimberly Prince checked off Why Not Jetta approaching the home turn checking La Trobe Lass.
Jasper Attack and Dee Runk collided approaching the winning post.

Rocky Toy was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained lacerations to the
left stifle and the left wrist. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 4
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT4

7:58 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Ricky Fields, Ligety, Lady Toy and Filo's Danger collided soon after the start checking Lady Toy. Ricky
Fields, Ligety and Filo's Danger collided approaching the first turn. Filo's Danger checked off Ricky Fields
approaching the first turn. Ligety checked off Just A Taste on the first turn checking Smouldering Ice. Lady
Toy checked off Just A Taste approaching the home turn checking Just A Taste. Filo's Danger crossed to the
rail in the home straight checking Filo's Danger and Smouldering Ice. Just A Taste, Cruisy's Joy and Ligety
collided approaching the winning post checking Cruisy's Joy and Ligety.

Race 5
CATERING ALLSORTS

8:18 pm
450m

Grade 5

He's Schmick and Forget The Past was slow to begin.

Bang Bang Gal checked off Blue Viper soon after the start. Forget The Past checked off Blue Viper soon
after the start. Takos Princess checked off Coopnarcha approaching the first turn. He's Schmick checked off
Blue Viper approaching the first turn checking Forget The Past. He's Schmick and Forget The Past collided
on the first turn checking He's Schmick. Takos Princess and Blue Viper collided on the first turn checking
Takos Princess. Blue Viper and Cafe Dior collided on the home turn.

A sample was taken from Senor Socks - winner of the event.



Race 6
MIDLAND IRRIGATION

8:41 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

National Time and Lively Laddie were slow to begin.

National Time, Special Jim and Texan collided approaching the first turn checking Special Jim. Texan and
Check My Swagger collided approaching the first turn checking Texan. Crazy Talk crossed to the rail on the
first turn severely checking Special Jim and Texan. Lively Laddie raced wide entering the home straight.
Lively Laddie and Special Jim collided approaching the winning post.

Texan was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

A sample was taken from National Time - winner of the event.

Race 7
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT5

8:58 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Ottantotto was quick to begin.

Wings To Fly, Shanlyn Patch and Ice Toronado collided soon after the start checking Shanlyn Patch. Ice
Toronado checked off Lara's Gem on the first turn. Vapour Patch checked off Hot Millions approaching the
home turn. Vapor Patch and Ice Toronado collided on the home turn. Vapour Patch and Wings To Fly
collided entering the home straight checking Wings To Fly.

Ottantotto which lead the field before cramping in the home straight and finishing last was vetted following
the event. It was reported that the greyhound cramped in the right hind leg. A 5 day stand down period was
imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mr. David Todd, the handler of the greyhound Ottantotto. Acting in accordance with GAR
71 (Cramp), Stewards directed that the greyhound must perform a Satisfactory Trial before any future
nomination will be accepted.

 

Race 8
TOPCAT VIDEO (BITCHES) FINAL

9:18 pm
450m

S/E Final

Stutter, Altena Bale and Pippa Shiraz collided soon after the start checking Altena Bale. Pippa Shiraz
checked off Stutter approaching the first turn. Stutter and Rozehill Sanya collided approaching the home
turn. You Say Goodbye galloped on the heels of Magic Diva approaching the home turn checking both
greyhounds. Rozehill Sanya checked off Magic Diva in the home straight. You Say Goodbye and Rozehill
Sanya collided approaching the winning post.

Race 9
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT6

9:41 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

In Canada was slow to begin.

Shanty Town Lad, Dynamo's Dove and Phoebe's Thunder collided soon after the start checking Dynamo's
Dove. Ice Flicka, Senni John, Shanty Town Lad and Phoebe's Thunder collided approaching the first turn.
Dynamo's Dove and In Canada collided on the first turn checking In Canada and causing Dynamo's Dove
to falter and tail off. Ice Flicka and Phoebe's Thunder collided approaching the home turn.

Dynamo's Dove was vetted following the event and revetted following race 12. It was reported that the
greyhound sustained an injury to the left foreleg. A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 10
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT7

9:58 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Claretown Bart and Pearl Magic were slow to begin.

Major Missile and Destini Diamond collided soon after the start severely checking Major Missile. Destini
Diamond checked off Ima Screw Loose approaching the first turn. Pedro's Opal and Ima Screw Loose
collided on the first turn. Destini Diamond and Ima Screw Loose raced wide in the home straight.

Major Missile was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Race 11
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT8

10:18 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Quirinus Quirrel checked off Ima Pearl approaching the first turn checking Trip The Switch and severely
checking Golden Girl Anna. Trip The Switch checked off Ice Gold Bundy on the first turn checking Golden
Girl Anna. Trip The Switch and Starlight Ruby collided approaching the home turn checking Trip The
Switch. Ice Cold Bundy faltered in the home straight.

Trip The Switch was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
the left monkey muscle. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Golden Girl Anna was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Ice Cold Bundy was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury. Handler,
Mr. Paul Hammerstein declined the option to have the greyhound revetted.

Stewards spoke to Mr. Paul Hammerstein, the handler of the greyhound Ice Cold Bundy. Stewards deemed
the performance of Ice Cold Bundy unsatisfactory in the home straight and acting in accordance with GAR
71, Stewards directed that Ice Cold Bundy must perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks) before any future
nominations will be accepted.

 

Race 12
GRV VBIS MAIDEN HT9

10:39 pm
450m

Maiden Heat

Stan Shunpike and Toy Doll were slow to begin.

Cruisy Limelight and Seabrook Shan collided soon after the start checking Seabrook Shan. Speedway Kid,
River Romance and Cruisy Limelight collided approaching the first turn and again on the first turn causing
River Romance to contact the running rail as a result. Seabrook Shan and Stan Shunpike collided on the
first turn checking Stan Shunpike.



River Romance was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

 




