
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Tuesday, 29 Oct 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: C. Day

Stewards: A. Curry, G. Bromley & G. Dimsey

Judges: N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: J. Haigh

Starter: G. Brett

Kennel Supervisor: J. Nuredini

Kennel Attendants: M. McKenna & D. Maye

Veterinarian: Dr N. Evans

Race 1
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET (200+)
2:22 pm
400m

Maiden

Marshall Flyer was quick to begin.  Busted, Inga Bobby and Ragin' Chloe were slow to begin. 

Silver Doo checked off Don't Say Do approaching the first turn, checking Silver Doo: causing Ragin' Chloe
and Silver Doo to collide.  Busted checked off Inga Bobby approaching the home turn, checking Busted. 
Ragin' Chloe faltered approaching the home turn and fell as a result.  Don't Say Do's muzzle became
displaced during the running of the event. 

Ragin' Chloe underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a right foreleg monkey
muscle injury, right thigh bruising and left foreleg abrasions.  A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Marshall Flyer - the winner of the event.

Race 2
PARKER PUMPS (200+)

2:41 pm
460m

Maiden

A pre-race sample was taken from Whispy Bale. 

Red Curry was slow to begin. 

Red Curry galloped on Empowered approaching the first turn, checking Empowered.  Our Manny and
Diama Miss collided on the first turn, checking Diama Miss.  Diama Miss checked off Gentleman Fox on the
home turn.  Red Curry raced wide in the home straight.  Empowered and Star Ballerina collided
approaching the winning post. 

Race 3
VIATEK TECHNOLOGY (200+)

3:09 pm
400m

Grade 7

Push Start and Blackpool Loki were quick to begin.  Zoe's Intention went up with the lids at box rise. 

Swift Succession and Oriental Gracie collided soon after the start.  Kiss Mwah and Devil Den collided
approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds: causing Zoe's Intention to check off Devil Den and
severely check Devil Den who faltered as a result.  Push Start and Swift Succession collided on the home
turn. 

Devil Den underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a right foreleg monkey
muscle injury. A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 4
NARDI PRODUCE (200+)

3:24 pm
400m

Grade 6

Dark Justice went up with the lids at box rise.  

Blue Marie, Alter Ego and Crackerjack Kane collided soon after the start.  Blue Marie and Crackerjack
Kane collided approaching the first turn, checking Blue Marie: causing Blue Marie and Alter Ego to collide. 
Lektra Bear and Crackerjack Kane collided approaching the home turn.  Crackerjack Kane and Blackpool
Ammo collided entering the home straight. 

Alter Ego – Stewards were satisfied with the boxing of the greyhound today and removed the box first
endorsement for future events in accordance with GAR 52. 

Race 5
BECKLEY CENTRE CLUB

FUNDRAISING (200+)
3:46 pm
460m

Grade 5

My Hardaway Hana was quick to begin.  Una Star was slow to begin.  

Shamrock Valley and Xera Bale collided soon after the start, checking Xera Bale.  Una Star and Monkey
Mite collided on the first turn, checking Una Star: causing Una Star and Shamrock Valley to collide,
checking Una Star : causing Una Star and Xera Bale to collide.  My Hardaway Hana and Lonnie Danger
collided approaching the home turn, checking My Hardaway Hana: causing My Hardaway Hana and
Monkey Mite to collide. 

A post-race sample was taken from Bush Blossom - the winner of the event.



Race 6
BURNS ARCHER REALTY (200+)

4:04 pm
460m

Grade 5

Chasin' Bobbi was quick to begin. 

Cruising Betty and Slinky Inky collided soon after the start.  Monaro Joe, Magic Panther and Fawn Regrets
collided soon after the start.  Chasin' Bobbi and Scenic Warrior collided approaching the first turn, checking
Chasin' Bobbi: causing Chasin' Bobbi, Pandora's Proof, Magic Panther and Cruising Betty to collide,
checking Magic Panther, Fawn Regrets and Pandora's Proof. 

Race 7
JIMS MOWING - GEELONG (200+)

4:24 pm
460m

Mixed 6/7

Milly Mac and Galloping Nikki collided soon after the start.  Selynya Ryan and Galloping Nikki collided
approaching the first turn.  Resounding checked off Bossa Nova Joe approaching the home turn causing
Resounding and Galloping Nikki to collide.  Bossa Nova Joe and Milly Mac collided approaching the home
turn.  Galloping Nikki checked off Resounding approaching the home turn.  Selynya Ryan checked off
Galloping Nikki on the home turn causing Selynya Ryan to race wide and collide with Macfid Magic. 

A post-race sample was taken from Mr. Lonely - the winner of the event.

Race 8
WEDDERMOOR PLUMBING & GAS

(200+)
4:48 pm
460m

Mixed 4/5

Winlock Newbolt and Crackerjack Nev were slow to begin. 

Renita Bale, Die Laughing and Dewana Jayden collided approaching the first turn, checking Dewana
Jayden. Crackerjack Nev and Dewana Jayden collided on the first turn, checking Dewana Jayden.  Renita
Bale, Die Laughing and Mimstar collided approaching the home turn.  Dewana Be Sure checked off Die
Laughing approaching the home turn.  Dewana Jayden checked off Die Laughing approaching the home
turn.  Die Laughing and Dewana Be Sure collided approaching the home turn and again entering the
home straight.  Dewana Be Sure, Die Laughing and Crackerjack Nev collided in the home straight. 

Race 9
OUTLINE PRINT DESIGN (200+)

5:12 pm
400m

Grade 5

Limburg Patrick - New declared weight due to back muscle injury, last raced at 31.4kg, today 32.7kg.

Heza Real Deal - New declared weight due to kennel change, last raced at 30.1kg, today 31.5kg.

A pre-race sample was taken from Chachi Arcola.

Fly By Them and Heza Real Deal crossed to the running rail soon after the start causing Covfefe, Damo's
Pineapple, Limburg Patrick, Heza Real Deal and Fly By Them to collide.  Shimmy Dat Ray and Adori
collided on the first turn.  Damo's Pineapple, Limburg Patrick, Heza Real Deal and Fly By Them collided on
the first turn, checking Damo's Pineapple.  Limburg Patrick and Heza Real Deal collided approaching the
home turn.  Shimmy Dat Ray and Adori collided approaching the home turn. 

Race 10
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

(200+)
5:27 pm
400m

Mixed 4/5

Winlock Rose was quick to begin.  

Mr. Delahoya and Quick Transition collided soon after the start.  Quick Transition checked off Mr. Delahoya
approaching the home turn.  Newtown Angel checked off Lektra Flirt approaching the home turn.  Quick
Transition checked off Mr. Delahoya entering the home straight. 

A post-race sample was taken from Newtown Angel - the winner of the event.

Race 11
MERV JENNINGS SIGNS (200+)

5:46 pm
400m

Grade 5

Amor Vincit and Crackerjack Ale collided soon after the start, checking Amor Vincit.  Crackerjack Ale and
Crackerjack Nath collided approaching the first turn.  Slingshot Storm, Kiowa Kaema and Foxy Molly
collided on the first turn, checking Kiowa Kaema.  Slingshot Storm and Foxy Molly collided approaching the
home turn.  Crackerjack Nath and Crackerjack Ale collided approaching the home turn.  Slingshot Storm
checked off Foxy Molly approaching the home turn.  Lektra Swing tired in the home straight. 

Lektra Swing underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a right foreleg monkey
muscle injury, laceration to the right hock and dehydration. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Foxy Molly - the winner of the event.

Crackerjack Nath - Difficult to box, warning issued. 

Race 12
MILLER MUZZLES (200+)

6:10 pm
400m

Grade 5

Zipping Afro went up with the lids at box rise.  My Mascara and Why Not kaleb collided soon after the start. 
My Mascara checked off Latinize on the first turn.  Why Not Kaleb and Tiggy Buzzard collided approaching
the home turn. 

A post-race sample was taken from Why Not Kaleb - the winner of the event.

Satisfactory Trial. 

Fran Bale – Field of 4, Distance 400m, Weight 29.0kgs, Box 1, Placed 1st, Time Run 22.67. Comment:
Cramp trial – Cleared.




