
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Monday, 14 Oct 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: C. Day

Stewards: A. Fewell & G. Dimsey

Judges: T. Lockwood

Lure Drivers: D. Kierl

Starter: R. Phillips

Kennel Supervisor: J. Loudon

Kennel Attendants: R. Raven

Veterinarian: Dr. A. Cole

Race 1
FREE ENTRY EVERY MEETING

3:24 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Track Curator Mr R. Phillips advised that the track was medium harrowed on 11/10/19.

Crackerjack Jaws checked off Ruby Arizona soon after the start. Crackerjack Jaws, Maybe Hostile and
Aerolithology collided approaching the first turn checking Crackerjack Jaws. Princetown Boy checked off
Ruby Arizona approaching the first turn checking Maybe Hostile. Ruby Arizona checked off Thug Rose
approaching the home turn. Ruby Arizona and Aerolithology collided in the home straight.

Race 2
AUSSIE INFRARED @ STUD

3:44 pm
450m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Dorellie Love and Carson Bale were slow to begin.

Fabs You Go, Uryan Bale and Fernando Toy collided soon after start checking Uryan Bale and Fernando
Toy. Fernando Toy checked off Carson Bale approaching the first turn. Dorellie Love and Fernando Toy
collided on the first turn checking Dorellie Love. Isotope and Carson Bale collided approaching the home
turn. Isotope and Fabs You Go collided approaching the home turn. Isotope and Uryan Bale collided
approaching the home turn.

Race 3
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

4:07 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Londyn's Choice – New declared weight of 28.0kgs, last raced at 29.6kgs.

A pre-race sample was unable to be obtained from Pyrenees Daisy, a post race sample was subsequently
taken.

Londyn's Choice was quick to begin. Pyrenees Daisy was slow to begin.

Moondust, Refueled, Artic Twist and Crackerjack Scot collided soon after the start checking Refueled and
Artic Twist. Moondust, Crackerjack Scot and Our Ryker collided on the first turn checking Moon Dust and
severely checking Artic Twist and Crown Tuxedo. Crackerjack Scot and Our Ryker collided approaching
the home turn and collided repeatedly in the home straight.

Race 4
SIRES ON ICE

4:27 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Devil Den - Late scratching at 2.47pm due to weight variation (GAR 39). A 10 day stand down period was
imposed. Trainer Ms T. Welsh was fined $100.

Pranjip Comet was quick to begin. Regal Missile and Una's Boy were slow to begin.

Big Cam, Aston Squire, Simmo Gogolac and Patricia Mary collided soon after the start checking Simmo
Gogolac. Patricia Mary, Aston Squire, Big Cam, Una's Boy and Regal Missile collided approaching the first
turn checking Big Cam, Regal Missile and Patricia Mary. Regal Missile and Patricia Mary collided
approaching the home turn.

A post-race sample was taken from Pranjip Comet - the winner of the event.

Race 5
A1 SIGNAGE (1-3 WINS)

4:47 pm
545m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

New Cross Gate was slow to begin.

Our Airman checked off Oddjob Lad soon after the start. Unrivalled Dusty checked off Oddjob Lad
approaching the first turn. Oddjob Lad checked off Star Fever on the first turn and collided with Wake Up.
Oddjob Lad, Star Fever and One Step Forward collided on the second turn. Oddjob Lad, Star Fever and
New Cross Gate collided approaching the home turn. Oddjob Lad and Star Fever collided on the home
turn. Unrivalled Dusty raced wide on the home turn and in the home straight. Our Airman checked off Star
Fever on the home turn. Blue Cigar raced wide in the home straight.

A post-race sample was taken from One Step Forward - the winner of the event.

Oddjob Lad underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a right monkey muscle
injury. A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to Trainer Mr W. Duniam regarding the
greyhonds performance throughout the event. Stewards deemed the performance unsatisfactory, acting in
accordance with GAR 71, Oddjob Lad must perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks) before any future
nomination will be accepted.



Race 6
JA CATERING & FUNCTIONS

5:14 pm
450m

Grade 5 T3

A pre-race sample was taken from Cruising Betty.

Yep Yep and Cruising Betty collided approaching the first turn checking Cruising Betty. Blockette, Big
Baccala and Hooked On You collided approaching the first turn checking Hooked On You, Broken Pieces
and Alezan. Big Baccala and Blockette collided on the first turn checking Blockette. Micky Rads, Broken
Pieces and Hooked On You collided approaching the home turn. Cruising Betty, Hooked On You and
Broken Pieces raced wide in the home straight. 

A post-race sample was taken from Yep Yep - the winner of the event.

Race 7
VW CADDY RUNNER (1-2 WINS)

5:34 pm
450m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

Fab's Excise and Shima Melody collided soon after the start checking both greyhounds. Riverdale Tuohy,
Miss Murino and Honest Keithy collided soon after the start checking Riverdale Tuohy and Miss Murino.
Dundee Blitz checked off Shima Melody approaching the first turn. Gruff Rose checked off Honest Keithy
on the first turn checking Miss Murino and Fab's Excise. Riverdale Tuohy checked off Dundee Blitz
approaching the home turn. Riverdale Tuohy and Miss Murino collided on the home turn.

Stewards spoke to Trainer Mr Steven Chircop regarding the improved performance of Honest Keithy in this
event. Mr Chircop explained that the greyhound was recently diagnosed with a back injury with the injury
being treated accordingly. Mr Chircop further explained that the greyhound's training regime has changed
whilst treating the injury. Mr Chircop stated that last start the greyhound raced over the 545m distance in an
attempt to get the greyhound to lead. Mr Chircop attributed this change in training and preparation, along
with finding and treating an injury, as the significant explanation as to the greyhound's improved
performace. Mr Chricop's comments were noted. A post-race sample was taken from Honest Keithy - the
winner of the event.

Race 8
BALLARAT VOLKSWAGEN

5:54 pm
450m

Grade 5 T3

Leeroy Rox and Rapid Rock collided approaching the first turn. Marvelette, Leeroy Rox and Rapid Rock
collided on the first turn. Speedy Ryder and Agent Que collided on the first turn.

A post-race sample was taken from Fernando's Flare  - the winner of the event.

Stewards spoke to Trainer Mr John Chircop regarding the significant market move for the greyhound
Fernando's Flare. Mr Chircop stated that in his opinion the greyhound was better than the other runners in
the field and the greyhound should have won at its most recent start. Accordingly Mr Chircop did have a
financial investment on Fernando's Flare in this event. Stewards noted Mr Chircop's comments. Races 7 &
8 will be evaluated by GRV's betting analysts.

 

Race 9
EUREKA CONCRETE (2-3 WINS)

6:09 pm
390m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

Maramba and Enya Bale collided soon after the start checking Maramba. Knocker's Gold checked off Very
Venom approaching the first turn. Knocker's Gold checked off Enya Bale on the first turn. Very Venom and
Stoikos collided on the first turn checking Very Venom. Very Venom and Enya Bale collided approaching
the home turn. Sandulad and Enya Bale collided approaching the winning post. Stoikos and Maramba
collided approaching the winning post.

Knocker's Gold underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a left back muscle
injury. A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Very Venom, which fell in the catching pen, underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found
to have a right quadriceps muscle injury. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

 

 

Race 10
BOTTLE-O

6:27 pm
390m

Grade 5 T3

Blazing Sword checked off Caramel Blonde soon after the start. Doran's Call, Seeka Moment, Mask, Why
Not Kaleb and Caramel Blonde collided approaching the first turn checking Doran's Call and Seeka
Moment. Nut And Bolt checked off Doran's Call approaching the first turn. Mask checked off Why Not Kaleb
on the first turn. Mask checked off Caramel Blonde on the first turn checking Seeka Moment.

Race 11
JUST COPIERS

6:47 pm
390m

Grade 5 T3

Ringcraft was quick to begin.

Ninetymile Donny, Five Times Table and Fawn Illusion collided soon after the start checking Ninetymile
Donny. Five Times Tables, Fawn Illusion and Stavros collided approaching the first turn checking Stavros.
Saint Ray, Stavros, Fawn Illusion and Ninetymile Donny collided on the first turn checking Ninetymile
Donny, Fawn Illusion and Stavros. Red Neck Miss and Five Times Tables collided entering the home
straight checking Red Neck Miss.

Race 12
DOWNLOAD THE NEW WATCHDOG

APP
7:03 pm

Cherokee Shimmer was quick to begin.

Pinnaroo and Pyrenees Classic collided soon after the start checking Pinnaroo. Don Quixote and Paid Too
Much collided approaching the first turn checking Paid Too Much. Don Quixote, Pyrenees Classic and Lock
Pepper collided on the first turn checking Pyrenees Classic, Lock Pepper and Paid Too Much. Cherokee
Shimmer turned its head outwards approaching the home turn colliding with and checking Chachi Arcola.



390m
Grade 5 T3

Cherokee Shimmer and Chachi Arcola collided entering the home straight. Pyrenees Classic and Paid Too
Much collided in the home straight. Lock Pepper galloped on Don Quixote approaching the winning post.
Chachi Arcola and Cherokee Shimmer collided approaching the winning post.

Cherokee Shimmer underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.
Stewards spoke to Mr C Stanton the trainer of Cherokee Shimmer regarding the greyhounds racing
manners approaching the home turn. Acting under the provisions of GAR 69(A)(1) Cherokee Shimmer was
charged with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment. Mr Stanton pleaded guilty to the charge,
Cherokee Shimmer is suspended for 12 months at all tracks and must perform a Satisfactory Trial (all
tracks), pursuant to GAR 69(A)(2)(c) before any future nomination will be accepted.

Satisfactory Trial:

Dyna Yardo – Field of 4, Distance 450m, Weight 33.1kgs, Box 1, Placed 1st, Time Run 25.40. Comment: 6
month trial returning from back muscle injury. Cleared All Tracks




