
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Tuesday, 25 Jun 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A.Curry

Stewards: B. Jinks, G. Dimsey, L. Fahry, G.Bromley & P.Searle

Judges: N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: J. Haigh

Starter: G. Brett

Kennel Supervisor: J. Nicholls

Kennel Attendants: J.Nuredini & D. Maye

Veterinarian: Dr S. Karamatic

Race 1
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
3:09 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

A sample was taken from Jazz Fusion upon arrival at the course.

Landon Bale and Chasin' Bobbi were quick to begin. Infinity Stone was slow to begin.

Chasin' Bobbi shifted in soon after the start checking Elite Coconut, Jazz Fusion, Bont's Charlie and Harrell
Bale. Elite Coconut and Bont's Charlie collided on the first turn checking Elite Coconut. Elite Coconut
galloped on Infinity Stone approaching the home turn, severely checking both greyhounds.

Elite Coconut underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. 

Infinity Stone underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was re-examined following race 3. Infinity
Stone was found to have an injury to the left quadriceps and a spike wound. A 7 day stand down period
was imposed. Stewards spoke to Mr B. Hodgson, the trainer of Infinity Stone and acting under GAR 75 (1)
Stewards ordered Mr Hodgson to report as soon as practicable anything that may have affected the
running of Infinity Stone in the event which was not noted by Stewards during or immediately after the
event. 

Stewards conducted a check of catcher’s licences in accordance with LR 16.2 and all were compliant.

Supplementary Report 26.06.2019;

Pursuant to GAR 75 Mr Hodgson trainer of Infinity Stone reported to Stewards that the greyhound appears
sore upon examination and intends to seek further veterinary treatment. 

Race 2
VIATEK TECHNOLOGY

3:34 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

La Caprice was slow to begin.

My Girl Lilly and Chasin' Louie collided soon after the start. My Girl Lilly, Chasin' Louie, Bright Blue and La
Coconut collided soon after the start checking My Girl Lilly, Chasin' Louie and Bright Blue. Inga Assalt and
Bright Blue collided on the first turn checking both greyhounds. Inga Assalt and Chasin' Louie collided on
the first turn checking Inga Assalt. My Girl Lilly checked off Chasin' Louie approaching the home turn.
Weslyn Bale and Inga Assalt raced wide in the home straight.

Race 3
BURNS ARCHER REALTY

3:54 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Waltz On Bye – New declared weight of 30.4kgs, last raced at 29.3kgs.

A pre race sample was taken from Marlise Bale.

Firework Joey was very slow to begin - 3 lengths.

Storming Vixen, Major Style and Marlise Bale collided approaching the first turn checking Storming Vixen.
Firework Joey checked off Storming Vixen on the first turn checking Firework Joey which lost ground as a
result. Scissor King checked off Oh Spolly in the home straight. Marlise Bale raced wide in the home
straight.

Firework Joey underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. 

A post-race sample was taken from Oh Spolly - the winner of the event.

Race 4
WEDDERMOOR PLUMBING & GAS

4:11 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

Just Audrey and Miss Oreo Mac were quick to begin. Killana was slow to begin.

Yep Yep checked off Cool Titanium on the first turn, also checking Killana. Just Audrey brushed the running
rail approaching the home turn. Just Audrey checked off Cool Titanium in the home straight. Yep Yep
checked off Cool Titanium in the home straight.

Killana underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an injury to the left and right
monkey muscles. A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to Mr N. Hunt, the trainer of
Killana and acting under GAR 75 (1) Stewards ordered Mr Hunt to report as soon as practicable anything
that may have affected the running of Killana in the event which was not noted by Stewards during or
immediately after the event. 

Supplementary Report 26.06.2019:



Pursant to GAR (75) Mr N Hunt trainer of Killana reported to Stewards that upon examination the
greyhound showed no further injury. 

Race 5
PARKER PUMPS (1-2 WINS)

4:34 pm
460m

Tier 3 - Restricted Win

Little Fernando checked off Cherokee Fawn soon after the start. Big Holiday checked off So Much Mojo on
the first turn. Big Holiday checked off Little Fernando entering the home straight. Big Holiday raced wide in
the home straight. Rose Fawn and So Much Mojo collided in the home straight.

Race 6
PET PANELS.COM.AU

4:50 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

Urban Ruler - Late scratching at 2:04 on the advice of the On-Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to bruising
of the left gracilis muscle. A 14 day stand down period was imposed. 

A pre race sample was taken from Lektra Stomp.

Flossy Lee was slow to begin.

Dynamic Street, Mexican Ned, Lektra Stomp and Jim's Hotel collided approaching the first turn checking
Lektra Stomp. Hot Cruiser, Dynamic Street and Jim's Hotel collided on the first turn checking Hot Cruiser
and Dynamic Street. Hot Cruiser and Dynamic Street collided approaching the home turn. Mexican Ned
and Leeroy Rox collided approaching the home turn.

Race 7
OUTLINE PRINT DESIGN

5:11 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

A sample was taken from Tubark upon arrival at the course.

A pre race sample was taken from Tiggy Buzzard.

Why Not Macca, Miss Pocket Aces and Amanda Lee collided soon after the start checking Why Not Macca
and Miss Pocket  Aces. Where's Success checked off Amanda Lee approaching the first turn. Tiggy
Buzzard galloped on Amanda Lee on the first turn. Why Not Macca galloped on Tubark aaproaching the
home turn checking Why Not Macca and causing Tubark to fall.

Tubark underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have left scapula fracture. A 60 day
stand down period was imposed.

Why Not Macca underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. 

Race 8
TTS ELECTRICS

5:29 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

A pre race sample was taken from Rellim Diesel.

Chilling Story and I'm Circus were slow to begin.

Koenigsegg Agera checked off Manitoba approaching the first turn. Manitoba, Rellim Diesel and Sizzlin'
Sanchez collided approaching the first turn checking Rellim Diesel. Loroupe, Chilling Story and Rellim
Diesel collided on the first turn. Chilling Story and Zoro Bale collided entering the home straight.

Race 9
JIMS MOWING - GEELONG

5:47 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Petey Baqui and Don Quixote collided approaching the first turn. Petey Baqui, Don Quixote, Dyna Bella
and Dyna Diedre collided on the first turn checking Don Quixote and Dyna Bella. Krabi and Dyna Dixon
collided approaching the home turn and again on the home home turn. Don Quixote and Dyna Bella
collided approaching the home turn. Krabi shifted to the inside in the home straight checking Dyna Bella,
Dyna Dixon and Dyna Diedre.

Dyna Dixon underwent a post-race veterinary at the trainer's request and was found to have abrasions to
the left wrist and right metatarsals. No stand down period was imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mr R. Coleman, the representative of the greyhound Dyna Dixon, in regards to the
greyhound's racing manners on the home turn. Upon reviewing all available footage stewards took no
further action.

A post race sample was taken from Whatta Lady.

Race 10
NARDI PRODUCE

6:05 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Maramba - Late scratching at 2:09 on the advice of the On-Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to a right calf
an achilles. A 14 day stand down period was imposed. 

A pre race sample was taken from Lacarabine.

Spring Kitty was quick to begin. Why Not Loz was very slow to begin - 3 lengths.

Lacarabine and Mask collided approaching the first turn. Why Not Loz lost ground in the home straight. 

Why Not Loz underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have cramped and an
abrasion to the right hind toes. A 5 day stand down period was imposed. Acting in accordance with GAR 71
(Cramp) Why Not Loz must perform a Satisfactory Trial before any future nomination will be accepted.

A post race sample was taken from Succession Plan.

Race 11 Nambrok Agent was quick to begin. Agent Cue was slow to begin.



MILLERS MUZZLES
6:25 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Wackadooka checked off Tashendo soon after the start. Nambrok Agent, Drought Breaker and Flying Sam
collided on the first turn checking Drought Breaker. Take That Banksy, Nambrok Agent and Drought Breaker
collided approaching the home turn checking Nambrok Agent. Nambrok Agent and Wackadooka collided
approaching the home turn. Blitzen Bell checked off Nambrok Agent in the home straight. Agent Que raced
wide on the home turn. Tashendo and Agent Que raced wide in the home straight.

A post race sample was taken from Flying Sam.




