
STEWARD'S REPORT

Healesville
Monday, 01 Jul 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: G.Truett

Stewards: D. Barber & M. Lowe

Judges: J. Alsop

Lure Drivers: S. Courts

Starter: T. Ebeyer

Kennel Supervisor: R. Moles

Kennel Attendants: C. Ryan & R. Bau

Veterinarian: Dr. N. Evans

Race 1
DOWNLOAD THE NEW WATCHDOG

APP
12:02 pm

350m
Mixed 6/7

Archie Rocks – Late scratching at 7:59am when Mr Mario Briganti reported the greyhound to have an
illness - Diarrhoea (GAR 23). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards will require a veterinary
certificate before any future nomination will be accepted. 

Pursuant to GAR 104 (7) Steward Ms Demi Barber did not act in any official capacity for this event.

Testa Girl and Pranjip Comet collided soon after the start.  Testa Girl, Pranjip Comet, Staggerism and No
Problem John collided at the 300m mark checking Testa Girl.

Race 2
SILVER EAGLE OUTFITTERS

12:24 pm
300m

Mixed 6/7

Rockin' Rosco checked off All Inn Christy soon after the start.  Redhead Chez and Jiggly Wiggly collided
soon after the start.  Redhead Chez, Jiggly Wiggly and All For Now collided at the 250m mark checking All
For Now.  Ko Rapid Jack, Tex Ribs, Pranjip Zeus and Jiggly Wiggly collided at the 200m mark checking
Pranjip Zeus.  Tex Ribs galloped on Ko Rapid Jack at the 150m mark.  Ko Rapid Jack and Jiggly Wiggly
collided several times from the 100m mark to the 50m mark.  All For Now and Rockin' Rosco collided
approaching the winning post.

Pranjip Zeus underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an abraded paw pad
on the right foreleg foot. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 3
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

12:39 pm
300m

Grade 5

Inter Phillip, All Inn Tyler, Uncatchable, Tricky Tron and Bloke's Advice collided soon after the start. 
Dragonstone and All Inn Tyler collided at the 250m mark.  Bloke's Advice checked off Inter Phillip at the
100m mark.

Race 4
FAST FREDDIE'S TYRE SERVICE

12:59 pm
300m

Free For All

Tigga Toy and Challis Magic collided at the 250m mark.  Miss Legality faltered at the 250m mark and lost
ground, subsequently becoming tailed off.  Lottie Biscotti and Undetectable collided at the 200m mark. 
Tigga Toy and Challis Magic collided at the 50m mark.

Lottie Biscotti underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a laceration to the right
fore limb. A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

Miss Legality underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a right back muscle
injury. A 60 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 5
GREYHOUNDS ON BOARD

VETERANS (250+RANK)
1:17 pm
350m

S/E Veteran

Tinderella and Black Pocket collided at the 250m mark.  Black Pocket and Early King collided at the 100m
mark.  Tinderalla, Black Pocket and Early King collided at the 75m mark.  

Race 6
JASON McKEOWN PHOTOGRAPHY

1:34 pm
350m

Grade 5

Zipping Caesar and Superior Briz collided soon after the start.  Love Laughing, Seeka Moment and
Superior Briz collided at the 300m mark.  Magic Trap and Love Laughing collided at the 250m mark.  Magic
Trap and Zipping Caesar collided at the 200m mark.  Seeka Moment checked off Love Laughing at the
150m mark.



Race 7
WOMEN ON TRACK -21st JULY

1:54 pm
350m

Grade 5

Further Dreamer was slow to begin.

Carson County and Harvey Warbanger collided at the 300m mark.  Kaylin and Further Dreamer collided
several times from the 275m mark to the 225m mark checking Further Dreamer.  Kaylin and Carson County
collided at the 50m mark.  

Race 8
HVL FOOTBALL & NETBALL CLUB 

2:09 pm
350m

Free For All

Toonang, My American Girl and Mumma's Bear collided soon after the start.  Toonang and My American
Girl collided at the 250m mark.

Race 9
healesville.grv.org.au

2:29 pm
300m

Grade 5

Cullquin Panda was slow to begin.

Challis Sprite, Unexplainable and Dyna Diedre collided at the 250m mark.  Dyna Diedre and Billy's Missile
collided at the 200m mark.  Challis Sprite, Cullquin Panda, Koitsenko and Billy's Missile collided at the
150m mark checking Koitsenko and Billy's Missile.  Billy's Missile and Ninetymile Lenny collided at the
100m mark.  Challis Sprite and Cullquin Panda collided at the 50m mark.  

Race 10
TAB.COM.AU DAMSELS DASH

2:50 pm
300m

Grade 5

Emerley Express, Aston Jynx and Medium Rare collided soon after the start.  Zipping Amy, Princess
America and Desiree Dancer collided at the 250m mark severely checking Princess America.  Zipping Amy
and Desiree Dancer collided several times from 200m mark to the 100m mark.

Race 11
WILD GRAINS BAKERY DAMSELS

DASH
3:07 pm
300m

Grade 5

Joe's Dolly, Dirty Stella and Little Dynamo collided soon after the start.  Loroupe and Dirty Stella collided
several times from the 250m mark to the 200m mark.  Joe's Dolly and Madonya collided at the 200m mark.  

Race 12
99.1 YARRA VALLEY FM DAMSELS

DASH
3:27 pm
300m

Grade 5

Wild Hunny - Late scratching at 11:26am due to weight variation (GAR 39). A 10 day stand down period
was imposed. Trainer Mrs Kellie Leviston was fined $100.

Speed Alert was slow to begin.

Superstar Jessie checked off Early Special at the 150m mark.




