
STEWARD'S REPORT

Warrnambool
Saturday, 11 Jan 2020

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S. Bettess

Stewards: G. Dimsey, P. Watson, G. Rea & J. Rea

Judges: T. O'Neill

Lure Drivers: N. Kenna (G. Rea)

Starter: G. McLeod

Kennel Supervisor: C. Sinnott

Kennel Attendants: H. Lucas

Veterinarian: Dr K. Reid

Race 1
CAPITOL CINEMA

6:06 pm
390m

Maiden

Moraine Hayley was quick to begin.

Fireball Frank, Dinner Roll, Lizzie's Entity and Aeroplane Moses collided soon after the start, checking
Aeroplane Moses, Dinner Roll and Lizzie's Entity, which lost ground.  Aeroplane Moses crossed to the rail
on the first turn, checking Dinner Roll.  Mr Eddie raced wide on the home turn.

Race 2
JOSH SHIRLEY MARSH ‘IS HE SWEET

STAKES?’
6:24 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

Mepunga Sparkle – New declared weight of 29.5 kgs, last raced at 28.3 kgs.

Crazy Old Goat, Cawbourne Mimma and Gala Bale were slow to begin.

Mepunga Sparkle checked off the heels of Black Zebrano approaching the first turn.  Black Zebrano and
Gala Bale collided approaching the home turn.  Cawbourne Mimma and Aston Stock raced wide on the
home turn.

Race 3
KERMONDS HAMBURGERS

6:44 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7

Classy Riot and Why Not Lilah collided soon after the start.  Numero Uno and Aston Express collided
approaching the first turn.  Numero Uno, Aston Express and Miss City Girl collided on the first turn,
checking Aston Express and Miss City Girl.  Classy Riot and Aston Express raced wide on the home turn.

Race 4
GRV VIC BRED MAIDEN SERIES

FINAL
7:04 pm
450m

Maiden Final

Aston Estate, Paradise Pippa and Little Mug were slow to begin.

Tinker Craig, Frank's Girl and Aston Estate collided soon after the start.  Nimble Danny, Invictus Spirit, Little
Mug and Paradise Pippa collided approaching the first turn, checking Invcitus Spirit and Little Mug. 
Paradise Pippa and Little Mug collided on the first turn.  Nimble Danny galloped on the heels of Ed Deeds
approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds.  Aston Estate raced wide on the home turn.  Ed
Deeds and Frank's Girl collided entering the home straight.

A sample was taken from Tinker Craig - the winner of the event.

Race 5
MACEY'S BISTRO

7:26 pm
450m

Grade 5

Show Of Force was quick to begin.  More Deductions was slow to begin.

Drogheda County, Prince Cody and Aston Pirate collided soon after the start, checking Prince Cody.  Amor
Vincit, Drogheda County, Prince Cody and Mepunga Debbie collided on the first turn, checking Prince
Cody and Mepunga Debbie, which lost ground.

Race 6
WBL FENCING SPECIALISTS STAR

FINAL
7:51 pm
450m

S/E Final

Emerald Rainbow was quick to begin.

Magic Bulldozer crossed to the rail soon after the start, checking Kinloch Moss.  My Word Shirley, Max
Dynamo and War Creek collided on the first turn, checking My Word Shirley.  Emerald Rainbow and Max
Dynamo collided entering the home straight.

A sample was taken from Max Dynamo - the winner of the event.



Race 7
WBL SUMMER SIZZLE FINAL

8:13 pm
390m

S/E Final

The start of this event was delayed by one minute due to operational requirements.

Slick Riot and Blackpool Ammo were quick to begin.

Aston Pilsner, Lektra Desire, Whisky Hans and Typhoon Bolt collided soon after the start.  Typhoon Bolt,
Whisky Hans and Lektra Desire collided approaching the first turn, checking Lektra Desire which lost
ground.  Blackpool Marvel, Brace And Bits and Aston Pilsner collided on the first turn, checking Brace And
Bits which collided with Typhoon Bolt.  Brace And Bits and Whisky Hans collided approaching the home
turn, checking Whisky Hans.  Brace And Bits and Typhoon Bolt raced wide on the home turn.

A sample was taken from Slick Riot - the winner of the event.

Race 8
PREMIER SPEEDWAY

WARRNAMBOOL
8:38 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

Zipping Clifford – New declared weight of 32.2kg, last raced at 33.5kg.

A pre-race sample was taken from Zipping Clifford.

Henessey Venom and Big Brebler were quick to begin.  Zekel Bale was slow to begin.

Bomber Creek crossed to the rail on the first turn, checking Ernesto Bale, which then collided with Zipping
Clifford, Lektra Perry and Zekel Bale, which raced wide as a result.  Henessey Venom and Tickle My Fancy
collided several times in the home straight.  

Race 9
EDWARDS ELECTRICAL (1-3 WINS

250+ RANK)
8:57 pm
390m

Restricted Win

Black Katniss was slow to begin.

Crazy Old Fool and Easter Orchid collided soon after the start.  Crazy Old Fool, Easter Orchid and Black
Katniss collided on the first turn, checking Easter Orchid.  Wrangle raced wide on the home turn.  Wrangle
and Causing Drama collided in the home straight.

Race 10
WANNON PARK BINGO - THURSDAYS

9:17 pm
390m

Free For All

Blackpool Amour was slow to begin.

Piriformis and Blackpool Amour collided approaching the first turn, checking Blackpool Amour.  Why Not
Dan and Spring Classic collided on the first turn, checking Spring Classic which lost ground and tailed off
as a result.

Spring Classic underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have left and right foreleg
monkey muscle and left and right hindleg pencil/whip injuries.  A seven day stand down period was
imposed.  Stewards spoke to Mr Kevin Mugavin, the trainer of Spring Classic regarding the greyhounds
racing manners on the first turn.  Acting under the provisions of GAR 69(A)(1) Spring Classic was charged
with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment.  Mr Mugavin pleaded guilty to the charge, Spring
Classic is suspended for 28 days at Warrnambool and must perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks),
pursuant to GAR 69(A)(2)(a) before any future nomination will be accepted.

Race 11
LIGHTNING FRANK @ STUD

DAMSELS DASH
9:43 pm
390m

Grade 5

Jiggly Wiggly - Late scratching at 5:04 pm due to weight variation (GAR 39).  A 10 day stand down period
was imposed.  Trainer, Mr Noel Carthew was fined $100.

Shanlyn Georgie and Carmel Blonde collided on the first turn, checking Carmel Blonde.

Race 12
WANNON GREYHOUNDS ON

INSTAGRAM
10:02 pm

390m
Grade 5

Line Trike – New declared weight of 33.9 kgs, last raced at 35.4 kgs.

A pre-race sample was taken from Line Trike.

The start of this event was delayed by one minute due to operational requirements.

Saintly Jack was quick to begin.  Tiggerlong Al checked off Aston Ninja approaching the first turn.  Mr
Delahoya and Thomeli Tash collided on the first turn.  Saintly Jack, Line Trike and Tiggerlong Al collided
approaching the home turn, checking Line Trike and Tiggerlong Al, resulting in Tiggerlong Al racing wide. 
Mr Delahoya, Line Trike and Tiggerlong Al collided entering the home straight.




