
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 26 Feb 2020

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: G. Dimsey

Stewards: D. Verberne, B. Blood & A. Fewell

Judges: B. Loudon

Lure Drivers: J. Haigh

Starter: D.Todd

Kennel Supervisor: R. Raven

Kennel Attendants: D. Jones

Veterinarian: Dr. H. Crawford

Race 1
GO THE RED DOG FOR BUSHFIRE

APPEAL
6:57 pm
450m

Maiden

Talking Numbers was slow to begin.

Quail Bale and Fabriola Acai collided soon after the start. Rockstar Lincoln and Wendalin Bale collided on
the first turn checking Wendalin Bale. Quail Bale and Wendalin Bale collided approaching the home turn
checking Wendalin Bale and Talking Numbers.

Wendalin Bale underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported

Race 2
A1 SIGNAGE

7:17 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

Galway Grange, Bear Force One and Yozo Bale collided soon after the start checking Galway Grange.
Bubba Jo checked off Kiss Mwah on the first turn. Kiss Mwah and Uniquely Mine collided on the first turn
checking Uniquely Mine and Bubba Jo. Uniquely Mine checked off Kiss Mwah approaching the home turn.
Galway Grange galloped on Kiss Mwah in the home straight checking Kiss Mwah, Galway Grange
and Uniquely Mine.

Race 3
BOTTLE-O

7:40 pm
450m

Grade 7

Malayah Bale was slow to begin.

Fabriola Zad and Cruisy's Warrior collided approaching the first turn checking Cruisy's Warrior. Providence
Bale and Bago Go Go collided approaching the home turn checking Providence Bale, Bago Go Go, Lektra
Shadow and Cruisy's Warrior. Malayah Bale brushed the running rail on the home turn. Fabriola Zad and
Bago Go Go collided on the home turn checking Fabriola Zad. Providence Bale and Lektra Shadow
collided entering the home straight. Cruisy's Warrior and Bago Go Go collided entering the home
straight. Cruisy's Warrior checked off Providence Bale approaching the winning post.

A post-race sample was taken from Jax Bale - the winner of the event.

Race 4
EUREKA CONCRETE

8:00 pm
450m

Grade 6

Taltarni Black - Late scratching at 7.56pm on the advice of the On-Track Veterinarian (GAR 37) due to
papilloma's both hind paws. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Elvisa Bale was quick to begin. Hurry Harry was slow to begin.

Hurry Harry and Blast Zone collided on the first turn checking both greyhounds. Aston Lindop and
Veritaserum collided on the first turn checking Veritaserum. Blast Zone and Veritaserum collided entering
the home straight checking both greyhounds. Veritaserum galloped on Blast Zone in the home straight
checking Blast Zone.

Race 5
BACKMANS PET FOODS

8:18 pm
450m

Grade 5

Mr. J Ennis was fined $50 for failing to ensure the registration card was produced for the greyhound Paddy
Lee pursuant to GAR 33.

Army Bale was slow to begin.

Callum's Son and Army Bale collided approaching the first turn checking Army Bale. Ikaruga Bale galloped
on Battered Sav on the first turn checking Ikaruga Bale, Battered Sav and Aston Ando. Paddy Lee and Fly
High Billy collided approaching the winning post.

A post-race sample was taken from Rose Royce - the winner of the event.

Race 6
BALLARAT DISTANCE CHALLENGE

Tyche Onyx was quick to begin. Bayonet was slow to begin.

So Tough checked off Crackerjack Daza approaching the first turn. So Tough crossed to the rail on the



CONSOLATION
8:40 pm
660m

Special Event

second turn checking Crackerjack Daza.

A post-race sample was taken from So Tough - the winner of the event.

Race 7
JA CATERING & FUNCTIONS

9:02 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

Houlio was quick to begin.

Aston Ajax stumbled soon after the start and lost ground as a result. Dyna Romy and Go Pappa Go collided
soon after the start checking Go Pappa Go. Headspace and Dyna Romy collided soon after the start
checking Dyna Romy. Headspace, Iylee Bale and Houlio collided on the first turn checking Houlio, Iylee
Bale and Go Pappa Go. Missy Bale and Iylee Bale collided entering the home straight checking Missy
Bale.

A post-race sample was taken from Fire Legend - the winner of the event.

Race 8
BALLARAT DISTANCE CHALLENGE

FINAL
9:27 pm
660m

Special Event

Front Page News was quick to begin. Black Spring was slow to begin.

Mepunga Spectre and Midnight Mystery collided on the first turn checking Midnight Mystery and Black
Canvas. Up And About and Front Page News collided on the third turn checking Front Page News. Saint
Destructor checked off Mepunga Spectre on the home turn. Keeper Of Keys checked off Black Canvas
entering the home straight checking Black Spring.

A post-race sample was taken from Mepunga Spectre - the winner of the event.

Up And About underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. 

Race 9
REVOLUTION PRINT

9:42 pm
545m

Grade 5

Gardener's Boyo checked off Kissable soon after the start. Midnight Titan, Jonty Bale and Gardener's Boyo
collided on the first turn checking Midnight Titan and Jonty Bale. Kiss Me Razley checked off Zipping
Hector on the first turn. Kiss Me Razley checked off Blusain Bolt on the home turn.

Jonty Bale underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have abraisions to the front left
leg and a left hindleg thigh injury. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Kissable - the winner of the event.

Race 10
SIRES ON ICE HT1

10:05 pm
390m

Grade 5 Heat

Whisky Hans was slow to begin.

Hadeel Bale and Ko Rapid Jack collided approaching the first turn checking Ko Rapid Jack. Pat Malone
checked off Kraken Jonny on the first turn checking Ko Rapid Jack. Whisky Hans checked off Kraken Jonny
on the home turn. Ko Rapid Jack and Young Jebrynah collided on the home turn checking Young
Jebrynah. Whisky Hans and Hadeel Bale collided entering the home straight checking both greyhounds.

Race 11
GAP HT2
10:26 pm

390m
Grade 5 Heat

Blackpool Doc and Cherokee Cat collided soon after the start checking Cherokee Cat and Why Not
Pockets. Rodrigo Bale, Blackpool Doc and Spring Hummer collided approaching the first turn and again on
the first turn checking all three greyhounds. Fleur Burger and Blackpool Doc collided approaching the
home turn and again on the home turn.

Why Not Pockets underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a superficial
wound to the roof of the mouth. No stand down period was imposed. Mr. L. Carter, trainer of Why Not
Pockets, advised Stewards that the muzzle of the greyhound had become caught in its mouth during the
running of the event. 

Race 12
JUST COPIERS HT3

10:43 pm
390m

Grade 5 Heat

A false start was declared for this event, pursuant to GAR 56(1), due to the green light not being activated
prior to the lure run-up. The lure was pulled up before reaching the starting boxes and the start was
aborted. All greyhounds were removed from the boxes, underwent an examination by the Club Veterinary
Surgeon and were passed fit to race. The lure was returned to its original starting position.

Southwood Ace was slow to begin.

Winsome Express checked off Tibby Shore in the home straight.

Following this event, Stewards spoke to Starter D. Todd, in relation to the false start and advised him the
matter would be referred to the Club Manager for further consideration and remediation.




