
STEWARD'S REPORT

Horsham
Tuesday, 22 Oct 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: G. Dimsey

Stewards: A. Curry, M. Blood & D. Conway

Judges: T. Lockwood

Lure Drivers: R. Hamilton

Starter: N. Bergen

Kennel Supervisor: D. Hodgetts

Kennel Attendants: S Jennings & J O'Neil

Veterinarian: Dr C Finlayson

Race 1
CRYMELON KENNELS HT1

3:24 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

Go Rosie and Mouthy Boof were quick to begin.

Winlock Player and Cawbourne Gout collided soon after the start, checking Cawbourne Gout.  Cawbourne
Gout checked off Winlock Player on the first turn.  Diamond Socks raced wide on the first turn, causing
Silver Doo and Winlock Player to race wide.  Diamond Socks checked Silver Doo approaching the home
turn.

A post-race sample was taken from Mouthy Boof - the winner of the event.

Race 2
WIMMERA AQUATRAIL HT2

3:44 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

Stella Diamond and Magic Ozzie collided on the first turn, checking Magic Ozzie.  Weslyn Bale and Magic
Ozzie collided on the first turn, checking Magic Ozzie.  Aerolithology and Dusty Darcy collided approaching
the home turn, checking Aerolighology.  Maximum Jodie raced wide on the home turn.  Stella Diamond and
Weslyn Bale collided entering the home straight, checking Stella Diamond.  Stella Diamond and Aston
Logic collided in the home straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Abby's Star - the winner of the event.

Race 3
DOWNLOAD THE NEW WATCHDOG

APP
4:04 pm
410m

Mixed 6/7

Tiggerlong Al and Oriental Jade were quick to begin.

Rampant Teresa, Zoe's Intention and Ravenous Rex collided approaching the first turn, checking Zoe's
Intention.  Ravenous Rex and Winlock Winner collided approaching the first turn, checking Ravenous Rex
and Maximum Cindy.  Rampant Teresa and Winlock Winner collided approaching the home turn, checking
Rampant Teresa.  Ravenous Rex checked off Causing Drama in the home straight.

Maximum Cindy underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a left foreleg biceps
brachii injury.  A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Tiggerlong Al - the winner of the event.

Race 4
CHS GROUP (0-2 WINS)

4:19 pm
485m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from Van Evie.

Hatters Lane was slow to begin.

Come On Serenity and Aston Valkyrie collided approaching the first turn, checking Come On Serenity. 
Hatters Lane raced wide entering the home straight.  True Survivor clipped the heels of Come On Serenity
entering the home straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Van Evie - the winner of the event.

Race 5
3WM/MIXX FM (250+ RANK)

4:39 pm
410m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Amor Vincit, Aston Lagonda, Xera Bale and Found In Quartz collided soon after the start, checking Aston
Lagonda and Xera Bale.  Flying Jamaica, Great Success and Amor Vincit collided on the first turn,
checking Flying Jamaica.  Flying Jamaica and Aston Lagonda collided on the first turn, checking both
greyhounds.  Great Success and Amor Vincit collided on the first turn, checking Amor Vincit.

A post-race sample was taken from Poor Old Frank - the winner of the event.

Race 6
THE WEEKLY ADVERTISER

4:57 pm
485m

Night Things and Valletta Sky were quick to begin.  Aston Aniston and Giggling Gerty were slow to begin.

Aston Aniston and Atlas Shiralee collided approaching the first turn, checking Atlas Shiralee.  Speedy
Ryder and Go Pappa Go collided on the first turn, checking Speedy Ryder.  Night Things and Valletta Sky
collided on the first turn, checking both greyhounds.  Aston Aniston and Valletta Sky collided in the home



Grade 5 straight, checking Aston Aniston.

A post-race sample was taken from Giggling Gerty - the winner of the event.

Race 7
ON-SITE ENGINEERING (1-3 WINS

250+ RANK)
5:22 pm
485m

Restricted Win

Tiggerlong Back, Little Queeny and Delusional Fab were slow to begin.

Raylene Bale checked off My Ollie approaching the first turn.  My Ollie and Tiggerlong Grace collided on
the first turn, checking Tiggerlong Grace.  Valletta Mist and My Ollie collided in the home straight.  Valletta
Mist marred My Ollie approaching the winning post.

Valletta Mist underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Stewards spoke to Mr John Nicholls, the trainer of Valletta Mist regarding the greyhounds racing manners
approaching the winning post.  Acting under the provisions of GAR 69(1) Valletta Mist was charged with
marring.  Mr Nicholls pleaded guilty to the charge, Valletta Mist is suspended for 28 days at Horsham and
must perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks), pursuant to GAR 69(2)(a) before any future nomination will be
accepted.

A post-race sample was taken from Valletta Mist - the winner of the event.

Race 8
TAB - LONG MAY WE PLAY

5:42 pm
485m

Mixed 4/5

Winlock Newbolt was slow to begin.

One Step Forward and Lulumon collided soon after the start, checking One Step Forward.  Whoomph and
Dakora collided on the first turn, checking Dakora.  Dakora faltered and tailed off on the first turn.  One Step
Forward and Seven Enemies collided approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds.

Seven Enemies underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Dakora underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a left hindleg back muscle
injury.  A 21 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Bomber Creek - the winner of the event.

Race 9
CEC HOPPER & SONS FINAL

6:04 pm
410m

Grade 5 Final

The start of this event was delayed approximately one and a half minutes due to a technical issue with the
lure.

Tin Shed Fred was slow to begin.

Loch Tight, Charley Davidson and Steorra collided approaching the first turn, checking Charley Davidson
and Steorra.  Cavatron and Space Alert collided approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds. 
Charley Davidson and Stoerra collided approaching the home turn, checking Charley Davidson.  Space
Alert checked off Cavatron on the home turn.  Charley Davidson and Space Alert collided entering the
home straight, checking both greyhounds.  Tin Shed Fred and Steorra collided in the home straight,
checking Tin Shed Fred.  Pyrenees Petraca and Steorra collided approaching the winning post.

Steorra underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

A post-race sample was taken from Get Go Boy - the winner of the event.

Race 10
TAB MULTIPLIER

6:26 pm
410m

Mixed 4/5

Rampant Doc was slow to begin.

Still Single and Sunset Navana collided approaching the first turn, checking Still Single.  Kraken Tex
checked off Nessie Bale on the first turn.  Still Single checked off Kraken Tex approaching the home turn. 
Sunset Navana and Nessie Bale collided approaching the winning post.

A post-race sample was taken from Kraken Lightning - the winner of the event.

Race 11
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

6:50 pm
410m

Grade 5

Crackerjack Ale was quick to begin.  Atlas Anonymous was slow to begin.

Crackerjack Nath, Striking Gold and Hulking Moon collided approaching the first turn, checking
Crackerjack Nath and Striking Gold.  Renita Bale, Hulking Moon and Cette To Dance collided on the first
turn, checking Hulking Moon and severely checking Cette To Dance.  Crackerjack Nath and Cette To
Dance collided approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds.

Renita Bale underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have an abrasion to the left
stopper pad.  A seven day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Crackerjack Ale - the winner of the event.

Race 12
RACING HERE THURSDAY 24/10

(250+ RANK)
7:14 pm
410m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Black Lazarus and Speedy Scar collided approaching the first turn, checking Black Lazarus.  Dyna Yella,
Black Lazarus, Solar Mocha, Blue Vegas and Kentucky Sun collided on the first turn, checking Dyna Yella,
Solar Mocha and Blue Vegas; severely checking Black Lazarus.  Blue Vegas and Kentucky Sun collided
approaching the home turn.

A post-race sample was taken from Bereluke - the winner of the event.

Black Lazarus underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported. 

Meeting Comments:

Mepunga Sparkle – Field of 4, Distance 410m, Weight 28.0 kgs, Box 1, Placed 1st, Time Run 23:50,



Cleared, Comment: Cleared All Tracks




