
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sale
Sunday, 15 Sep 2019

Weather conditions: OVERCAST

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S. GILLESPIE

Stewards: I. KENNEDY / E. CLARKE

Judges: R. STEPHEN

Lure Drivers: B. HALLIGAN

Starter: N. ANDERSON

Kennel Supervisor: D. SHINGLES

Kennel Attendants: J. WALLBANK / L. SAUNDERS

Veterinarian: DR. CINDY HAYES

Race 1
FREE ACCESS ON SKY 2 TODAY!

5:32 pm
440m

Maiden

Harmony Hall and Mustered Courage collided soon after the start.  Rockette Lee galloped on the heels of
Any Luck on the first turn checking both greyhounds and also checking Cracked Soda.  As Iron Why
stumbled approaching the home turn and raced wide as a result. 

As Iron Why underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have bruising to the left hind
leg.  A 3 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
GEDDES MEATS

5:53 pm
520m

Maiden

Loufie and Flinders were quick to begin.  Dr. Gretchen, Dr. Braelyn and Dr. Jayla were slow to begin.  Your
Queen, Dr. Gretchen and Dr. Luna collided soon after the start checking Your Queen and Dr. Gretchen; Dr.
Gretchen stumbled as a result.  Dr. Braelyn and Dr. Jayla collided on the first turn checking both
greyhounds.  Loufie and Flinders collided in the back straight checking Flinders.

A post-race sample was taken from Loufie - the winner of the event.

Race 3
CARMODY'S SALE

6:12 pm
440m

Maiden

Minter Zoom and Scatterbox were quick to begin.  Lamotta was slow to begin.  Larkhill Pryor checked off
Lamotta approaching the first turn.  Lamotta and Bernmar Blue collided on the first turn.  Has The Power
checked off Scatterbox on the first turn.  Larkhill Pryor and Has The Power collided approaching the home
turn.  Larkhill Pryor raced wide on the home turn and in the home straight.

Race 4
LEWYZ QUALITY MEATS FINAL

6:32 pm
440m

Maiden Final

Aston Topaz crossed in soon after the start checking Spolly's Angel and Lots Of Chatter.  Spolly's Angel,
Major Minter and Lots Of Chatter collided approaching the first turn checking Spolly's Angel.  Spolly's
Angel, Dr. Rayna, She Wiggles and Bella Edition collided on the first turn checking Dr. Rayna and She
Wiggles, severely checking Bella Edition which lost ground and subsquently tailed off.  Major Minter and
She Wiggles raced wide in the home straight.

Bella Edition underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a left back muscle
injury.  A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race blood sample was taken from Aston Topaz - the winner of the event.

Race 5
BRUNTS PLANT HIRE (3-6 WINS) HT1

6:54 pm
440m

Restricted Win Heat

That Will Be checked off Off To Monaco soon after the start.  Big Bella checked off Off To Monaco
approaching the first turn.  So They Say, Off To Monaco and Tink collided on the first turn checking Off To
Monaco.  Having Words checked off High Kings on the first turn.  High Kings and Off To Monaco collided
approaching the home turn checking both greyhounds.  So They Say raced wide entering the home
straight.  Off To Monaco checked off High Kings entering the home straight.

Race 6
AUSSIE HOMELOANS TRARALGON

7:14 pm
440m

Free For All

Ichiban Fairy was quick to begin.  Perrie The Fairy checked off Ichiban Fairy soon after the start.  Ichiban
Fairy and Ishmy Barry collided approaching the first turn.  Monster Machine, Knock The Clock and Spotted
Panther collided on the first turn checking Spotted Panther.  Monster Machine and Knock The Clock
collided approaching the home turn.  Perrie The Fairy checked off Ichiban Fairy entering the home straight. 
Perrie The Fairy and Ishmy Barry collided in the home straight checking both greyhounds.  Spotted Panther
and Mepunga Bonnie collided in the home straight.



Race 7
KIERNAN HEAVY HAULAGE

7:34 pm
520m

Grade 5

An out of competition sample was taken from Minter Bee Cash on 11th September, 2019 pursuant to GAR
79A.

Piccolo Fratello was quick to begin.  Little Biddy checked off Nate's Awesome on the first turn.  Minter Bee
Cash, Hot Finish and Lightwood Lass collided on the first turn checking Minter Bee Cash and Soda
Flakes.  Piccolo Fratello and Nate's Awesome collided on the second turn.  Little Biddy checked off
Lightwood Lass entering the home straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Nate's Awesome - the winner of the event.

Race 8
RANFORDS FAMILY BUTCHER (3-6

WINS) HT2
7:59 pm
440m

Restricted Win Heat

An out of competition sample was taken from Grand Devinci on 11th September, 2019 pursuant to GAR
79A.

A pre-race sample was taken from Ishmy Lady.

Twice Blessed was quick to begin.  Master Zemnick was very slow to begin (2 lengths).  Party Mix, Ishmy
Lady and Grand Devinci collided approaching the first turn checking Ishmy Lady.  Party Mix and Grand
Devinci collided on the first turn checking Party Mix.  Party Mix and Ishmy Lady collided approaching the
home turn.  Early Promise raced wide on the home turn.

Race 9
FOODIES BUTCHERS SALE (1-3 WINS

250+)
8:17 pm
440m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from El Alegre.

Janiya Bale, El Alegre and Niall Bale collided approaching the first turn checking Janiya Bale.  El Alegre,
Aston Kenji and Cilla Gem collided approaching the home turn checking El Alegre and Cilla Gem, severely
checking Aston Kenji which fell.  Niall Bale and Idle Gem collided on the home turn checking both
greyhounds.  Janiya Bale, Go Tango and Idle Gem collided entering the home straight severely checking
Idle Gem checking Janiya Bale and Go Tango.  El Alegre and Idle Gem collided in the home straight
checking both greyhounds.  Janiya Bale and Go Tango collided in the home straight checking Janiya Bale.

Aston Kenji underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Race 10
GJ GARDNER HOMES

8:34 pm
520m

Free For All

Loaded checked off Degani soon after the start.  Degani checked off Muza's Angel on the first turn. 
Mepunga Billy raced wide on the second turn.  Muza's Angel and Hip Hippy Shake collided approaching
the home turn.  Mepunga Billy raced wide on the home turn.

Race 11
YES OPTUS

8:51 pm
440m

Grade 5

Ishmy Girl checked off Dr. Summer soon after the start.  Too Good Joog and Dr. Summer collided on the first
turn.  Audacious Poppy and Too Good Joog collided approaching the home turn checking both
greyhounds.  Uzzi Bale crossed to the outside on the home turn severely checking Dr. Summer and Dream
Gem; Dr. Summer raced wide as a result.  Too Good Joog galloped on Audacious Poppy entering the home
straight checking One More Light.  Audacious Poppy raced wide in the home straight.

Race 12
GIPPSLANDS GOLD 98.3 (250+ RANK)

9:09 pm
520m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Frost Us was quick to begin.  Urban Bourbon raced wide throughout the event.

Satisfactory Trials at Sale on 15th September 2019.

Payton - Field of 4, Distance 440m, Weight 27.6kgs, Box 1, Placed 1st,  Time Run 25.19.  Cleared All
Tracks.

Alberto - Field of 4, Distance 440m, Weight 29.8kgs, Box 8, Placed 2nd, Time Run 25.24.  Cleared All
Tracks.




