
STEWARD'S REPORT

Bendigo
Saturday, 31 Aug 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Pearce

Stewards: D.Conway & I.Taylor

Judges: T.Morrison

Lure Drivers: S. Baldwin

Starter: S.Manning

Kennel Supervisor: D. Pell

Kennel Attendants: A.Blake, C.Blake, G.Lemin, G.Moate & M. Pell

Veterinarian: Dr. S. Karamatic

Race 1
CHASERS FUNCTION CENTRE

5:52 pm
425m

Maiden

Winlock Player –New declared weight of 33.0kg, last raced at 31.7kg.

Kris Le Cashew and Winlock Player collided soon after the start checing Kris Le Cashew.  Nuclear Fusion
and Winlock Buttons collided approaching the first turn.  Dundee Jester galloped on the heels of Nuclear
Fusion on the first turn. Kris Le Cashew and Dundee Jester collided approaching the home turn.

Race 2
SOUTHERN CROSS AUSTEREO

6:10 pm
425m

Maiden

My Boy Winlock –New declared weight of 29.6kg, last raced at 28.5kg.

Aston Ultra was slow to begin. 

Aston Ultra, Dolce You Too and My Boy Winlock collided soon after the start checking Dolce You Too. 
Dundee Jazz, Double Drop and Tilson collided on the first turn checking Dundee Jazz and My Boy
Winlock.  Aston Ultra and Dolce You Too collided on the home turn forcing Dolce You Too to race wide as a
result.

Race 3
HIP POCKET BENDIGO

6:31 pm
425m

Grade 5

Spirit Bar was quick to begin.  Tye Me Over was slow to begin. 

Flying Jamaica and Dale's Jet collided soon after the start.  Jasper Beardly and Dale's Jet collided on the
first turn.

A sample was taken from Jasper Beardly - the winner of the event.

Race 4
BENDIGO ADVERTISER FINAL

6:51 pm
425m

Mixed 6/7 Final

Mepunga Isla, Rampant Loch, Raw Zeal and Make A Sound were slow to begin.

Mepunga Isla and Benchester collided approaching the first turn checking Quicker Than Joe.  Rampant
Loch checked off Raw Zeal approaching the first turn.  Make A Sound checked off Raw Zeal on the first
turn.

A sample was taken from Mandible - the winner of the event.

Race 5
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT1

7:09 pm
425m

Grade 5 Heat

Pure Cool Titan was slow to begin.

Bumble Bee Bolto checked off Perfect Rocky approaching the first turn.  Koenigsegg One checked off Pure
Cool Titan approaching the home turn.

Bumble Bee Bolto underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no apparent injury was reported.

Race 6
MANNINGS GREYHOUND COMPLEX

7:32 pm
425m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Zipping Magda.

Peta Allen was slow to begin.

Pat Malone, King Colt and Manila Kampyon collided soon after the start.  Awesome Shep and Bush
Blossom collided soon after the start.  King Colt and Awesome Shep collided approaching the first turn
checking Awesome Shep.  King Colt and Manila Kampyon collided approaching the home turn.



Race 7
AUSSIE INFRARED @ STUD

7:52 pm
500m

Grade 5

Lorenza was quick to begin.

Mi Roma, Nimble Foot, Hook Along Fyler and Why Not Maxine collided soon after the start checking Mi
Roma and Nimble Foot.  Hook Along Fyler checked off Why Not Maxine approachinbg the first turn.  Geller
Allen checked off Why Not Maxine approaching the first turn checking Nimble Foot.  Geller Allen and Mi
Roma collided approaching the home turn.

A sample was taken fro Hook Along Fyler - the winner of the event.

Race 8
JARROD LARKIN CONCRETING

8:16 pm
500m

Mixed 4/5

Cruisy's Rose was slow to begin.  Rixy Ya Pest checked off Just Love approaching the first turn.  Just Love
checked off Midnight Titan on the first turn checking Rixy Ya Pest.  Dewana Be Sure and Soda Crash
collided approaching the home turn checking Dewana Be Sure.

Just Love underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have shi soreness to the left
front leg.  A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 9
BENDIGO HEALTH (1-3 WINS)

8:42 pm
500m

Restricted Win

Cornhill Rebel was quick to begin. 

Dundee Spectre and Kid Callum collided soon after the start.  Miss Heart checked off Niall Bale
approaching the first turn.  Miss Heart checked off Dreamy Eyes on the first turn checking Miss Heart.  Miss
Heart checked off Ted's Dream on the home turn.  Kid Callum raced wide on the home turn.

Race 10
BILL WILKINSON OPTICAL

9:09 pm
425m

Mixed 6/7

Winlock Winner – New declared weight of 28.0kg, last raced at 26.9kg.

Fuel 'Em and Winlock Winner collided soon after the start checking Winlock Winner.  Misha Bale checked
off Alquist soon after the start.  Alquist checked off Schiavone approaching the first turn.  Alquist checked off
Dundee Joker approaching the first turn.  Schiavone checked off Dundee Joker on the first turn checking
Dundee Joker.  Alquist and Dundee Joker collided on the home turn.

A sample was taken fro Zulu Smoke - the winner of the event.

Race 11
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT2

9:24 pm
425m

Grade 5 Heat

Stewards fined Trainer, Mr Jeffrey Geall, the sum of $50.00 pursuant to GAR 31.3 for for arriving late to
present Max Tractor by the appointed kennelling time.

A pre-race sample was taken from Max Tractor.

Max Tractor and Fawn Regrets were slow to begin.  Shima Deal checked off Feikuai Donna approaching
the first turn.  Max Tractor checked off Diego Fernando on the first turn checking Feikuai Donna and Fawn
Regrets.

Race 12
AG TYRES & WHEELS

9:39 pm
425m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Cavernando.

Platelayer and Go Pappa Go were slow to begin.  

Through and Macs Model collided soon after the start checking Through.  Go Pappa Go and Short Leash
collided approaching the home turn checking Platelayer and Short Leash.  Winsome Fernando galloped
on the heels of Cavernando on the home turn checking Winsome Fernando.  Go Pappa Go and Winsome
Fernando collided in the home straight.

Meeting Comments:

Stewards conducted a check of Catchers' licenses in accordance with LR 16.2 and all were compliant with
the exception of Mr Samuel Webb who has been stood down from catching until such time that his licence
is renewed.




