
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Saturday, 03 Aug 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: B. Jinks

Stewards: C. Day & F. Mitiou

Judges: R. Drew & C.Miles

Lure Drivers: C. Chilcott

Starter: J. Mullavey

Kennel Supervisor: J. Hill

Kennel Attendants: J. Haigh, J. Porter & T. Varichione

Veterinarian: Dr M. Bell

Race 1
GET ON THE TAB AFL HALF TIME

SPECIAL
7:15 pm
525m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Hooked On You.

Wilbur Deeds and Foxy Molly were quick to begin.  Valita was slow to begin. 

South Of Eden, Hooked On You, Cawbourne Scar and Foxy Molly collided approaching the first turn,
checking Cawbourne Scar.  Cawbourne Scar, Foxy Molly, Manitoba and South Of Eden collided on the first
turn, checking all four greyhounds.  El Donberto and Cawbourne Scar collided approaching the second
turn, checking Cawbourne Scar, Manitoba and Foxy Molly.

Race 2
RSN - RACING & SPORT FINAL

7:38 pm
600m

Grade 5 Final

Appointed – Late scratching at 1.37pm when Trainer Mr B. Keel reported the greyhound to have a
laceration (GAR 23). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards will require a veterinary
certificate before any future nomination will be accepted. 

Ultimate Bling, Vanda Mick and Steinbrenner collided on the first turn.  Whitehart Magic, Steinbrenner,
Vanda Mick and Kraken Dust collided on the first turn, checking Vanda Mick, Kraken Dust, Steinbrenner
and Lochinvar Deus.  Kraken Dust and Lochinvar Deus collided on the second turn, checking both
greyhounds. 

A post-race sample was taken from True Detective - the winner of the event.

Race 3
WEST LALOR F.C OLDIES

7:57 pm
525m

Grade 5

Spring Bridge and Silver Cupcake were slow to begin. 

Spring Bridge brushed the running rail approaching the first turn.  Winsome Express, My Name's Barry and
Vital Force collided on the first turn, checking Winsome Express, Dyna Unther and Mepunga Maggie. 
Spring Bridge and Mepunga Maggie collided approaching the second turn, checking Spring Bridge.  Silver
Cupcake checked off Dyna Unther approaching the second turn.  Winsome Express and Vital Force
collided on the second turn, checking Winsome Express.  Spring Bridge galloped on Winsome Express
approaching the third turn, checking both greyhounds.  Vital Force and Dyna Unther collided on the third
turn, checking Dyna Unther.  Winsome Express and Spring Bridge collided on the home turn. 

Race 4
TAB MULTIPLIER FINAL

8:15 pm
525m

Grade 5 Final

Rockstar Steffi and Go Commando collided approachig the first turn, checking Go Commando.  Go
Commando and Callister collided approaching the first turn.  Kraken Lightening and Yindi Girl Turbo
collided on the first turn, checking Yindi Girl Turbo.  Curt Lee and Yindi Girl Turbo collided on the first turn. 
Broken Promise and Curt Lee collided on the second turn.  Callister checked off Rockstar Steffi on the
second turn.  Busy Bella, Yindi Girl Turbo and Callister collided approaching the third turn, checking Yindi
Girl Turbo and severely checking Callister. Busy Bella and Yindi Girl Yurbo collided on the third turn,
checking Yindi Girl Turbo. 

A post-race sample was taken from Kraken Lightening - the winner of the event.

Race 5
AFL HALF TIME SPECIAL

8:38 pm
525m

Free For All

Wise Lewis was slow to begin. 

Riley's Paige, Kinloch Moss and Winlock Dyno collided soon after the start.  Head Loch and Wise Lewis
collided soon after the start, checking Wise Lewis.  Dyna Romy, Riley's Paige, Kinloch Moss, Wonlock
Dyno and Wise Lewis collided approaching the first turn, checking Dyna Romy, Riley's Paige and Winlock
Dyno.  Dyna Aakil and He's For Me collided on the first turn, checking He's For Me.  Winlock Dyno and
Dyna Romy collided approaching the secong turn, checking Dyna Romy.  Wise Lewis and Kinloch Moss
collided on the second turn.  Head Loch and Dyna Aakil collided on the third turn, checking Dyna Aakil. 

Race 6 Orson Allen was quick to begin. 



VICTORIAN NATIONAL SPRINT
CHAMP. HT1

8:57 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Hone In and Crowdza Starring collided soon after the start, checking Crowdza Starring.  Reiko Ablett,
Snags Mckenzie, Zipping Magda and Lucy's Milo collided soon after the start.  Lucy's Milo, Zipping Magda,
Snags Mckenzie, Reiko Ablett and Crowdza Starring collided approaching the first turn, checking Reiko
Ablett, Snags Mckenzie and Crowdza Starring. Lucy's Milo and Zipping Magda collided on the first turn,
checking Lucy's Milo, Zipping Magda and Sweet As Emm.  Sweet As Emm and Snags Mckenzie collided
on the first turn.  Zipping Magda and Lucy's Milo collided on the first turn.  Lucy's Milo and Crowdza Starring
collided on the first turn, checking both greyhounds.  Crowdza Starring checked off Sweet As Emm
approaching the third turn, checking Lucy's Milo. 

A post-race sample was taken from Orson Allen - the winner of the event.

Race 7
HOME OF TEN GROUP 1'S

9:20 pm
600m

Mixed 4/5

Apex Within, Barry Bomber, Lektra Spring and Whoomph collided soon after the start, checking Barry
Bomber and Apex Within.  Lektra Spring and Whoomph collided on the first turn.  Apex Within checked ooff
Lektra Spring approaching the second turn.  Lektra Spring and Dyna Garner collided on the second turn. 
Apex Within and Whoomph collided on the second turn, checking Whoomph.  Apex Within and Dyna
Garner collided on the fourth turn, checking both greyhounds. 

Race 8
VICTORIAN NATIONAL SPRINT

CHAMP. HT2
9:42 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Dyna Patty and She's Gifted collided soon after the start.  Last Hurrah, Zipping Norton, Jaro Bale, Onions
O'Reilly, Sustain The Rage and She's Gifted collided approaching the first turn, checking Onions O'Reilly,
Jaro Bale and Zipping Norton.  Dyna Patty checked off Black Opium on the first turn.  Last Hurrah checked
off Jaro Bale approaching the second turn.  Zipping Norton checked off Last Hurrah in the back straight. 
Last Hurrah checked off Onions O'Reilly approaching the third turn.  Dyna Patty checked off Black Opium
entering the home straight. 

A post-race sample was taken from Black Opium - the winner of the event.

Race 9
FEIKUAI GREYHOUNDS

10:05 pm
525m

Grade 5

Atlantic Jewel was quick to begin.  Big Deal and Winlock Newbolt were slow to begin.  

Callum's Son and Dyna Zaylee collided soon after the start, checking both greyhounds.  Special Drop, Big
Deal and Winlock Newbolt collided soon after the start, checking Winlock Newbolt.  Callum's Son checked
off Winlock Newbolt entering the back straight.  Winlock Newbolt, Callum's Son and Head Banger collided
entering the home straight. 

Race 10
VIC NATIONAL DISTANCE NEXT

THURSDAY
10:23 pm

730m
Grade 5

Weetbix Jester and Annie Lava were slow to begin.  

Annie Lava raced wide approaching the second turn.

Race 11
SKY RACING (1-3 WINS)

10:42 pm
525m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from Saint Destructor.

Turanza Tiger was slow to begin. 

Lumen Natin crossed towards the running rail soon after the start, checking Gettin' Bale and Saint
Destructor.  Saint Destructor and Turanza Tiger collided on the first turn.  Lumen Nation, Sheriff Max and
For The Alliance collided approaching the second turn, checking For The Alliance.  Lumen Nation checked
off Sheriff Max entering the back straight.  Saint Destructor checked off Gettin' Bale on the third turn,
checking Turanza Tiger.  Sheriff Max and For The Alliance collided approaching the home turn. 

Race 12
RACING HERE THURSDAY (1-3 WINS)

10:57 pm
525m

Restricted Win

Miss Bellawood – New declared weight of 27.7kgs, last raced at 26.3kgs.

Roper River Jake, Philadelphia Pip and Adori collided soon after the start, checking Philadelphia Pip and
severely checking Adori. Roper River Jake, Abstract Miss and Oshkosh Nar collided approaching the first
turn, checking Abstract Miss and Oshkosh Nar.  Roper River Jake and Oshkosh Nar collided on the first
turn, checking Oshkosh Nar.  Oshkosh Nar and Philadelphia Pip collided entering the back straight,
checking Philadelphia Pip. 




