
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Wednesday, 21 Nov 2012

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
www.tab.com.au

12:14 pm
525m

Maiden

Pippa Shiraz was quick to begin.  Oscar Gucci and Not My Johnny were slow to begin.  Franklin Sun and
Sir Alfred collided soon after the start.  Bookkeeper crossed to the outside soon after the start checking
Good Old Merv.  Gold Old Merv checked off Oscar Gucci approaching the first turn.  Good Old Merv
checked off Sir Alfred on the first turn.  Sir Alfred checked off Not My Johnny approaching the second turn.
 Oscar Gucci checked off Bookkeeper in the back straight.  Sir Alfred and Not My Johnny collided on the
third turn checking both greyhounds.

Race 2
TOPCAT VIDEO (1-4 WINS) HT1

12:29 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Black Angus, Inspector Lynley and Galahad collided soon after the start checking Black Angus and
Inspector Lynley.  Sadler Allen, Whatta Joke, Dr. Ellise, Galahad and Laverne Lee collided on the first turn
checking Galahad and Laverne Lee.  Whatta Joke checked off Dr. Ellise approaching the second turn.
 Black Angus and Whatta Joke collided on the second turn.  Dr. Ellise and Galahad collided entering the
back straight.  Black Angus and Galahad collided approaching the third turn checking Black Angus.
 Inspector Lynley and Laverne Lee collided on the third turn.  Dr. Ellise and Black Angus collided several
times from the third turn to the home turn checking Black Angus.  Inspector Lynley and Laverne Lee
collided in the home straight.

Race 3
RSN (1-4 WINS) HT2

12:49 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Dr. Tye was a late scratching at 11:15am by Order of Stewards.

 

Dyna Gemma was slow to begin.  Super Imperior crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Bronny
Elim, Fadila Bale, Naomi Rose and Wild Conan.  Fugitive and Bronny Enlim collided approaching the first
turn.  Naomi Rose and Wild Conan collided approaching the first turn.  Fadila Bale and Super Imperior
collided on the first turn.  Bronny Enlim and Wild Conan collided on the home turn.

 

Naomi Rose was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 4
SCOTTY'S MEATS (1-4 WINS) HT3

1:04 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Bering Sea Gold, Whirl Machine and Crymelon Talon were slow to begin.  Bo Houdini, I'm A Thinker and
Yoda Bale collided soon after the start checking I'm A Thinker.  Cheap Rush and Yoda Bale collided
approaching the first turn and again on the first turn.  Bering Sea Gold, Bo Houdini and Clinical Finish
collided on the first turn.  Bering Sea Gold and Bo Houdini collided approaching the second turn checking
Bo Houdini, Clinical Finish and I'm A Thinker.  Bering Sea Gold and Whirl Machine collided in the back
straight.  Cheap Rush checked off Yoda Bale on the third turn.  Clinical Finish checked off Crymelon Talon
approaching the home turn.  

 

Stewards issued a warning to Mr D. Dawson, Trainer of Bo Houdini, regarding the greyhound's box
manners.

Race 5
HUDSON PACIFIC (1-4 WINS) HT4

1:24 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Rerod Roxy was quick to begin.  Pop Hand, Star Girl and Lomu were slow to begin.  Star Girl and Lomu
collided soon after the start.  Fiery Ann and Pop Hand collided soon after the start.  Star Girl crossed to the
rail soon after the start checking Pop Hand.  Fiery Ann, Hamilton Speed and Lomu collided approaching
the first turn.  Pop Hand and Star Girl collided approaching the first turn checking Pop Hand.  Rerod Roxy
and Mahlo Express collided on the first turn.  Hamilton Speed and Star Girl collided on the first turn and
again approaching the second turn checking Pop Hand and Hamilton Speed.  Fiery Ann checked off Rerod
Roxy on the second turn.  Hamilton Speed and Star Girl collided on the home turn checking Star Girl.



Race 6
GEOTECHNICAL LABORATORIES

1:39 pm
600m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Warranty and Miracle Dice were slow to begin.  Kellie Enlim, Azarenka and Miracle Dice collided soon after
the start and again approaching the first turn checking Warranty, Kellie Enlim, Azarenka and Miracle Dice.
 Azarenka and Miracle Dice collided on the second turn and again approaching the third turn checking
Miracle Dice.

 

Miracle Dice was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained soreness to the
left monkey muscle, left triangle and left hamstring, a 10 day stand down period was imposed.

 

A sample was taken from Ellen Bale, the winner of the event.

Race 7
AWM ELECTRICAL (1-4 WINS) HT5

1:59 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Rerod Rose was quick to begin and crossed to the rail soon after the start.  Dave Culprit was slow to begin.
 Messy Boots, Painted Miss and Elmer's Gift collided soon after the start.  Amram Allen, Messy Boots and
Painted Miss collided approaching the first turn.  Got To Go, Amram Allen, Messy Boots, Dave Culprit and
Painted Miss collided on the first turn checking Got To Go, Top Drama, Painted Miss, Dave Culprit and
Messy Boots.  Messy Boots checked off Got To Go on the second turn.  Dave Culprit and Top Drama
collided on the second turn.  Painted Miss and Top Drama collided on the third turn.  Amram Allen checked
off Dave Culprit on the third turn checking Messy Boots.  Amram Allen checked off Rerod Rose
approaching the home turn.

Race 8
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS

2:14 pm
525m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Raid The Bank was slow to begin.  Dale Bale, Allen Caston, Turkoglu and So Manic collided soon after the
start.  Dale Bale, Allen Caston and So Manic collided approaching the first turn checking Dale Bale and So
Manic.  Raid the Bank, Malvado and Dr. Aye Jay collided on the first turn.  Turkoglu checked off Allen
Caston approaching the second turn, severely checking So Manic, causing Turkoglu to stumble as a result.
 Dr. Aye Jay and Raid The Bank collided approaching the second turn and again in the back straight.

 

Turkoglu was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained soreness to the left
triangle muscle, a 5 day stand down period was imposed.

 

A sample was taken from Gunda Bale, the winner of the event.

Race 9
supermanatstud.com

2:34 pm
600m

Grade 5 No Penalty

Rebel Lane was quick to begin.  Like My Swagger, Lektra Rhianna, Surging Brianna, Top Dreams and
Rocken Boz collided on the first turn checking Surging Brianna, Top Dreams, Steve Allen and Rocken Boz.
 Effone and Like My Swagger collided on the first turn checking Like My Swagger.  Lektra Rhianna and
Steve Allen collided entering the back straight checking Lektra Rhianna.  Effone checked off Top Dreams in
the home straight.

Race 10
MACRO MEATS (1-4 WINS) HT6

2:49 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Amara Jane and Dr. Joydee were slow to begin and collided soon after the start.  Kent Bale, Sixteen
Candles, White Gold and Topolad collided soon after the start.  White Gold checked off Hot Mama Vibes
approaching the first turn.  Kent Bale and Topolad collided approaching the first turn.  White Gold and
Amara Jane collided approaching the first turn.  Topolad and Hot Mama Vibes collided on the first turn.
 Sixteen Candles and Hot Mama Vibes collided on the first turn.  Kent Bale checked off Creative Kiss on the
second turn checking Topolad.  Kent Bale, Sixteen Candles and Topolad collided in the back straight.  Dr.
Joydee checked off Amara Jane approaching the third turn checking White Gold.  Kent Bale and Hot Mama
Vibes collided on the third turn checking Hot Mama Vibes.  Amara Jane and Hot Mama Vibes collided
approaching the home turn.  Kent Bale checked off Sixteen Candles entering the home straight.

Race 11
LEPINE FUNERALS (1-4 WINS) HT7

3:09 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Stewards spoke with MGRA Kennel Attendant, Mr M. Noy, regarding his failure to correctly observe the
actual kennel number of the kennel ticket which allowed Dr. Kalessie to be retrieved in error.  Stewards
issued him with a warning regarding the incident.

 

Koolbaroo was slow to begin.  Zac Bale, Cruising Jessica and Gino Keeping collided soon after the start.
 Under The Holly and Honeypot Agogo collided soon after the start.  Dr. Kalessie and Zac Bale collided
approaching the first turn.  Dr. Kalessie, Zac Bale and Cruising Jessica collided approaching the first turn
checking Cruising Jessica.  Dr. Kalessie, Aussie Rebel, Zac Bale, Under The Holly, Honeypot Agogo and
Cruising Jessica collided on the first turn checking Under The Holly, Honeypot Agogo, Zac Bale and
Cruising Jessica.  Dr. Kalessie and Aussie Rebel collided approaching the second turn checking Aussie
Rebel.  Under The Holly and Cruising Jessica collided in the back straight.  Dr. Kalessie and Under The
Holly collided on the home turn checking both greyhounds.  Honeypot Agogo and Aussie Rebel collided
entering the home straight.

Race 12
AJS CORPORATION (1-4 WINS) HT8

3:25 pm
525m

Grade 5 Non Penalty Heat

Other Axle, Dongy and Elusive Sage were slow to begin.  Other Axle and Dongy collided approaching the
first turn.  Dongy checked off Bank On Holly on the first turn.  Other Axle and Dongy collided on the first turn
checking Other Axle.  Skylarker and Collin Bale collided on the second turn.  Dongy and Bank On Holly
collided on the home turn.






