
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Tuesday, 11 Dec 2018

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S.Bettess

Stewards: P. Searle & G. Bromley (A. Fewell)

Judges: N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: J. Haigh

Starter: J. Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: J. Nuredini

Kennel Attendants: I. Whitmill

Veterinarian: Dr N. Evans

Race 1
COME & JOIN BINGO THURS. (275+

RANK)
2:54 pm
400m

Maiden

Zafronic Trevor was slow to begin.

Blue Gene Bowie and Maximum Tiff collided on the first turn. Mitta Mitta and Maximum Tiff collided
approaching the home turn. Mitta Mitta and Zafonic Trevor collided approaching the home turn. Mitta Mitta
faded in the home straight.

Race 2
TTS ELECTRICS (275+ RANK)

3:19 pm
400m

Maiden

Skeeta Storm was slow to begin.

Amber's Dolly crossed to the inside soon after the start, checking Pure Cool Titan. Amber's Dolly eased,
veered out and collided with Pure Cool Titan on the home turn. Pure Cool Titan galloped on the heels of
Amber's Dolly on the home turn. Typical Bekim checked off Limburg Sprite on the home turn. Typical Bekim
and Amber's Dolly collided several times in the home straight.

Amber's Dolly was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
right triangle injury, a 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mr.G.Edwards, the trainer of Amber‘s Dolly regarding the greyhounds racing manners
on the home turn.  Amber's Dolly was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound
sustained injuries to the right triangle, a 14 day stand down period was imposed.  Acting under GAR 69(B)
(1), the stewards charged Amber's Dolly with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of
injury).  Mr Edwards pleaded not guilty to the charge, Amber's Dolly was found guilty and stewards directed
that the greyhound perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks) pursuant to GAR 69(B)(1)(a), before any future
nomination will be accepted.

Race 3
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

(275+ RANK)
3:42 pm
400m

Grade 7

Almendra was quick to begin. Travel Easy was slow to begin.

Sky Rising and Dyna Jules collided soon after the start. Sky Rising and Dyna Jules collided approaching
the first turn. Almendra and Sky Rising collided on the first turn, checking Dyna Jules and Almendra which
lost ground as a result. Sky Rising and Travel Easy collided approaching the home turn, causing Sky
Rising to race wide. Dyna Jules and Madonya collided entering the home straight. Madonya checked off
the heels of Sirius Matters in the home straight. Sirius Matters and Dyna Jules collided in the home straight.

Race 4
MILLERS MUZZLES (0-2 WINS 275+

RANK)
4:02 pm
460m

Restricted Win

A pre race sample was taken from Miss Zok Dee.

Electric Hippy and Graphic Print were quick to begin. Telegraph Road, Teacup Toni and Barcia Houdini
were slow to begin. 

Muzzle Welsh and Telegraph Road collided soon after the start. Electric Hippy checked off the heels of
Graphic Print on the first turn. Miss Zok Dee and Barcia Houdini collided on the first turn. Electric Hippy and
Barcia Houdini collided approaching the home turn. Muzzle Welsh and It Is Done collided approaching the
home turn. Electric Hippy checked off Barcia Houdini twice on the home turn. Teacup Toni checked off It Is
Done on the home turn. It Is Done checked off Muzzle Welsh in the home straight.

Race 5
NARDI PRODUCE (275+ RANK)

4:24 pm
460m

Grade 5

Dorothy Dawn was a late scratching at 14:38 due to weight variation (GAR 39). A 10 day stand down
period was imposed. Trainer Mr K. Kelly was fined the sum of $100.

Urana Smacko was quick to begin.

Dontron and Taylor Bale collided soon after the start. Urana Smacko and Leeroy Rox collided soon after
the start. Urana Smacko checked off the heels of Bowon Approach on the first turn. Dontron checked off the
heels of Taylor Bale on the first turn. Bowon Approach, Tayor Bale, Urana Smacko and Leeroy Rox collided
in the home straight.



Stewards spoke to Mr. L. Mallia, the trainer of Urana Smacko, regarding the length of time taken in the
boxing of his greyhound, prior to the starting of the event. Stewards noted Mr. Mallia's explanation and
issued a warning to him that he is to box his greyhounds in a more timely manner, in future events.

Race 6
JIMS MOWING - GEELONG (275+

RANK)
4:49 pm
460m

Grade 5

Cruising Stella was quick to begin. Spring Ace was slow to begin.

Dodge An' Steele and She's Fabtastic collided on the first turn. Dodge An' Steele checked off the heels of
She's Fabtastic on the first turn. Spring Ace checked off the heels of Monaro Joe on the first turn. Dodge An'
Steele checked off the heels of Monaro Joe on the home turn.

Race 7
PET PANELS.COM.AU (275+ RANK)

5:09 pm
400m

Grade 5

A  pre race sample was taken from Zipping Boyd.

Architecture and On Billy's Wings were quick to begin. Zipping Boyd and Gunmetal Liam were slow to
begin.

Little Big Shot and Wolf Point collided soon after the start. Wolf Point and Zipping Boyd collided on the first
turn. Line Trike checked off the heels of On Billy's Wings on the first turn. On Billy's Wings and Mrs. Jawa
collided approaching the home turn. Line Trike galloped on the heels of Mrs. Jawa approaching the home
turn. Line Trike and Gunmetal Liam collided approaching the winning post.

A sample was taken from Little Big Shot - the winner of the event.

Race 8
OUTLINE PRINT DESIGN (275+ RANK)

5:28 pm
460m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Darren Allen.

Cool Coco and Maximum Jan collided approaching the first turn, checking Maximum Jan. Micky Rads and
Dyna Bobbi collided on the first turn checking Micky Rads. Maximum Jan checked off the heels of Micky
Rads entering the home straight. 

Stewards noted that the muzzle of Maximum Jan became dislodged during the running of the event.

Race 9
BURNS ARCHER REALTY (2-3 WINS

275+ RANK)
5:48 pm
400m

Restricted Win

A pre race sample was taken from Fairytale Ending.

Merl's Blaze was quick to begin. Monoak was slow to begin. 

Lucky Omar and Deep Creek Girl collided soon after the start. Trouble Brewing, Don Quixote, Merl's Blaze
and Fairytale Ending collided on the firstt turn checking Trouble Brewing and Merl's Blaze. Don Quixote,
Lucky Omar and Fairytale Ending collided approaching the home turn, checking Lucky Omar. Monoak
checked off the heels of Fairytale Ending on the home turn. 

Race 10
MERV JENNINGS SIGNS (275+ RANK)

6:07 pm
400m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Disco Lemonade.

Goorawin, Disco Lemonade and Sub Zero Magic were quick to begin. 

Don's Just Under faulted and tailed off soon after the start, due to injury. Goorawin and Disco Lemonade
collided approaching the home turn. Spring Kitty checked off Disco Lemonade approaching the home turn.

Don's Just Under was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
the left gracilis muscle, a 60 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 11
TAB MULTIPLIER (275+ RANK)

6:27 pm
400m

Grade 5

Cavalry Rose was a late scratching at 14.33 on the advice of the Club’s Veterinary Surgeon due to
dehydration and an elevated temperature. A three day stand down period was imposed.

A pre race sample was taken from Miami Fernando.

Super Stoked was quick to begin. Angel Of Glory was slow to begin.

Shining Opal and Miami Fernando collided several times soon after the start. Jellybean Jess and Miami
Fernando collided approaching the home turn.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Hayley's Style trialled over the 400M from box 1, weight 27.2kg, the greyhound
was placed third in a field of 4. The time of the trial was 22:89 the greyhound was beaten a margin of 1L.
Hayley's Style was Cleared. 

Lightning Ben trialled over the 400M from box 8, weight 33.9kg the greyhound was placed 4 in a field of 4.
The time of the trial was 22:89, the greyhound beaten by a margin of 1L. Lightning Ben was Cleared. 




