
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sandown Park
Thursday, 04 Apr 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Blackmore

Stewards: B. Jinks, D. Barber,I. Kennedy, L. Fahry & M. Lowe

Judges: L. Gough & J. Barlow

Lure Drivers: T. Adamson

Starter: G. Johnson

Kennel Supervisor: C. Johnson

Kennel Attendants: B. Cooper, B. Chapman & P. Skerret

Veterinarian: Dr. K. Nagaich

Race 1
LAUNCHING PAD HT1

7:07 pm
515m

S/E Heat

Samples were taken from Courting and Top Gem at the Trainer’s kennels earlier today.

Top Gem was slow to begin.

Prince Planet, Leon Bale, Vivatar, Courting and Riley's Paige collided soon after the start.  Prince Planet,
Leon Bale and Vivatar collided approaching the first turn checking Leon Bale.  Federal Impact, Prince
Planet, Vivatar and Riley's Paige collided on the first turn checking Vivatar and Courting.  Courting checked
off Leon Bale approaching the home turn.  

Federal Impact underwent a post-race veterinary examination and no apparent injury could be detected. 

Federal Impact – Warning issued for race manners entering the home straight and in the home straight.

Stewards spoke to the trainer of Prince Planet and issued a warning after failing to follow the starters
direction to ensure that the greyhounds are placed in the boxes in the correct order.  GAR 51(10)(a). 

A post-race sample was taken from Tauwitchere - winner of the event. 

Race 2
LAUNCHING PAD HT2

7:25 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Aston Vanquish at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today.

Embossed, Aston Vanquish and More Donuts were slow to begin.

Duke Of Airly checked off Dyna Unther on the first turn checking Embossed and Prancing Turbo.  Duke Of
Airly and Embossed collided apporaching the second turn checking Duke Of Airly and severely checking
Embossed.  More Donuts checked off Aston Vanquish on the second turn.  Duke Of Airly and Embossed
collided on the third turn.  Prancing Turbo checked off Embossed entering the home straight.  

A post-race sample was taken from Say Hi - winner of the event.  

Race 3
LAUNCHING PAD HT3

7:43 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Premier Sticka at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today. 

Premier Sticka, Ma's Plum Jam, Ask Me Now, Zipping Norton and He's For Me collided soon after the start
checking Ma's Plum Jam, Zipping Norton and severely checking Ask Me Now.  Premier Sticka and He's For
Me collided on the first turn.  Ma's Plum Jam and Zipping Norton collided on the first turn.  Lucy's Milo and
Charging Yaala collided approaching the second turn.  Lilywhites and Ma's Plum Jam collided
approaching the second turn causing Ma's Plum Jam and Zipping Norton to collide, severely checking both
greyhounds.  Lilywhites checked off Premier Sticka on the third turn checking He's For Me.  

A post-race sample was taken from Lucy's Milo - winner of the event.  

Race 4
LAUNCHING PAD HT4

8:07 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Jokare at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today. 

Lektra Spring and Flynn were quick to begin.

Jokare and Broken Promise collided soon after the start.  Premium Share and Global Impact collided
approaching the first turn checking Global Impact.  Western Envoy, Jokare and Broken Promise collided
approaching the first turn checking Jokare.  Premium Share and Western Envoy collided on the first turn
checking Western Envoy and Global Impact.  Premium Share checked off Broken Promise on the second
turn checking Western Envoy and Global Impact.  Western Envoy and Broken Promise collided entering
the home straight.  

A post-race sample was taken from Double Back - winner of the event. 

Race 5
SPEED STAR - MAY 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Kraken Dust.

Lagoon Pirate and Big Sam Marjen were slow to begin.



8:25 pm
515m

Grade 5

Blistering Betty and Lagoon Pirate collided soon after the start checking both greyhounds.  Blistering Betty
checked Okay Kirsty approaching the first turn.  Kraken Dust and Extreme Summer collided approaching
the first turn.  Okay Kirsty and Big Sam Marjen collided approaching the second turn.  Extreme Summer
and Lagoon Pirate collided approaching the second turn checking Lagoon Pirate.  Extreme Summer
checked off Lagoon Pirate on the second turn.  Okay Kirsty checked off Big Sam Marjen entering the back
straight.  Kraken Dust and Big Sam Marjen collided on the third turn.  

A post-race sample was Emerald Rainbow - winner of the event.  

Race 6
EASTER KIDS FUN - APRIL 18

8:43 pm
515m

Free For All

A pre-race sample was taken from Degani.

Jesaulenko was quick to begin.  Bush Song, Sky Wesley and Onions O'Reilly were slow to begin.

Bush Song and Sky Wesley collided soon after the start.  Shanlyn Georgie, Fifty Dollar, Counting Pennies
and Degani collided soon after the start checking Fifty Dollar and Bush Song.  Counting Pennies and Sky
Wesley collided on the first turn and again on the second turn.  Bush Song and Sky Wesley collided in the
back straight.  Counting Pennies checked off Shanlyn Georgie in the home straight. 

Race 7
LAUNCHING PAD HT5

9:07 pm
515m

S/E Heat

Dolly Mac – Not raced for in excess of 3 months and is returning to racing from a right scapula injury.

Priority Pass was quick to begin.  

Dolly Mac and Spearhead collided soon after the start.  Lightning Blast, Spearhead, Dolly Mac and Lava
You Beauty collided approaching the first turn checking Spearhead.  Priority Pass, Lava You Beauty,
Lightning Blast and Origami Angel collided on the first turn checking Spearhead, Lightning Blast, Origami
Angel and severely checking Priority Pass and Lava You Beauty, Priority Pass stumbled and lost ground as
a result.  Jaro Bale and Sennachie collided on the second turn checking both greyhounds.  Origami Angel
checked off Sennachie entering the back straight.  Spearhead and Origami Angel collided in the back
straight.  Lightning Blast checked off Sennachie on the home turn.  

Priority Pass underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a laceration and spike
wounds to the left and right hinds. No Stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Dolly Mac - winner of the event. 

Race 8
RACING HERE ANZAC DAY EVE -

WED. 24/4
9:25 pm
595m

Mixed 4/5

A sample was taken from It's A Frenzy at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today. 

A pre-race sample was taken from Slinky Inky.

Water Colour was slow to begin.

It's A Frenzy, Dewana Special, Water Colour, and Waleonjon collided soon after the start checking Water
Colour. Sisco Ride, Dyna Chancer and Waleonjon collided on the first turn. Sisco Ride and Dyna Chancer
collided entering the front straight. It's A Frenzy and Dewana Special collided entering the front straight and
again in the front straight checking both greyhounds. Dyna Chancer and Waleonjon collided on the second
turn. It's A Frenzy checked off Ash Star on the second turn. Sisco Ride checked off Waleonjon entering the
back straight. It's A Frenzy raced wide in the back straight. Slinky Inky checked off Dewana Special on the
fourth turn checking Sisco Ride, causing It's A Frenzy to fall. Ash Star and Waleonjon collided approaching
the home turn. 

It's A Frenzy underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have injuries to both deltoids,
both pencil muscles and spikes wound to both hind legs. A 10 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Dyna Chancer - the winner of the event. 

Race 9
LAUNCHING PAD HT6

9:49 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Street Outlaw and Curt Lee at the Trainer’s kennels earlier today. 

Chiquita Lass and Dyna Quail were quick to begin. Bit Flash and Snags McKenzie collided soon after the
start. Riddles, Keeper Of Keys and Street Outlaw collided soon after the start. Dyna Quail and Keeper Of
Keys collided on the first turn checking Dyna Quail. Riddles and Keeper Of Keys collided on the second
turn. 

Race 10
LAUNCHING PAD HT7

10:07 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Valencia Gem at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today. 

Ashby Nimble and Aeroplane Tippa were slow to begin.

Ashby Nimble and Red Rock collided soon after the start. Red Rock and Fancy Francene collided on the
second turn. Aston Peregrine and Kiss Me Linda collided entering the home straight checking both
greyhounds. Red Rock raced wide in the home straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Red Rock - the winner of the event. 

Race 11
LAUNCHING PAD HT8

10:28 pm
515m

S/E Heat

A sample was taken from Showgirl Queen at the Trainer’s kennel earlier today. 

Curnow Keats was quick to begin. 

Seal The Deal and Max Tractor collided soon after the start. Rockstar Prince and Olson Bale collided soon
after the start. Olson Bale, Showgirl Queen and Max Tractor collided on the first turn checking Showgirl
Queen, Max Tractor and Red Hot Chevy, Max Tractor raced wide as a result. Showgirl Queen and Red Hot
Chevy collided approaching the second turn checking Showgirl Queen and Max Tractor, Red Hot Chevy



fell as a result. Curnow Keats checked off Seal The Deal on the third turn.

Red Hot Chevy underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have injuries to both
deltoids and both trapezius muscles. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race sample was taken from Seal The Deal - the winner of the event.

Race 12
FOLLOW US @sandowndogs (250+)

FINAL
10:43 pm

515m
Grade 5 Final

An out of competition sample was taken from Winlock Blueboy on 2 April 2019 pursuant to GAR 79A.

A pre-race sample was taken from Soda Kid.

Winlock Blue Boy, Unique Quality and Rockin' Joe were slow to begin. Soda Kid and Joanie's Johnny
collided approaching the first turn. High Tenacity, Soda Kid, Winlock Blue Boy and Unique Quality collided
on the first turn checking Soda Kid. Unique Quality and Rockin' Joe collided approaching the second turn.
Joanie's Johnny and Yaala Eclipse collided approaching the second turn. Joanie's Johnny and Winlock
Blue Boy collided on the third turn checking Joanie's Johnny, Yaala Eclipse, High Tenacty and Rockin' Joe.
Soda Kid checked off Winlock Blue Boy approaching the home turn checking Winlock Blue Boy. Rockin'
Joe raced wide entering the home straight. Winlock Blue Boy checked off Romany Girl entering the home
straight and crossed out, checking High Tenacity. 

A sample was taken from Unique Quality - the winner of the event. 




