
STEWARD'S REPORT

Horsham
Tuesday, 18 Dec 2018

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: J Rea

Stewards: M Blood, D Conway & P Watson

Judges: T Lockwood

Lure Drivers: R Hamilton

Starter: N Bergen

Kennel Supervisor: D Hodgetts

Kennel Attendants: J O'Neil & S Jennings

Veterinarian: Dr C Finlayson

Race 1
CRYMELON KENNELS

3:47 pm
410m

Maiden

Josie's Entity was quick to begin.  Two Shadows was slow to begin.  Lucina Motief and Monrovia collided
soon after the start, checking Lucina Motief.  Senor Diego and Princess Pulse collided approaching the first
turn, checking Princess Pulse.  Josie's Entity, Princess Pulse and Spot The Ghost collided on the first turn,
checking Princess Pulse.  Senor Diego and Monrovia collided entering the home straight, checking Senor
Diego.

A sample was taken from Our Rock Man - the winner of the event.

Race 2
WIMMERA AQUATRAIL (0-1 WIN)

4:07 pm
410m

Restricted Win

Crymelon Victory was quick to begin.  Kurtis Pandora, Almani Tee Rex and Black Sharday collided
approaching the first turn, checking Kurtis Pandora and Almani Tee Rex.  Black Sharday, Crymelon Victory
and Nellie Shan collided on the first turn, checking Crymelon Victory.  Black Sharday and Nellie Shan
collided approaching the home turn and again on the home turn, checking Nellie Shan.  Nellie Shan and
Crymelon Victory collided in the home straight, checking Crymelon Victory. Kurtis Pandora tired in the
home straight.

Race 3
GREYHOUND ADOPTION PROGRAM

4:22 pm
410m

Mixed 6/7

Titanium Bolt was a late scratching at 3:14 pm on the advice of the Club’s Veterinary Surgeon, due to
illness.  A seven day stand down period was imposed.

Hurricane Rose was quick to begin.  Aston Lily and Crymelon Phantom collided soon after the start,
checking Crymelon Phantom.  Kraken Roger and Cindy's Mate collided on the first turn, checking Kraken
Roger.  Aston Lily and Cindy's Mate collided approaching the home turn, checking Aston Lily and
Crymelon Phantom.  Crymelon Phantom and Kraken Roger collided entering the home straight, checking
Kraken Roger.  Hurricane Rose raced wide entering the home straight.

Race 4
3WM/MIXX FM HT1

4:42 pm
410m

Grade 5 Heat

Tiggerlong Zorro was quick to begin.  Fabelite and Half A Minya collided approaching the first turn,
checking Fabelite.  Tiggerlong Zorro and Militant Spirit collided approaching the first turn, checking
Tiggerlong Zorro.  You Never Know checked off Aston Milla approaching the home turn.  Fabelite and
Militant Spirit raced wide on the home turn.  Militant Spirit and Half A Minya collided in the home straight,
checking Half A Minya.

You Never Know was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained a right
hindleg triangle injury, a 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Mr Ken Hunt, trainer of Militant Spirit which lead before racing wide, explained that it was the greyhound's
first outing at Horsham and in his opinion would benefit from the experience.  Militant Spirit was vetted
following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

A sample was taken from Aston Milla - the winner of the event.

Race 5
CHS GROUP (1-4 WINS)

4:57 pm
485m

Restricted Win

Southwood Ace, Liberal Nunnio and Agent Barry were slow to begin.  Blue Espearance and All Inn
Houston collided approaching the first turn, checking All Inn Houston.  All Inn Houston, Southwood Ace
and Liberal Nunnio collided approaching the first turn, checking All Inn Houston, Southwood Ace and
Agent Barry.  Blue Espearance, Beaut Deeds and Selfless collided approaching the home turn, checking
Beaut Deeds and Blue Espearance.  Blue Espearance and Selfless collided in the home straight, checking
Blue Espearance.

Race 6
GRV VIC BRED SERIES (1-4 WINS)

FINAL

Bob's Brew and Shark Tank were slow to begin.  Aston Aniston was very slow to begin (3L).  Black Treasure
and Bob's Brew collided approaching the first turn, checking Bob's Brew.  Black Treasure, I'm Tipping Don
and Flying Smart collided on the first turn, checking I'm Tipping Don and Wok Fried Yabby.  Flying Smart



5:17 pm
485m

Restricted Win Final

and You Rippa Pippa collided approaching the home turn.  I'm Tipping Don and Flying Smart collided
entering the home straight, checking Flying Smart and You Rippa Pippa.  Shark Tank and Black Treasure
collided several times approaching the winning post.

A sample was taken from Shark Tank - the winner of the event.

Race 7
THE WEEKLY ADVERTISER

5:36 pm
410m

Mixed 4/5

Avatar Maximus was slow to begin.  Kraken Lightning, Ark Lightning, Spin That Wheel and Seabrook Indi
collided on the first turn, checking Avatar Maximus, Ark Lightning and Seabrook Indi.  Avatar Maximus and
Kraken Lightning collided approaching the home turn, checking Kraken Lightning and Seabrook Indi.

Kraken Lightning was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained a right
hindleg quadriceps injury, a 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Ark Lightning was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained a left foreleg
spike wound, a 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 8
WILKIE COURIERS PTY LTD

5:59 pm
485m

Mixed 4/5

Ace Ventura was slow to begin.  Ok Jake, Con Rod and Quick Finance collided soon after the start,
checking Ok Jake.  Arcup Usain checked off Flying Danger approaching the first turn.  Mr Uggboot, Quick
Finance and Flying Danger collided on the first turn, checking Mr Uggboot, Quick Finance and Arcup
Usain.  Bella Express, Arcup Usain and Ok Jake raced wide entering the home straight.

Race 9
TOPCAT VIDEO HT2

6:19 pm
410m

Grade 5 Heat

Big Flash Marjen and Rapana collided approaching the first turn, checking Rapana.  Rapana, Kraken
Forest and Iceni Skye collided on the first turn, checking Kraken Forest, Iceni Skye and Mr Perfect.  Rapana
and Zipping Buster collided approaching the home turn, checking Zipping Buster.  Big Flash Marjen raced
wide in the home straight.  Iceni Skye and Zipping Buster collided in the home straight.

A sample was taken from Big Flash Marjen - the winner of the event.

Race 10
ON-SITE ENGINEERING HT3

6:37 pm
410m

Grade 5 Heat

Silver Cupcake was quick to begin.  Hilux and On Billy's Wings collided soon after the start, checking On
Billy's Wings.  Mayor Digby crossed the rail on the first turn, checking Militant Mack and Aston Frankel. 
Bank Rogue checked off Aston Frankel on the first turn, checking Hilux, On Billy's Wings and Silver
Cupcake.  Hilux checked off Bank Rogue approaching the home turn.

A sample was taken from Mayor Digby - the winner of the event.

Race 11
RACING HERE THURSDAY HT4

6:54 pm
410m

Grade 5 Heat

Dimora Bekim was quick to begin.  Rayza's Gadget, Awesome Shep and Amigo Two collided soon after the
start, checking Rayza's Gadget and Amigo Two.  Dimora Bekim and Cherokee Shimmer collided on the first
turn, checking Dimora Bekim.  Rayza's Gadget checked off Dimora Bekim approaching the home turn.

Dimora Bekim was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

A sample was taken from Dewana Sprite - the winner of the event.h




