
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sandown (SAP)
Sunday, 24 Feb 2019

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: D. Barber

Stewards: I. Kennedy, G.Truett & D Conway

Judges: J. Barlow & L. Gough

Lure Drivers: T. Adamson

Starter: S.Cowling

Kennel Supervisor: C. Johnson

Kennel Attendants: C. Archilbald & B. Chapman

Veterinarian: Dr. J. Rossi

Race 1
LAUNCHING PAD TIX ON SALE!

1:47 pm
515m

Maiden

Stewards spoke to Mr B. Divirgilio, the representative of Nothin' To Lose regarding the length of time the
greyhound has had between races.  Nothin' To Lose last raced on 30th September 2019. Mr Divirgilio
stated that the greyhound was resuming from a spell.

A pre-race sample was taken from Horus Blue.

Figure Eight was quick to begin.  Nothin' To Lose, Lady Oracle and Horus Blue were slow to begin.

Mr. Fabulous and Lady Oracle collided approaching the first turn.  Figure Eight and Lady Oracle collided on
second turn checking Figure Eight.  Figure Eight and Mr. Fabulous collided approaching the third turn
severely checking Figure Eight.  Mr. Fabulous faltered on the third turn and pulled up.

Mr. Fabulous was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the
right wrist, right shoulder and right biceps, a 60 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
LAUNCHING PAD HEATS 4/4

2:07 pm
515m

Mixed 6/7

A pre-race sample was taken from Hot Finish.

Macs Road, Annabelle Lee and Saint West were quick to begin.

Saint West crossed to the outside soon after the start checking Grace Ali and Blue Glitter.  Saint West raced
wide in the front straight.  Hot Finish and Mr. Vinnie collided on the first turn checking Mr. Vinnie and Blue
Glitter.  Saint West raced wide in the back straight.  Hot Finish and Mr. Vinnie collided on the third turn
checking Mr. Vinnie.  Macs Road checked off Grace Ali on the third turn checking Blue Glitter.

A post-race sample was taken from Saint West - the winner of the event.

Race 3
DOWNLOAD THE TAB APP (1-3W)

(250+RK) HT1
2:33 pm
515m

Restricted Win Heat

A pre-race sample was taken from Yuken Merry.

Invictus Coco was quick to begin.  Midnight Marzy, Modern Jagger and Yuken Merry were slow to begin.

Misty's Boy, Lightning Blast and Stevie Dee collided soon after the start checking Misty's Boy and Lightning
Blast.  Jim's Hotel and Misty's Boy collided on the first turn checking Jim's Hotel.  Lightning Blast and Stevie
Dee collided approaching the second turn checking Lightning Blast.  Lightning Blast checked off Stevie
Dee on the second turn.  Misty's Boy and Midnight Marzy collided on the thrd turn checking Midnight
Marzy.  Jim's Hotel checked off Misty's Boy on the home turn.  

Race 4
ACCELL THERAPY (1-3 WINS)

(250+RANK) HT2
2:51 pm
515m

Restricted Win Heat

Mayhem Express was quick to begin. 

Unique Quality and Unsound Mind collided soon after the start checking Unique Quality.  Unique Quality
checked off Liberal Nunnio entering the back straight.  Liberal Nunnio checked off Mayhem Express
approaching the third turn.  Unique Quality checked off Unsound Mind in the home straight checking
Liberal Nunnio.  Angry Trip and Unsound Mind collided approaching the winning the post.

A post-race sample was taken from Liberal Nunnio - the winner of the event.

Race 5
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT1

3:08 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Mr J. Bosnich, trainer of Give Away King declared a new weight of 31.4kg for the greyhound in accordance
with GAR 39(2). Give Away King last raced at 32.6kg.

A pre-race sample was taken from Give Away King.

Molly Coaster and Apex Within were slow to begin.  

Start A Riot stumbled soon after the start.  No Excuse crossed in on the first turn checking Start A Riot and
Benny's Entity.  Benny's Entity and Start A Riot collided approaching the second turn checking both
greyhounds.  Benny's Entity crossed in approaching the third turn causing Give Away King to gallop on
Benny's Entity.  



Race 6
SECURE RACING LOGISTICS

3:28 pm
515m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Manny Allen.

Zipping Amy was quick to begin.  Spazzy Blue, Creative Playboy and Kissable were slow to begin.

Scooby Boy and Jessie's Star collided on the first turn checking Jessie's Star and Creative Playboy.  Manny
Allen and Back Ya Self collided in the back straight.  Zipping Amy and Manny Allen collided on the home
turn.  

Race 7
GIDDY-UP (NO CITY WINS) GDR

3:51 pm
715m

Grade 5

Aston Atley and Kraken Katie were quick to begin.  Don't Trust was slow to begin.  

Don't Trust and Rockin' Joe collided soon after the start.  Don't Trust and Rockin' Joe collided on the first
turn checking Rockin' Joe.

A post-race sample was taken from Kraken Katie - the winner of the event.

Race 8
sandowngreyhounds.com.au

4:16 pm
515m

Mixed 4/5

Slinky Inky was quick to begin.  He Shall Johnny was slow to begin.

Zipping Chaser checked off Slinky Inky soon after the start.  Slinky Inky and Cyril Figgis collided on the first
turn checking Cyril Figgis.  Cyril Figgis checked off Dyna Reaver entring the back straight.

A post-race sample was taken from Black Signature - the winner of the event.

Race 9
SECURE RACING LOGISTICS

4:37 pm
595m

Mixed 4/5

Bush Song and Miss Innings were quick to begin.

Sisco Ride checked off Fire And Smoke on the first turn.  Bush Song and Miss Innings collided in the back
straight checking Bush Song, Miss Innings and Vixstar.  Bush Song contacted the running rail approaching
the third turn and lost ground.

Bush Song was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

A post-race sample was taken from Sisco Ride - the winner of the event.

Race 10
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT2

4:52 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Grey Ghost was slow to begin.

Grey Ghost and Wharfies Girl collided soon after the start checking Grey Ghost.  Grey Ghost checked off
Wharfies Girel on the first turn.  Miss Pepperjack and Calendar Boy colllide on the first turn checking Miss
Pepperjack, Wharfies Girl, Ask Me Now and Ides Of Jebrynah.  Miss Pepperjack and Ides Of Jebrynah
collided on the second turn checking Miss Pepperjack, Ask Me Now and Ides Of Jebrynah.  Miss
Pepperjack checked off Wharfies Girl entering the back straight.  Extreme Summer and Ask Me Now
collided in the home straight.

Race 11
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT3

5:16 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Bingo Boon was slow to begin.

Mick's Advice and New Samsation collided soon after the start.  New Samsation and Busy Bella collided
several times approaching the first turn checking both greyhounds.  Mick's Advice and Newfire Drewie
collided on the first turn checking Mick's Advice.  New Samsation and Busy Bella collided approaching the
second turn and on the second turn checking Busy Bella.  Newfire Drewie galloped on Bingo Boon
approaching the third turn.  Superior Faith raced wide on the third turn and on the home turn.  

Race 12
GRV VIC BRED SERIES HT4

5:36 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

A pre-race sample was taken from Max Tractor.

Speedy Ryder was slow to begin.

Max Tractor crossed out approaching the first turn checking Red Queen and Head Loch.  Cosmic Ollie and
Zianna Rose collided approaching the second turn checking Zianna Rose.  Speedy Ryder checked off
Head Loch on the second turn checking Cosmic Ollie.  Cosmic Ollie, Zianna Rose and Speedy Ryder
collided in the back straight checking Speedy Ryder and severely checking Zianna Rose.




