
STEWARD'S REPORT

Warrnambool
Thursday, 08 Nov 2018

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: M Blood

Stewards: P. Searle, G. Rea & P. Watson

Judges: T. O'Neill

Lure Drivers: N. Kenna

Starter: G. McLeod

Kennel Supervisor: C. Sinnott

Kennel Attendants: H. Lucas

Veterinarian: Dr. D. Colson/Dr. J. Doumtsis

Race 1
NORFOLK BUTCHERS

6:14 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7

Mr. Jai Willoughby was fined the sum of $50 for failing to ensure the registration papers/registration card
were produced for the greyhound She's A Mitzi pursuant to GAR 33.

Blue Bar Pie was quick to begin. Cawbourne Mav and Avatar Maximus were slow to begin.

Kraken Roger and Talanjee Minnie collided soon after the start. Midnight Hussler and Blue Bar Pie collided
on the first turn. Avatar Witch and Midnight Hussler collided approaching the home turn. Midnight Hussler
and Blue Bar Pie collided approaching the home turn. Midnight Hussler checked off the heels of Blue Bar
Pie approaching the home turn. Avatar Witch checked of the heels of Blue Bar Pie checking heavily
Cawbourne Mav and Midnight Hussler on the home turn. Avatar Witch and Midnight Hussler collided on
the home turn.

 

Race 2
SAM BARBIE GRANT MEMORIAL HT1

6:33 pm
450m

Restricted Win Heat

A pre race sample was taken from Zanthre Allen.

Rappa Flash and Sedaka were quick to begin. Raging Rampant and Black Spring were slow to begin.

Pectoralis, Raging Rampant and Black Spring collided soon after the start. Pectoralis galloped on the
heels of Black Spring on the first turn. Kraken Dust checked off Rappa Flash on the first turn. Raging
Rampant checked off Kraken Dust on the first turn. Rappa Flash and Sedaka collided approaching the
home turn. Sedaka and Zanthre Allen collided approaching the home turn. Raging Rampant and Black
Spring collided approaching the home turn. Kraken Dust and Sedaka collided in the home straight. Black
Spring checked off Sedaka in the home straight.

Race 3
SAM BARBIE GRANT MEMORIAL HT2

6:50 pm
450m

Restricted Win Heat

Mr. Jai Willoughby  was fined the sum of $50 for failing to ensure the registration papers/registration card
were produced for the greyhound Head Banger pursuant to GAR 33.

Amor Vincit was quick to begin. King Lorrimer was slow to begin.

Cooper Dan and Head Banger collided soon after the start. Amor Vincit collided on the first turn. Amor
Vincit collided approaching the home turn.

Race 4
SAM BARBIE GRANT MEMORIAL HT3

7:13 pm
450m

Restricted Win Heat

Mr. Jai Willoughby  was fined the sum of $50 for failing to ensure the registration papers/registration card
were produced for the greyhound Diego Fernando pursuant to GAR 33.

 Go Barny Go was quick to begin. Spinning Jakit and Barcia Houdini were slow to begin.

Spinning Jakit checked off the heels of Travel Agent soon after the start. Master Cosmic and Rampant
Munster collided on the first turn. Rampant Munster checked off Barcia Houdini on the first turn. Travel
Agent and Master Cosmic collided on the first turn. Master Cosmic checked off the heels of Barcia Houdini
on the first turn. Go Barny Go crossed to the inside approaching the home turn.

Race 5
KERMONDS HAMBURGERS

7:37 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from From The Shadows.

 Bereluke and From The Shadows collided soon after the start checking Bereluke. Irka Jakit and Loroupe
collided approaching the first turn checking Irka Jakit. Cindy La Moment checked off Bereluke on the first
turn checking Irka Jakit. Bereluke and From The Shadows collided approaching the home turn checking
From The Shadows. Loroupe and Flying Action collided approaching the winning post.



Race 6
WARRNAMBOOL FENCING

SPECIALISTS
7:58 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

Cassius Monelli, Kraken Lightning and Con Rod were quick to begin. Thomeli Rocket was slow to begin.

Dewana Sprite and Kraken Lightning collided soon after the start. Thomeli Rocket checked off Nitro Value
soon after the start. Dewana Sprite checked heavily off Kraken Lightning approaching the first turn causing
Dewana Sprite to fall. Kraken Lightning galloped on the heels of Con Rod approaching the first turn.
Panadero King and Cassius Monelli collided on the first turn. Thomeli Rocket checked off Cassius Monelli
on the first turn. Cassius Monelli galloped on the heels of Con Rod on the first turn. Thomeli Rocket
checked off Kraken Lightning on the first turn.

Dewana Sprite was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left shoulder, a 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 7
COAST FM & 3YB

8:22 pm
450m

Grade 5

Mr. Jai Willoughby  was fined the sum of $50 for failing to ensure the registration papers/registration card
were produced for the greyhound Super Tokachi pursuant to GAR 33.

A pre race sample was taken from Serendipity Gold.

Stewards delayed the "All Clear" after judges inadvertently semaphored "1-6-2-3".  This was corrected to
"1-6-2-5" before the "All Clear" was given.

Oh So Rowdy and Calendar Boy were quick to begin. Super Tokachi and Piriformis were slow to begin.

Balance and Serendipity Gold collided several times soon after the start. Serendipity Gold checked off the
heels of Super Tokachi approaching the first turn. Balance and Kirabilli Poppy collided on the first turn.
Super Tokachi and Piriformis collided on the first turn. Miracles Happen and Super Tokachi collided on the
first turn. Serendipity Gold, Super Tokachi and Piriformis collided heavily on the first turn checking all
greyhounds. Super Tokachi and Piriformis collided approaching the home turn. Kirabilli Poppy checked off
Miracles Happen in the home straight.

Race 8
MACEY'S BISTRO GDR

8:43 pm
650m

Special Event

Noosa Parade was slow to begin.

Cooper Scooper, Garku Bale and Noosa Parade collided on the first turn checking Garku Bale and Noosa
Parade. Hit The Highway and Unmistakable collided approaching the second turn checking Unmistakable.
Pool Hall and Unmistakable collided approaching the home turn checking Unmistakable.

A sample was taken from Apex Within - winner of the event.

Race 9
CASSIGN DESIGN

9:07 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

Blockette was quick to begin. Dodge Coupe, Zoehanna Diva, Sanya Bay and Gypsy Shane were slow to
begin.

Dodge Coupe hit the running rail on the first turn. Dodge Coupe galloped on the heels of Hawkie on the
first turn checking Blockette. Dodge Coupe and Hawkie collided approaching the home turn.

Dodge Coupe was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained a scapula
injury, a 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 10
BOOK YOUR WEDDING HERE

9:28 pm
390m

Mixed 4/5

Mr. Jai Willoughby  was fined the sum of $50 for failing to ensure the registration papers/registration card
were produced for the greyhound Kouta and Cream and Azalea pursuant to GAR 33.

Alpha Midas, Shannon Allen and Azalea were quick to begin. Naiqama was slow to begin.

Lektra Brandy galloped on the heels of Kouta and Cream soon after the start. Stand Beside Me galloped
on the heels of Azalea checking Kouta And Cream on the first turn causing Stand Beside Me and Kouta
And Cream to lose considerable ground. Alpha Midas and Shannon Allen collided on the first turn.
Shannon Allen and Naiqama collided approaching the finishing line.

A sample was taken from Alpha Midas - the winner of the event.

 

Race 11
EDWARDS ELECTRICAL

9:52 pm
390m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Zipping Mack.

Crackerjack Tags, Jan's Star and Lochinvar Adore were quick to begin. Zipping Mack was slow to begin.

Brake Drum and Avatar Minty collided soon after the start. Jan's Star checked off the heels of Lochinvar
Adore soon after the start. Jan's Star, Brake Drum and Avatar Minty collided heavily on the first turn
checking all greyhounds. Crackerjack Tags checked off Lochinvar Adore colliding with Blackpool Alexis on
the first turn.

Race 12
www.tab.com.au

10:14 pm
390m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Spin That Wheel.

Blank Page and Crackerjack Tim was quick to begin. Splash of Blue and Hilux were slow to begin.

Blank Page and Spin That Wheel collided soon after the start. Speedy Scar and Luca Flyer collided soon
after the start. Spin That Wheel, Speedy Scar and Luca Flyer collided on the first turn severly checking
Speedy Scar. Splash Of Blue and Hilux collided approaching the home turn. Spin That Wheel checked off
Luca Flyer on the home turn. Splash Of Blue checked off the heels of Blank Page in the home straight.

-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Satisfactory Weight Trial (Solo) - Mr. A Richardson, trainer of Big Bazza declared a new weight of 32.0kgs



for the greyhound in accordance with GAR 39(2). Big Bazza last raced at 29.6kg. Big Bazza trialled over
the 390 from box 1, weight 32kg. The time of the trial was 22.34 ,Big Bazza was Cleared.




