
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Tuesday, 09 Jan 2018

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S. Bettess

Stewards: G. Dimsey/ C.Day/ A. Curry /G.Bromley

Judges: R. Drew / N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: I. Whitmill

Starter: J. Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: S. Ettridge

Kennel Attendants: S. Etteridge / J. Nuredini

Veterinarian: Dr. S. Karamatic

Race 1
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
2:42 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Balmoral Bash and Baby Houseman were slow to begin.

How Goodesy, How's It Thunder, Speedway Chick, My Territory and Trail Blazer collided soon after the start,
checking How's It Thunder and Speedway Chick. Baby Houseman checked off Dyna Diedre approaching
the first turn. How's It Thunder, Dyna Diedre and Baby Houseman collided on the first turn, checking Dyna
Diedre which collided with Balmoral Bash, checking Balmoral Bash. How's It Thunder checked off Balmoral
Bash approaching the home turn.

A sample was taken from How Goodesy, the winner of the event.

Race 2
XTREME TECHNOLOGY

3:02 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Ima Rig went up with the lids at box rise and was slow to begin.

Cruisy's Patch and Mrs. Hardwicke collided on the first turn, checking Cruisy's Patch and severely checking
Mrs. Hardwicke. Cruisy's Patch, Mrs. Hardwicke and Ima Rig collided on the first turn, checking all three
greyhounds. Ima Rig checked off the heels of Redhead Chez approaching the home turn. Ima Rig and
Lady Camelot collided in the home straight. Lady Camelot checked off the heels of Ima Rig in the home
straight. Double Date raced wide in the home straight.

Mrs. Hardwicke was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained abrasions to
the left and right toes. No stand down period was imposed.

Ima Rig was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained no apparent injury. No
stand down period was imposed.

A sample was taken from Newtown Flyer, the winner of the event.

Race 3
BURNS ARCHER REALTY

3:22 pm
460m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Stewards spoke to Mr Bevan Gray, the trainer of Sirius Matters, regarding the length of time the greyhound
has had between races. Sirius Matters last raced on 10 July 2017. Mr Gray stated that the greyhound was
returning to racing from a change of kennel.

Inga Ross and Maximum Magic were slow to begin.

Dyna Hendry, Warming Galo's and No More Sisco collided approaching the first turn, checking Warming
Galo's. Dyna Hendry and No More Sisco collided on the first turn, checking No More Sisco which collided
with Sirius Matters, causing Sirius Matters and Allen Don to race wide. Allen Don and Sirius Matters
collided on the home turn, checking Sirius Matters. Dyna Hendry raced wide on the home turn. Inga Ross
turned its head and visibly eased in the home straight.

Stewards spoke to Mr Peter Inguanti, the trainer of the greyhound Inga Ross, regarding the greyhound’s
racing manners in the home straight. Inga Ross was vetted  following the event. It was reported that the
greyhound sustained injuries to the left long head triceps (monkey) and right pectoral (chest) injury, a
seven day stand down period was imposed. Acting under GAR 69(B)(1), the stewards charged Inga Ross
with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of injury). Mr Inguanti pleaded guilty to the
charge, Inga Ross was found guilty and stewards directed that the greyhound perform a Satisfactory Trial
(all tracks) pursuant to GAR 69(B)(1)(a), before any future nomination will be accepted.

A sample was taken from Fairly Legal, the winner of the event.

Race 4
BECOME A BECKLEY CENTRE

MEMBER IN 2018
3:44 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Rock'em Elvis and Lee I Am were slow to begin.

Fiery Universe, Lee I Am and Rock'em Elvis collided on the first turn, checking Rock'em Elvis. Fiery
Universe and Kev's Fantasy collided approaching home turn, checking both greyhound. Lee I Am checked
off Rocket Riley on the home turn. Rocket Riley raced wide in the home straight.

A sample was taken from Paua To Load, the winner of the event.



Race 5
NARDI PRODUCE

4:02 pm
460m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Spa Vulpix, Miss Sweet Pea and King Of Merrimu collided soon after the start, checking Miss Sweet Pea.
King Of Merrimu and Xera Bale collided approaching the first turn, checking Xera Bale. Miss Sweet Pea
checked off the heels of Muzzle Welsh approaching the home turn. Miss Sweet Pea and Xera Bale collided
approaching the home turn. Dyna Xara checked off the heels of King Of Merrimu on the  home turn.

A sample was taken from Sisco Ride, the winner of the event.

Race 6
PET PANELS.COM.AU

4:21 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

Go Didda Go was slow to begin.

Rapid Mission, Gold Attraction, Mahlo Nacho and Allen Arlovski collided approaching the first turn,
severely checking Rapid Mission which contacted the running rail. Rapid Mission, Gold Attraction and
Jupiter Jones collided on the first turn, checking Gold Attraction. Go Didda Go checked off the heels of
Manx Czar on the home turn. Mahlo Nacho and Gold Attraction collided in the home straight.

Rapid Mission was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left long head triceps (monkey) muscle. A 14-day stand down period was imposed.

A sample was taken from Possibly, the winner of the event.

Race 7
BECKLEY CENTRE CLUB

FUNDRAISING
4:41 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Iona Express was slow to begin.

Beyond Today and Sub Zero Magic collided approaching the first turn, checking Sub Zero Magic. Sub Zero
Magic, Jesterday and Lord Regnar collided approaching the first turn, causing Lord Regnar to race wide.
Iona Express checked off the heels of Rosacky Blitz approaching the home turn. Lord Regnar raced wide
on the home turn and in the home straight.

A sample was taken from Gold Odessa, the winner of the event.

Race 8
NARDI PRODUCE

5:02 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

Hold On Belena and Premier Ching collided approaching the first turn, checking Premier Ching. Galaxy
Star and Premier Ching collided on the first turn, severely checking Premier Ching. Teflon Toby, Kadabra
Monelli and Taylor Bale collided on the first turn, checking Taylor Bale. Kadabra Monelli and Zambora
Caitlyn collided approaching the home turn. Zambora Caitlyn and Hold On Belena collided on the home
turn. Zambora Caitlyn checked off the heels of Kadabra Monelli in the home straight. Zambora Caitlyn and
Galaxy Star collided in the home straight.

Premier Ching was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained a carpal sprain
to the left wrist. A ten-day stand down period was imposed.

A sample was taken from Taylor Bale, the winner of the event.

Race 9
P & R FOOD SERVICES

5:21 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

How's It Burning and Boston Light collided soon after the start. Zuberi and Perrie Lulu collided approaching
the first turn. Perrie Lulu and Boston Light collided on the first turn. Buzz The Tower and Riverdale Danger
collided approaching the home turn, checking Riverdale Danger which collided with Zuberi, and Boston
Light which raced wide as a result. Just Audrey, Boston Light and Zuberi collided on the home turn,
checking Zuberi. Ima Rebel, Perrie Lulu and Boston Light raced wide on the home turn.

A sample was taken from Ima Rebel, the winner of the event.

Race 10
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

5:39 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Noonbarra Storm and Dashing Dream were slow to begin.

Maximum Bliss and Kiss Me Marday collided soon after the start. Maximum Bliss checked off the heels of
Kiss Me Marday approaching the first turn. Kiss Me Marday, Elite Elana and Racey Rose collided
approaching the first turn. Jack's Alouette checked off the heels of Racey Rose approaching the home turn.
Racey Rose and Jack's Alouette collided on the home turn. Maximum Bliss raced wide on the home turn
and in the home straight. Stewards noted that the muzzle of Elite Eliana became dislodged during the
event.

A sample was taken from Noonbarra Storm, the winner of the event.

Race 11
WEDDERMOOR PLUMBING & GAS

5:57 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

Stewards spoke to Mr J Mc Donald, kennel representative for Destini Riptide, regarding the length of time
the greyhound has had between races. Destini Riptide last raced on 8 September 2017. Mr McDonald
stated that the greyhound was returning to racing from an injury to its right fore.

Mr Alan McDonald, trainer of Destini Riptide, declared a new weight of 35.1kg for the greyhound in
accordance with GAR 39(2). Destini Riptide last raced at 36.3kg. 

Mr Callum Blake, kennel representative for Rosso, declared a new weight of 35.1kg for the greyhound in
accordance with GAR 39(2). Rosso last raced at 32.4kg. 

Snap Loch, Rosso and Destini Riptide were slow to begin.

Predemonic, Parvati Grange, Crackerjack Jim and Rosso collided approaching the first turn, checking
Crackerjack Jim which fell, in turn checking Took My Money and Destini Riptide; Took My Money lost
ground and Destini Riptide fell as a result.

Crackerjack Jim was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
the right front toe. A seven-day stand down period was imposed.

Destini Riptide was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained no apparent
injury. No stand down period was imposed.



A sample was taken from Snap Loch, the winner of the event.

Race 12
TTS ELECTRICS

6:20 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Allen Jake was slow to begin.

No Guarantees, Clouded Acorn and Zenstar collided approaching the first turn, checking No Guarantees.
Zenstar checked off Cavalry Rose on the first turn. Minnie Wizard checked off No Guarantees approaching
the home turn. Cavalry Rose checked off Minnie Wizard on the home turn. Allen Jake and No Guarantees
collided in the home straight.

A sample was taken from Clouded Acorn, the winner of the event.

MEETING COMMENTS

Satisfactory Trial Results - Miss Winks trialled over the 400m from box one, weight 26.2kg, the greyhound
was placed third in a field of six. The time of the trial was 23.89, the greyhound was beaten by a margin of
2.75L. Miss Winks was not cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Krazy Blaze trialled over the 400m from box three, weight 28.0kg, the greyhound
was placed fifth in a field of six. The time of the trial was 23.89, the greyhound was beaten by a margin of
4.25L. Krazy Blaze was cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Krazy Jane trialled over the 400m from box five, weight 26.0kg, the greyhound
was placed first in a field of six. The time of the trial was 23.89, the greyhound won by a margin of 2.25L.
Krazy Jane was cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Wok Djay trialled over the 400m from box seven, weight 33.7kg, the greyhound
was placed second in a field of six. The time of the trial was 23.89, the greyhound was beaten by a margin
of 2.25L. Wok Djay was not cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results (GAR 77A) - Stewards spoke to Ms Carmel Schembri, the trainer of Molly Walker,
regarding the length of time since the greyhound last raced. Molly Walker last raced on 21 June 2017. Ms
Schembri stated that the greyhound had been seasonal. Pursuant to GAR 77A, Molly Walker trialled over
the 400m from box eight, weight 25.8kg, the greyhound was placed fourth in a field of six. The time of the
trial was 23.89, the greyhound was beaten by a margin of 4L. Molly Walker was cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results (GAR 77A) - Stewards spoke to Mr Alfred Barbara, the trainer of Emma Mia,
regarding the length of time since the greyhound last raced. Emma Mia last raced on 11 October 2016. Mr
Barbara stated that the greyhound had been seasonal. Pursuant to GAR 77A, Emma Mia trialled over the
460m from box one, weight 31.4kg, the greyhound was placed fourth in a field of four. The time of the trial
was 26.67, the greyhound was beaten by a margin of 5.25L. Emma Mia was cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Watch Me Wyn trialled over the 460m from box six, weight 27.5kg, the
greyhound was placed second in a field of four. The time of the trial was 26.67, the greyhound was beaten
by a margin of a nose. Watch Me Wyn was cleared.

Satisfactory Trial Results - Dig Deep Bert trialled over the 460m from box eight, weight 30.0kg, the
greyhound was placed third in a field of four. The time of the trial was 26.67, the greyhound was beaten by
a margin of 2.3L. Dig Deep Bert was cleared.




