
STEWARD'S REPORT

Bendigo
Friday, 08 Jun 2018

Weather conditions: Showers

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A. Blackmore

Stewards: R. Fazulla & I. Taylor.

Judges: H. Lock & T. Morrison

Lure Drivers: S. Baldwin

Starter: S. Manning

Kennel Supervisor: Dianne Pell

Kennel Attendants: C. Jackson & J. Hooke

Veterinarian: Dr. E. Marriott

Race 1
TRIPLE M BENDIGO 93.5

3:09 pm
425m

Maiden

Select Mick was quick to begin.

Tonking Home and Onya Prankstar collided on the first turn checking Onya Prankstar. Big Cam galloped on
the heels of Blue Fabianna on the first turn checking both greyhounds. Tonking Home and Select Mick
collided approaching the home turn checking Tonking Home. Onya Prankstar checked off Lethal Levi on
the home turn.

Race 2
CHASERS FUNCTION CENTRE

3:29 pm
425m

Mixed 6/7

Antarctic Lass, Flying Apollo, Deacon Downs and Barinya were slow to begin.

Deacon Downs and Barinya collided soon after the start checking Deacon Downs. Flying Apollo, Deep
Creek Girl, Barinya and All Inn Taylor collided on the first turn checking Deep Creek Girl, Barinya and
Antarctic Lass and severely checking Deacon Downs and Royal Order. Barinya and Deep Creek Girl
collided on the home turn checking Barinya. Deep Creek Girl and Barinya collided entering the home
straight. Flying Apollo and All Inn Taylor collided entering the home straight.

A sample was taken from Flying Apollo, winner of the event.

Race 3
NINE BENDIGO (1-4 WINS) HT1

3:50 pm
425m

Restricted Win Heat

Weeona Wilbur was slow to begin.

Ice Cold Yug and Lanis Morris collided approaching the first turn. Aeroplane Tippa, Lanis Morris and
Honestly Bob collided approaching the home turn severely checking all three greyhounds. Rusty The Jett
and Ice Cold Yug collided on the home turn.

Race 4
BENDIGO ADVERTISER

4:12 pm
500m

Mixed 6/7

Mahjong Heat was slow to begin.

Faraday was very slow to begin (3L).

Tasvilla and Eadie Gee collided soon after the start and again on the first turn. Sierra Oasis faltered
entering the back straight and tailed off as a result. Tasvilla and Faraday collided approaching the second
turn and on the second turn checking Tasvilla. Eadie Gee and Mahjong Heat collided on the second turn.
Faraday and St. Regis collided in the home straight.

Sierra Oasis was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
right back muscle. A stand down period of 28 days was imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mr. P. Abela, the trainer of the greyhound Faraday regarding the greyhounds racing
manners in the home straight. Faraday was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound
sustained injuries to a pelvis injury, a 10 day stand down period was imposed.  Acting under GAR 69(B)(1),
the stewards charged Faraday with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of injury).  Mr.
Abela pleaded guilty to the charge, Faraday was found guilty and stewards directed that the greyhound
perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks) pursuant to GAR 69(B)(1)(a),  before any future nomination will be
accepted.

Race 5
GOLDFIELDS CATERING

4:37 pm
425m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from My Mate Wally.

Kung Fu Hustle, Invictus Lawless and My Mate Wally were quick to begin. 

Speedy Ryder and Lost Love collided soon after the start and again approaching the first turn and on the
first turn. My Fernando Tim and Cosmic Moments collided on the first turn. Invictus Lawless and Golden
Blaze collided approaching the winning post.



Race 6
GOLDEN CITY CONCRETE PUMPING

4:54 pm
500m

Grade 5

The start time of this event was rescheduled to 16:54 as requested by Tabcorp.

Specific was a late scratching at 14:17 due to weight variation (GAR 39). A 10 day stand down period was
imposed. Trainer Mr. A. Ferguson was fined the sum of $100.

The start time of this event was delayed by 1 1/4 minutes due to the late arrival at the boxes.

Mr. Bad Example and Cobber Victorem were quick to begin.

Jack's Pick crossed to the inside soon after the start checking Onya Grover. Mr. Bad Example and Crump's
Princess collided approaching the second turn. Mr. Bad Example and Jack's Pick collided in the home
straight.

Race 7
MANNINGS GREYHOUND COMPLEX

5:13 pm
425m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Jar Man.

Fair Of face and Hodge's Lane were quick to begin.

Solitary Girl was slow to begin.

Rave On and Brazilian Brae collided approaching the first turn. Kulu Zipster and Weeona Paul collided on
the first turn checking Weeona Paul. Fair Of Face and Hodge's Lane collided approaching the home turn
and again on the home turn. Fair Of Face checked off Hodge's Lane in the home straight. Rave On and Fair
Of Face collided approaching the winning post.

Race 8
HIT 91.9 BENDIGO

5:33 pm
500m

Mixed 4/5

The start of this event was delayed by 1 minute due to the late arrival at the boxes.

A pre-race sample was taken from Major Riot.

Tye Me Chopper was quick to begin.

Tye Me Chopper, Rumbling Bajooks, Dee Dee One and Tzar Norma collided on the first turn checking
Rumbling Bajooks, Dee Dee One and Tzar Norma. Rumbling Bajooks and Dee Dee One collided on the
second turn checking Dee Dee One. Tzar Norma and Dee Dee One collided approaching the home turn
checking Tzar Norma. Tzar Norma raced wide in the home straight.

Race 9
HIP POCKET BENDIGO (1-4 WINS) HT2

5:53 pm
425m

Restricted Win Heat

The start time of this event was rescheduled to 17:53 as requested by Tabcorp.

Tye Me Over and Winlock Intent were slow to begin.

Staggerism and Winlock Intent collided approaching the first turn checking Staggerism. Gotta Bandit and
Atlantic Rose collided on the first turn checking Gotta Bandit. Lylah's Way, Weeona Bont and Atlantic Rose
collided approaching the home turn checking Weeona Bont and Winlock Intent. Lylah's Way and Atlantic
Rose collided on the home turn. Swiftly Swift raced wide on the home turn and entering the home straight.

Race 10
AUSSIE INFRARED @ STUD (1-4

WINS) HT3
6:08 pm
425m

Restricted Win Heat

This event was delayed by 2 minutes and moved to Sky2 due to the late arrival at the boxes.

Pat Malone and Tyson's A Rebel were quick to begin.

Tyson's A Rebel and Weeona Annie collided soon after the start and again approaching the first turn. Sunlit
Breaker checked off Tyson's A Rebel approaching the first turn. Lonesome Spring and Sunlit Breaker raced
wide on the home turn and again in the home straight.

Race 11
JARROD LARKIN CONCRETING (1-4

WINS) HT4
6:27 pm
425m

Restricted Win Heat

A pre-race sample was taken from Bolton Blue.

Blazin' About and Wanna Allen were quick to begin.

Pa's Girl was slow to begin.

Mr. Automatic, Bolton Blue and Ryder Sir collided soon after the start. My Real Deal and Weeona Pearl
collided soon after the start checking Weeona Pearl. Ryder Sir and Wanna Allen collided approaching the
first turn checking Wanna Allen. Weeona Pearl and Wanna Allen collided on the first turn. Bolton Blue
checked off Blazin' About on the home turn. Weeona Pearl and Wanna Allen collided on the home turn.
Wanna Allen checked off Weeona Pearl on the home turn. My Real Deal raced wide on the home turn and
in the home straight.

Race 12
TAB.COM.AU

6:45 pm
425m

Grade 5

The start of this event was delayed by 1 1/2 minutes due to the late arrival at the boxes.

A pre-race sample was taken from Set Point.

Angel Cloud and Texas Blaze were slow to begin.

Set Point, All Inn Youi and Angel Cloud collided on the first turn checking Angel Cloud and All Inn Youi.
Texas Blaze and Set Point collided on the home turn. Super Stoked and Goodnight Irene collided entering
the home straight.

Angel Cloud was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Steward’s issued a warning to Ms. M. Schmidt, trainer of Weasley Grange in that she made contact with the
rear of the boxes after boxing the greyhound. GAR 51 (10)(c).



Re-Vetted Greyhound - My Barcia was presented for a re-vet at the conclusion of kennelling and was
Cleared to race. 




