
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Friday, 20 Apr 2018

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: J.Rea

Stewards: I.Kennedy & G.Bromley

Judges: R. Drew & N. Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: T. Adamson

Starter: J.Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: J.Henderson

Kennel Attendants: J.Nuredini & J.Haigh

Veterinarian: Dr C.Finlayson

Race 1
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

7:08 pm
460m

Maiden

Track curator Tony Dempsey advised that the track was medium harrowed on Wednesday April 18 2018.

Dyna Sarah was slow to begin. Bombora Rocket and Gagey's Snags collided soon after the start. Soda
Flash and Dyna Sarah collided approaching the first turn, severely checking Dyna Sarah, which collided 
with Bombora Rocket. Da End checked of Gagey's Snags on the first turn. Kauai checked off Whoomph on
the first turn. Soda Flash and Quest Allen collided approaching the home turn. Dyna Sarah checked off the
heels of Bombora Rocket approaching the home turn.

Dyna Sarah was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left pencil muscle, and abrasions to the left hock, a 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Bombora Rocket was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
the right monkey muscle, a 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Race 2
WE THANK YOU OUR ANZACS

7:28 pm
460m

Grade 7

Alpha Venus was quick to begin. Bear's Legacy was slow to begin. Giant Jarvis and Come Home collided
soon after the start. Bear's Legacy and Why Not Grace collided approaching the first turn. Bear's Legacy
and Dyna Francine collided on the first turn. Why Not Grace checked off Giant Jarvis approaching the
winning post and raced wide. 

Race 3
TAB MULTIPLIER (1-4 WINS)

7:48 pm
400m

Restricted Win

Bloke's Advice was slow to begin. Chief Command and Sleater collided soon after the start. Chief
Command, Sleater and Big Kenny Bobo collided approaching the first turn, checking Sleater. Bloke's
Advice and Zuberi collided on the first turn. Zuberi and Sleater collided on the first turn, checking Zuberi.
Big Kenny Bobo and In The Net collided on the first turn. Chief Command and In The Net collided
approaching the home turn, checking Chief Command. Chief Command and Sleater collided on the home
turn. In The Net raced wide on the home turn. Big Kenny Bobo raced wide in the home straight. 

Race 4
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
8:08 pm
460m

Grade 6

A pre-race sample was unable to be obtained from Aeroplane Indy, a post race sample was subsequently
taken.

Aeroplane Indy was quick to begin. Dynamic Street and High Water collided soon after the start. Ronray
Legend and Ace Allen collided soon after the start. Dyna Xerox, Dynamic Street and Ace Allen collided
approaching the first turn, checking Dyna Xerox and Dynamic Street. Aeroplane Indy and Vixstar collided
approaching the home turn. Ace Allen checked off Mepunga Molly entering the home straight. Vixstar
checked off Aeroplane Indy entering the home straight. High Water checked off Dynamic Street in the home
straight.

High Water was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 5
GRV VIC BRED SERIES FINAL

8:28 pm
460m

Mixed 6/7 Final

Antarctic Lass and Spectra Style were quick to begin. Power To Wyn checked offf Spectra Style soon after
the start, severely checking Rowchester Miss, which stumbled as a result. Power To Wyn and Okawa In
Black collided approaching the first turn. Tom Riddle and Antarctic Lass collided on the first turn. Power To
Wyn and Okawa In Black collided on the first turn, checking Okawa In Black. Mepunga Kyran checked off
Sisco Dun approaching the home turn. Tom Riddle and Spectra Style collided on the home turn, causing
Spectra Style to race wide. Rowchester Miss and Power To Wyn raced wide in the home straight. 

Rowchester Miss was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
the left wrist, a 5 day stand down period was imposed.

A sample was taken from Tom Riddle - the winner of the event. 



Race 6
GEELONG STREET RODDERS

8:49 pm
460m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Tiggerlong Boo.

Don Lesta was slow to begin. Cruisy's Lil and Like A Rocket collided soon after the start, checking Like A
Rocket. South Of Eden, Perrie The Fairy and Dyna Jacinta collided soon after the start. South Of Eden and
Dyna Jacinta collided approaching the first turn. My Bro Regis and Tiggerlong Boo collided approaching
the first turn. South Of Eden, Dyna Jacinta and Cruisy's Lil collided on the first turn. Don Lesta checked off
the heels of Like A Rocket on the first turn. South Of Eden and Dyna Jacinta collided approaching the home
turn,

Race 7
BINGO AT BECKLEY THURSDAY MAY

3RD
9:08 pm
460m

Grade 5

Why Not Maxine was quick to begin. Zipping Oliver and Fat Rhino were slow to begin. Zipping Oiver and
Isen Allen collided soon after the start. Manzeene Man, Winston Cruise and Why Not Archie collided soon
after the start. Manzeene Man checked off Winston Cruise approaching the first turn. Zipping Oliver, Isen
Allen, Manzeene Man, Fat Rhino, Why Not Archie and Why Not Maxine collided on the first turn, checking
Zipping Oliver, Manzeene Man, Fat Rhino and Why Not Maxine. Isen Allen and Why Not Archie collided
approaching the home turn. Royal Cosmic raced wide on the home turn. Zipping Oliver and Winston
Cruise raced wide entering the home straight. Why Not Maxine and Why Not Archie collided approaching
the winning post. 

Race 8
LEST WE FORGET

9:28 pm
460m

Mixed 4/5

A pre race sample was taken from Alpha Aion.

Dyna Nina was quick to begin. Mia Brae, Vostok and Fleur Delacour were slow to begin. Succession Plan,
Dyna Hadria and Lila Bale collided soon after the start. Succession Plan, Dyna Hadria, Lila Bale and Fleur
Delacour collided approaching the first turn, checking Dyna Hadria, Lila Bale and Fleur Delacour.
Succession Plan and Dyna Hadria collided on the first turn, checking Dyna Hadria and Fleur Delacour. Lila
Bale raced wide approaching the home turn. Mia Brae and Dyna Hadria collided on the home turn.

Race 9
3RD MAY BINGO AT BECKLEY (1-4

WINS)
9:49 pm
400m

Restricted Win

Alonso Mornay and Placid Warrior were slow to begin. Dodge An' Steele checked off Lylah's Way soon
after the start, and collided with Mepunga Bella. Blackpool Doc and Lylah's Way collided approaching the
first turn. Dodge An' Steele and Mepunga Bella collided approaching the first turn. Alonso Mornay andd
Placid Warrior collided on the first turn. Mepunga Bella checked off Dodge An' Steele on the first turn.
Dodge An' Steele raced wide on the home turn.

Race 10
WE HONOR OUR FALLEN HEROES

10:08 pm
400m

Mixed 3/4

A pre race sample was taken from Leo's Gift.

Unimid Bale went up with the lids at box rise and was slow to begin. Leo's Gift and Cruisy's Empress
collided approaching the first turn, checking Leo's Gift, which collided with Unmid Bale, resulting in both
greyhounds being checked. Kouta Mayhem and Tiggerlong Rock collided on the first turn. 

Race 11
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
10:30 pm

400m
Grade 5

Stewards spoke to Mr J.Collins representative of Zipping Maisy regarding the length of time the greyhound
has had between races. Zipping Maisy last raced on 17 January 2018. Mr Collins stated that the
greyhound was resuming racing following an injury to the right hip support muscle.

Kouta And Cream and Azalea were quick to begin. Zipping Maisy, Mepunga Bonnie and Explosive Fox
collided soon after the start. Emerald Rainbow and Ima Ruby collided approaching the first turn. Lektra
Blicavs and Zipping Maisy collided approaching the first turn, checking Lektra Blicavs. Emerald Rainbow
and Ima Ruby collided on the first turn, checking Ima Ruby. Emerald Rainbow and Zipping Maisy collided
approaching the home turn. Azalea raced wide entering the home straight. Kouta And Cream cramped in
the home straight and lost considerable ground ..

Kouta And Cream was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained cramp, a 5
day stand down period was imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mr H. Wilkinson, the representative of the greyhound Kouta And Cream.  Acting in
accordance with GAR 71 (Cramp), Stewards directed that the greyhound must perform a Satisfactory Trial
before any future nomination will be accepted.

Race 12
JIMS MOWING - GEELONG

10:47 pm
400m

Grade 5

Stewards spoke to Mr Malcolm Davis, trainer of Apex Pro regarding the length of time the greyhound has
had between races. Apex Pro last raced on 12 January 2018. Mr Davis stated the greyhound was
resuming racing following a change of kennel.

A pre race sample was taken from Sobered Up.

Lochinvar Adore and Go Alice Go were quick to begin. Raloo Barbara and Big Deal were slow to begin.
Sobered Up, Apex Pro and Riverdale Suger collided soon after the start. Raloo Barbara and Big Deal
collided several times approaching  first turn, checking both greyhounds. Riverdale Sugar and Raloo
Barbara collided on the first turn  checking Raloo Barbara and Big Deal resulting in Raloo Barbara 
becoming  unbalanced. Go Alice Go raced wide on the home turn. Calabrese Bullet and Riverdale Sugar
collided in the home straight. 

Raloo Barbara was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
right wrist, and abrasions to the left hock and left wrist, a 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Big Deal was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.






