
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Friday, 06 Apr 2018

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: S Bettess

Stewards: G Dimsey / J Rea / G Bromley

Judges: R Drew / N Hutchinson

Lure Drivers: T Adamson

Starter: I Whitmill

Kennel Supervisor: J Haigh

Kennel Attendants: J Haigh / J Nuredini

Veterinarian: Dr S Karasmatic

Race 1
BECOME A BECKLEY CENTRE

MEMBER IN 2018
7:08 pm
400m

Maiden

Stewards spoke to Mr B Pursell, the representative of Slingshot Maxi, regarding the length of time the
gryehound has had between races.  Slingshot Maxi last raced on 27 October 2017.  Mr Pursell stated that
the greyhound was returning to racing following a back muscle injury.

A pre-race sample was taken from Slingshot Maxi.

Darb's The Man, Donna O'Muffin and Dyna Bella were slow to begin.  Destini Firefox and Dyna Bella
collided soon after the start.

Race 2
MERV JENNINGS SIGNS

7:28 pm
460m

Maiden

The start of this race was delayed when the boxes opened when the amber light was turned on, prior to
any dogs being boxed. The start was subsequently effected without issue.

A pre-race sample was taken from Lulumon.

Antarctic Lass and Chile Allen were quick to begin.  Lulumon was slow to begin.  Zipping Galon shifted in
soon after the start, checking Spectra Design and Go Shirvo Go.  Go Shirvo Go galloped on Lulumon on
the first turn, checking Lulumon.  Go Shirvo Go and Limburg Will collided approaching the home turn. 
Lulumon and Go Shirvo Go raced wide on the home turn.

Race 3
PET PANELS.COM.AU

7:48 pm
400m

Grade 7

The start of this event was delayed by 30 seconds due to an interstate thoroughbred race.

A pre-race sample was taken from Shield Of Dreams. 

Shield Of Dreams and Wise Lewis collided soon after the start, checking Wise Lewis.  Dodge An' Steele,
Dyna Gabba and Dyna Winter collided on the first turn, checking Dodge An' Steele, and severely checking
Dyna Gabba.  Dyna Diedre, Dyna Zapto and Wise Lewis collided on the first turn, checking Dyna Zapto. 
Wise Lewis checked off Dyna Diedre on the home turn, causing Wise Lewis to race wide as a result. 
Dodge An' Steele and Shield Of Dreams collided entering the home straight.  Dyna Gabba checked off
Rocky Rooster in the home straight.

Race 4
BECKLEY CENTRE CLUB

FUNDRAISING
8:08 pm
460m

Grade 7

A pre-race sample was taken from Smash Flash.

Dyna Gunner and Nimble Foot were slow to begin.  Smash Flash shifted in soon after the start, checking
Dynamic Street and Zipping Jake.  Dyna Gunner and Zipping Jake collided approaching the first turn.  Jello
Allen checked off Dyna Elise on the first turn.  Dyna Jenaya and Nimble Foot collided on the first turn.

Race 5
JIMS MOWING - GEELONG

8:28 pm
460m

Grade 5

Nolita Nelly was quick to begin.  Nash Road Betty and Nolita Nelly collided on the first turn, checking Nolita
Nelly.  Lonnie Knight and Winston Cruise collided on the first turn.  Winston Cruise, Lonnie Knight and
Zipping King collided on the home turn.

Race 6
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
8:48 pm

A pre-race sample was taken from Fire And Smoke.

Bera Na Liva checked off Dyna Denver soon after the start.  Painted Elvry, Weeona Raph and Dyna Denver
collided on the first turn, checking Weeona Raph.  Rumble Drive, Dyna Bobbi and Hammer Head collided
on the first turn, checking all three greyhounds.  Painted Elvry, Dyna Denver and Hammer Head collided



460m
Grade 5

approaching the home turn, checking Dyna Denver.  Painted Elvry and Hammer Head collided on the
home turn.

Race 7
OUTLINE PRINT DESIGN (VETERANS)

9:08 pm
460m

S/E Veteran

Shep shifted in soon after the start, checking Showtime Mystery, Skyes Apprentice and Macrory. 
Paraphernalia, Showtime Mystery and Skyes Apprentice collided on the first turn, checking Paraphernalia
and Showtime Mystery.  Paraphernalia and Showtime Mystery collided approaching the home turn,
checking Showtime Mystery.  Macrory checked off Showtime Mystery on the home turn.  Skyes Apprentice
and Macrory collided approaching the winning post.

Race 8
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

9:28 pm
460m

Mixed 4/5

Paua To Load was a late scratching at 5:55 pm on the advice of the Club's Veterinary Surgeon, due to
diarrhoea.  A seven day stand down period was imposed.

A pre-race sample was taken from Brazilian Brae.

The start of this event was delayed by 30 seconds due to an interstate harness race.

Vostok checked off Brazilian Brae approaching the first turn.  Gregorovitch and Reid Star collided on the
first turn, checking Reid Star and Brazilian Brae.  Reid Star and Brazilian Brae collided approaching the
home turn.  Shima Bar and Gregorovitch collided on the home turn.

Race 9
TTS ELECTRICS

9:48 pm
460m

Grade 6

Mepunga Kyran checked off Power To Wyn soon after the start.  Power To Wyn, Dyna Lenae and Dyna
Xerox collided on the first turn, checking Power To Wyn and Dyna Lenae.  Power To Wyn and Dyna Xerox
collided on the home turn.  Dyna Xerox raced wide in the home straight.

Race 10
P & R FOOD SERVICES (2-3 WINS)

10:07 pm
400m

Restricted Win

Mr John Barbara, trainer of Hot Jean, declared a new weight of 30.4 kgs for the greyhound in accordance
with GAR 39(2).  Hot Jean last raced at 31.5 kgs.

A pre-race sample was taken from Hot Jean.

Dyna Vagrant was slow to begin.  Striking Gold galloped on Karaoke Ken approaching the first turn,
checking both greyhounds.  Vee Bee Mate, Pandora's Galaxy and Destini Agitator collided on the first turn,
checking Pandora's Galaxy, Destini Agitator and Weeona Pearl.  Striking Gold checked off Dyna Vagrant
approaching the home turn.  Karaoke Ken checked off Destini Agitator approaching the home turn.  Dyna
Vagrant checked off Weeona Pearl on the home turn.

Race 11
BURNS ARCHER REALTY

10:32 pm
400m

Mixed 4/5

Ms Angela Langton, trainer of Chardy, declared a new weight of 33.8 kgs for the greyhound in accordance
with GAR 39(2).  Chardy last raced at 32.2 kgs.

A pre-race sample was taken from Black Market.

Charlott's Angel was quick to begin.  Black Market, Destini Pegasus, Ronray Destiny, Leo's Gift and
Etiquette collided approaching the first turn, severely checking Destini Pegasus and Ronray Destiny.  Leo's
Gift checked off Etiquette on the first turn.  Etiquette checked off Chardy on the first turn.  Destini Pegasus
and Ronray Destiny collided on the home turn.

Race 12
COUNTRY LINK RURAL SUPPLIES

LARA
10:47 pm

400m
Grade 5

Koitsenko and Cavalry Rose collided soon after the start.  Storm Search checked off Explosive Fox soon
after the start.  Explosive Fox, Cosmic Moments and Kouta Excuses collided approaching the first turn,
checking Explosive Fox.  Storm Search and Little Toby collided on the first turn, checking Little Toby.




