
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 08 Nov 2017

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: G. Dimsey

Stewards: C. Day, A. Fewell, B. Blood

Judges: C. Hon, B. Loudon

Lure Drivers: D. Kierl

Starter: R. Phillips

Kennel Supervisor: T. Lockwood

Kennel Attendants: D. Jones

Veterinarian: Dr H. Hodgeson

Race 1
A1 SIGNAGE HT1

6:58 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

Mr. H. Wilkinson, representative of Go Son, declared a new weight of 33.3kgs for the greyhound in
accordance with GAR 39(2).  Go Son last raced at 35.0kgs.

A pre race urine sample was taken from Bye All at the trainer's kennels earlier today.

Cullquin Jethro was slow to begin.  Mia Brae, Dark Taboo, Bye All, Aeroplane Hank and Miss Peanut
collided approaching the first turn checking Miss Peanut and Aeroplane Hawk.  Dyna Zad, Dark Taboo and
Bye All collided on the first turn checking Bye All and Dark Taboo.  Aeroplane Hank, Dark Taboo and
Cullquin Jethro collided approaching the home turn checking all three greyhounds.

A sample was taken from Mia Brae, the winner of the event.

Race 2
R & J BATTERIES HT2

7:18 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

A pre race urine sample was taken from Radish at the trainer's kennels earlier today.

Kowari, Kiss Me Marday and Henderson collided soon after the start checking Kiss Me Marday.  My Bro
Regis, Radish, Kiss Me Nicki, Fast Izzi and Henderson collided soon after the start checking Fast Izzi, Kiss
Me Nicki and Kowari.  Fast Izzi, Kiss Me Nicki and Kowari collided approaching the first turn checking all
three greyhounds.  My Bro Regis and Henderson collided approaching the home turn checking
Henderson.

A sample was taken from Feikuai George, the winner of the event.

Race 3
EUREKA CONCRETE HT3

7:38 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

Puppet You Rippa was slow to begin.  Pyrenees Inferno, Too The Nail, Pandora's Galaxy and Lost Love
collided soon after the start checking Pandora's Galaxy.  Lylah's Way, Pyrenees Inferno and Too The Nail
collided approaching the first turn checking Too The Nail.  Lost Love, Me Bros Bad and Pandora's Galaxy
collided on the first turn checking Me Bros Bad and Pandora's Galaxy.  Too The Nail, Allen Arlovski and
Puppet You Rippa collided approaching the home turn severely checking Puppet You Rippa and Allen
Arlovski.

Puppet You Rippa was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Allen Arlovski was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

A sample was taken from Too The Nail, the winner of the event.

Race 4
LYNETTE'S FLORIST HT4

7:58 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7 Heat

Mr. J. Loveso, representative of Oshkosh Uni Chet, declared a new weight of 35.3kgs for the greyhound in
accordance with GAR 39(2).  Oshkosh Uni Chet last raced at 33.3kgs on 27th May 2017 and is resuming
from a spell.

Oshkosh Uni Chet and Pyrenees Petraca collided soon after the start checking Oshkosh Uni Chet. 
Calendar Boy and Smashing Serena collided soon after the start.  Calendar Boy and Pyrenees Petraca
collided on the first turn checking Pyrenees Petraca.  Paua To Load and Oshkosh Uni Chet collided on the
home turn checking both greyhounds.  Smashing Serena, Destini Pegasus and Ready And Armed collided
approaching the winning post checking Destini Pegasus and Ready And Armed.

A sample was taken from Calendar Boy, the winner of the event.

Race 5
$30 CHRISTMAS BUFFET DECEMBER

2ND
8:18 pm
545m

Mixed 4/5

A pre race urine sample was taken from Don't Kid Me at the trainer's kennels earlier today.

Miss Lava, Militant Man, Timtams For Bams and Destini Seahorse collided soon after the start checking
Miss Lava, Militant Man and Destini Seahorse.  Miss Lava, Militant Man and Destini Seahorse collided
entering the back straight checking Militant Man.  Miss Lava and Destini Seahorse collided in the back
straight.  Miss Lava checked off Destini Seahorse on the second turn.  Miss Lava raced wide in the home
straight.



Race 6
SINCLAIR MEATS GDR

8:38 pm
660m

Special Event

Destini Fortress was slow to begin.  I'm A Princess and Zambora Idol collided soon after the start checking
I'm A Princess.  McIvor Verna, My Girl Belena, Mick's Angel and Zambora Idol collided approaching the first
turn checking Mick's Angel, Scott Keeping and Destini Fortress.

A sample was taken from Packey Keeping, the winner of the event.

Race 7
JA CATERING & FUNCTIONS

8:57 pm
450m

Grade 5

Allen Kev was vetted prior to the event after vomiting in its kennel and passed fit to race.

A pre-race sample was taken from African Rhino.

Tiggerlong Rock was quick to begin.  Allen Sharpie and Astrology collied approaching the first turn. 
Hedwig and Allen Sharpie collided on the first turn checking Allen Sharpie.  Allen Sharpie raced wide in
the home straight.  Hedwig and Tiggerlong Rock collided approaching the winning post.

Race 8
STRIDES FUNCTION CENTRE

9:18 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Crackerjack Choc.

Queen Coriander was quick to begin.  Don Lesta was slow to begin.  Iceni Skye and Relethor Bale collided
soon after the start.  Jumbo Bale and Crackerjack Choc collided soon after the start.  Don Lesta, Jumbo
Bale and Crackerjack Choc collided on the first turn.  Swift Trent and Iceni Skye collided on the home turn.

Race 9
TOP CAT VIDEO PRODUCTIONS

9:38 pm
390m

Mixed 3/4

A pre-race sample was taken from Lunar Eclipse.

Lektra Blicavs and Kid Carl were quick to begin.  We Wish was slow to begin.  Lunar Eclipse and Allen
Eamon collided soon after the start and again approaching the first turn checking Lunar Eclipse.  Kid Carl
crossed to the rail on the first turn checking Lektra Blicavs, Thunder Of Night, On Billy's Wings, James Beat
Fed and We Wish.  Lunar Eclipse checked off James Beat Fed approaching the home turn.

Race 10
ENERGIS SMART ENERGY

SOLUTIONS
9:57 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Jimmaringle.

Jakesta, Chuck McIvor and Jimmaringle were slow to begin.  Winey Bago and Destini Cheetah collided
approaching the first turn checking both greyhounds.  Jakesta and Harlem Shake collided approaching the
first turn checking both greyhounds.  Jimmaringle and Jakesta collided on the first turn checking Jakesta. 
Succession Plan and Expecto Patronum collided entering the home straight.

Race 11
BOTTLE-O
10:21 pm

390m
Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Ace Marlow.

Iceni Crusader was slow to begin.  Ace Marlow, Desiree Dancer, Burnout and Thanks Cheryl collided
approaching the first turn checking Burnout, Thanks Cheryl and Desiree Dancer.  Blackpool Chuck, Tegz A
Riddler and Ace Marlow collided approaching the first turn checking Ace Marlow and Tegz A Riddler.  Ace
Marlow and Thanks Cheryl collided approaching the home turn.  Iceni Crusader, Ace Marlow and Thanks
Cheryl collided on the home turn.

Race 12
TAB MULTIPLIER

10:39 pm
390m

Grade 5

Mr. S. Bauer, trainer of Colluding declared a new weight of 31.9kgs for the greyhound in accordance with
GAR 39(2).  Colluding last raced at 33.2kgs.

A pre-race sample was taken from Lucky Brew.

Bera Na Liva was slow to begin.  Lucky Brew, Gunmetal Diva, Quink and Unlocked collided soon after the
start checking Lucky Brew, Gunmetal Diva, Quink and Bera Na Liva.  Colluding tired in the home straight.

Colluding was vetted followng the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found. Stewards
spoke to trainer Mr S. Bauer regarding the performance of Colluding, which was below market
expectations. Mr. Bauer advised stewards that Colluding was having its first start from his kennels, and in
his opinion the greyhound would derive a fitness benefit from today's event. He also stated that he
intended to trial the greyhound prior to racing again. Stewards noted the explanation.




