
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 13 Nov 2013

Weather conditions: SHOWERS

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: C.GENT

Stewards: D.PYERS, B.BLOOD

Judges: B.LOUDON/A.ROWLAND

Lure Drivers: R.PHILLIPS

Starter: D.KEIRL

Kennel Supervisor: M. LYNCH

Kennel Attendants: G.WHITE

Veterinarian: DR. M.SHEEDY

Race 1
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT1

6:57 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Lemon Liquorice and Limburg Layne collided soon after the start. Lemon Liquorice, Limburg Layne and
Pyrenees Grand collided approaching the first turn checking all three greyhounds. Brent Bale, Majestic Lee
and Sienna's Dream collided on the first turn checking Brent Bale and severely checking Majestic Lee, Not
Now Nellie and Pyrenees Grand. 

Race 2
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT2

7:18 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Tornadus, Sky Fighter and Larkhill Buck were slow to begin.

Millard, Pandora Bale, Coolan Blue and Chinchero collided on the first turn checking Pandora Bale. Sky
Fighter checked off Tornadus approaching the home turn. Larkhill Buck, Coolan Blue and Chinchero
collided enteirng the home straight. Larkhill Buck and Coolan Blue collided in the home straight. Tornadus
and Sky Fighter collided approaching the winning post.

Race 3
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT3

7:38 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Osti Moss was slow to begin.

Ima Apple and Southwood Duke collided soon after the start. Allen Malik and Babylon Club collided on the
first turn severely checking Babylon Club. Ima Apple and Babylon Club collided approaching the home
turn severely checking Babylon Club.

Race 4
GDR (2K BONUS)

7:58 pm
660m

Grade 5

Candle Wish was slow to begin.

My Illusion and Destini Gold collided soon after the start checking My Illusion. My Illusion and Extreme
Twist collided approaching the first turn. My Illusion and Candle Wish collided on the first turn. Destini Gold,
Hornsey's Mate and Zelemar Dancer collided on the first turn. My Illusion checked off Mahogany Spirit
approaching the second turn. Extreme Twist checked off Candle Wish on the second turn. Hornsey's Mate
eased in the home straight. My Illusion and Hornsey's Mate collided approaching the winning post.
Extreme Twist, Mahogany Spirit and Candle Wish collided approaching the winning post.

Hornsey's Mate was vetted following the event and revetted following race 7. It was reported that there was
no apparent injury.

A sample was taken from Maccaboy - winner of the event.

Stewards spoke to Mr. A. Sacco, the trainer of the greyhound Hornsey's Mate. Stewards deemed the
performance of Hornsey's Mate unsatisfactory in this event and acting in accordance with GAR 71,
Stewards directed that Hornsey's Mate must perform a Satisfacotry Trial (all tracks) before any future
nomination will be accepted.

 

 

Race 5
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT4

8:18 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Mr. G. Scott-Smith was fined the sum of $50 for his failure to produce the registration papers for the
greyhound Dundee Toro pusuant to GAR 33.

Nic Nat Nui was slow to begin.

So Confused and Our Pale Ale collided soon after the start checking So Confused. Our Pale Ale and
Dundee Toro collided on the first turn checking Our Pale Ale and So Confused. He's Schmick checked off
Riverside Riley on the first turn. You Say Goodbye checked off Allen Makoto in the home straight.



Race 6
BMD CONSTRUCTIONS FINAL

8:41 pm
450m

Grade 5 Final

Street Life was quick to begin.

Granville's Call, Dyna Carnage, Little Regus and Under Threat collided on the first turn. Superstar Magic
checked off Little Regus approaching the home turn. Superstar Magic and Under Threat collided
approaching the home turn.

A sample was taken from Dyna Carnage - winner of the event.

Race 7
GDR (2K BONUS)

9:01 pm
660m

Mixed 4/5

Aeroplane Eddie was quick to begin. Break O'Day and Arising was slow to begin.

Go Jacko Go checked off Mid Air Crash on the second turn. Flash Fizz galloped on the heels of Mid Air
Crash approaching the home turn. Aeroplane Eddie checked off Mid Air Crash approaching the home turn.
Flash Fizz, Aeroplane Eddie and Montana Express collided on the home turn. Aeroplane Eddie and Flash
Fizz collided in the home straight. Arising checked off Break O'Day in the home straight.

A sample was taken from Break O'Day - winner of the event.

Race 8
VELOCETTE @ STUD

9:18 pm
545m

Mixed 4/5

Gervon was slow to begin.

Walking Street checked off Paper Chaser soon after the start. Walking Street, Karise's Voice, Bees Lee and
Hornsey's Angel collided on the first turn checking Bees Lee and Hornsey's Angel and severely checking
Karise's Voice. Kalina Allen and Paper Chaser collided on the second turn checking Paper Chaser.
Walking Street checked off Gazzelliot in the home straight. Kalina Allen raced wide in the home straight.

Race 9
NAB

9:41 pm
390m

Mixed 4/5

Carwoola Saige was quick to begin.

Housefire, Just Go Bang, School Fees, Blazing Madam and Ruthless Stagger collided soon after the start
checking Just Go Bang, School Fees and Blazing Madam. Housefire checked off Ruthless Stagger
approaching the home turn checking School Fees. Housefire galloped on the heels of Ruthless Stagger
approaching the home turn severely checking Housefire and Blazing Madam, Housefire fell as a result.
Popat Port and Just Go Bang collided in the home straight.

Housefire was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Blazing Madam was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Race 10
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT5

9:58 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Hondo Supaboy and Whodat Knockin' were slow to begin.

Inventor and Joshua Bale collided soon after the start. Hondo Supaboy galloped on the heels of Giddy's
Star approaching the first turn checking Giddy's Star and severely checking Inventor. Giddy's Star and
Whodat Knockin' collided on the first turn checking Giddy's Star. Hondo Supaboy and Whodat Knockin'
collided entering the home straight. Whodat Knockin', Joshua Bale and Nikita's Elite collided approaching
the winning post.

Inventor was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Race 11
TOPCAT SUMMER CLASSIC HT6

10:20 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Coolan Queen and Dream It collided soon after the start. Dream It and Where's Neo collided soon after the
start. Great Spartacus raced wide in the home straight.

Race 12
ZAGAME'S BALLARAT

10:39 pm
545m

Grade 5

Uno Krystal and Fire Tracker were slow to begin.

Illicit Twist and Flushette collided on the first turn. Flushette and Fire Tracker collided entering the back
straight. Uno Krystal and Flushette collided on the home turn severely checking both greyhounds,
Flushette fell as a result.

Flushette was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Meeting Comments -

Satisfactory Trial Results - Nanny's Way trialled over the 390 from box 1, the greyhound was placed 1. The
time of the trial was 23:08. There were no margins as the greyhound trialled solo (weight trial). Nanny's
Way was cleared.




