
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Saturday, 20 Feb 2016

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: B. Williams

Stewards: D. Pyers/F. Mitoiu/P. Robertson/L. Fahry

Judges: C. Miles / R. Drew

Lure Drivers: C. Hiscock / R. Hood

Starter: R. LeSueur

Kennel Supervisor: P. Stefanos

Kennel Attendants: B. Rogers/D. Pryse

Veterinarian: Dr. M. Bell/Dr. A. James

Race 1
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 1
7:13 pm
525m

Special Event

King Size Shambi and Demon Bale were slow to begin.  Weblec Belle and Tronnie Oldfield collided soon
after the start.  Tywin Bale and Steel The Best collided approaching the first turn.  Weblec Belle, Tronnie
Oldfield and Fleetwood Zac collided approaching the first turn.  Greysynd Emma checked off Steel The
Best approaching the first turn.  Tywin Bale, Weblec Belle, Tronnie Oldfield and Fleetwood Zac collided on
the first turn checking Tronnie Oldfield.  King Size Shambi and Weblec Belle collided on the second turn
checking Tronnie Oldfield.  Steel The Best checked off Demon Bale in the back straight.

A sample was taken from Demon Bale, the winner of the event.

Race 2
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 2
7:35 pm
525m

Special Event

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Golden, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th February,
2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

Aeroplane Jack was slow to begin.  Shared Bonus, Golden and Noosa Jet collided soon after the start.
 He's So Good and Legend collided approaching the first turn.  He's So Good, Aeroplane Jack and Golden
collided on the first turn.  Legend checked off He's So Good on the first turn.  Quantum Bale checked off
Gawker Bale on the first turn severely checking Legend which raced wide and checked Noosa Jet as a
result.  He's So Good, Aeroplane Jack and Golden collided approaching the second turn checking
Aeroplane Jack and Golden.  He's So Good and Shared Bonus collided on the home turn.

A sample was taken from He's So Good, the winner of the event.

Race 3
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 3
7:58 pm
525m

Special Event

Schooner Doll, Gary Doogan, Jive Time and Eaton Bale were slow to begin.  Spring Grace crossed to the
rail soon after the start checking Gary Doogan.  Spring Grace, Gary Doogan and Jive Time collided
approaching the first turn checking Spring Grace.  Jailor Bale checked off Mississippi Girl entering the back
straight.  Mississippi Girl, Jailor Bale and West On Delly collided approaching the home turn.  Jailor Bale
and Mississippi Girl collided entering the home straight.  Schooner Doll and Eaton Bale collided entering
the home straight.  Gary Doogan checked off Schooner Doll in the home straight.  Jailor Bale and
Mississippi Girl collided approaching the winning post.

Spring Grace was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

A sample was taken from Eaton Bale, the winner of the event.

Race 4
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 4
8:18 pm
525m

Special Event

Dyna Keitaro and Destini Wildfire were slow to begin.  Texas Tommy crossed to the rail soon after the start
checking Destini Wildfire and Wise Maple.  Ima Misha Doll and Hercules Bale collided soon after the start.
Texas Tommy crossed to the rail approaching the first turn checking Dyna Keitaro, Tiggerlong Katut and
Wise Maple.  Ima Misha Doll checked off Hercules Bale approaching the first turn.  Hercules Bale,
Crackerjack Burn and Texas Tommy collided on the first turn.  Ima Misha Doll, Tiggerlong Katut and Wise
Maple collided on the first turn checking Ima Misha Doll.  Wise Maple and Destini Wildfire collided on the
second turn.  Ima Misha Doll and Tiggerlong Katut collided on the third turn checking Ima Misha Doll.  Dyna
Keitaro and Crackerjack Burn collided on the third turn checking Dyna Keitaro.

Race 5
ZOOM TOP

8:38 pm
730m

S/E Group 1

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from No Donuts, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Ryno's Raider, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Luna Jinx, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

Ryno's Raider checked off Come On Fantasy approaching the first turn.  Seeking Justice, Luna Jinx and
Beks collided on the first turn checking Beks and Luna Jinx.  Ryno's Raider and Kilkee Flex collided on the
home turn.



Samples were taken from the first three placegetters in the event - No Donuts (1st), Come On Fantasy (2nd)
and Seeking Justice (3rd).  

Race 6
ROOKIE REBEL

8:58 pm
600m

S/E Group 1

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Dyna Double One, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Xtreme Knocka, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015  pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Moreira, engaged in this event, on Thursday18th February,
2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Polijuice Potion, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Sisco Rage, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Grand Intention, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Lithgow Panther, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Cosmic Owl, engaged as a reserve in this event, on
Thursday 18th February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

Polijuice Potion was slow to begin.  Sisco Rage crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Moreira
and Xtreme Knocka.  Xtreme Knocka checked off Sisco Rage on the first turn checking Cosmic Owl.
 Xtreme Knocka and Polijuice Potion collided approaching the third turn.  Xtreme Knocka galloped on the
heels of Polijuice Potion entering the back straight severely checking Polijuice Potion.  Xtreme Knocka and
Lithgow Panther collided on the fourth turn checking Lithgow Panther.

Polijuice Potion was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to
its right wrist.  A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Samples were taken from the first three placegetters in this event - Dyna Double One (1st), Moreira (2nd)
and Sisco Rage (3rd).

Race 7
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 5
9:20 pm
525m

Special Event

Alpha Hermes, Nessa Shim and Dyna Jonah collided soon after the start.  Liam and Lunar Eclipse collided
soon after the start.  Destini Scorcher, Nessa Shim and Dyna Jonah collided approaching the first turn
checking Nessa Shim.  Liam checked off Lunar Eclipse approaching the second turn.  Liam checked off
Alpha Hermes on the second turn.  Liam, Lunar Eclipse and Alpha Hermes collided on the third turn
checking Lunar Eclipse.

Lunar Eclipse was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to its
right hamstring and right calf.  A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 8
TEMLEE
9:42 pm
525m

S/E Group 1

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Unlawful Entry, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Cash In Motion, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Zambora Brockie, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Above All, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Shared Equity, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Elfen Bale, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
Thursday 18th February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Asa Flying Spur, engaged in this event, as a reserve on
Thursday 18th February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Dalgetty, engaged in this event, on Thursday18th February,
2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

Unlawful Entry was slow to begin.  Unlawful Entry and Fantastic Spiral collided soon after the start
checking Unlawful Entry.  Fantastic Spiral, Cash In Motion and Zambora Brockie collided on the first turn
checking Zambora Brockie and Elfen Bale.  Unlawful Entry and Cash In Motion collided approaching the
second turn.  Fantastic Spiral and Elfen Bale collided entering the back straight and again on the third turn.

Samples were taken from the first three placegetters in this event - Dalgetty (1st), Above All (2nd) and
Shared Equity (3rd).
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Race 9
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 6
10:05 pm

525m
Special Event

An Out of Competition Sample was taken from Droopy's Bentley, engaged in this event, on Thursday 18th
February, 2015 pursuant to GAR 79A.

A pre-race sample was taken from Pictures Pearce, upon arrival at the course, prior to kennelling.

Pictures Pearce and Zipping Chubbz were slow to begin.  Folio Bale and Benta Bale collided approaching
the first turn.  Letron James and Benta Bale collided on the first turn.  Come At Me and Zipping Chubbz
collided approaching the second turn.  Droopy's Bentley and Folio Bale collided approaching the second



turn.  Come At Me and Zipping Chubbz collided on the second turn checking Zipping Chubbz.  Benta Bale,
Come At Me and Pictured Pearce collided on the third turn checking Pictures Pearce.  Droopy's Bentley
and Folio Bale collided approaching the home turn and again on the home turn.  Come At Me and Pictures
Pearce collided in the home straight.

Race 10
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 7
10:27 pm

525m
Special Event

A pre-race sample was taken from Major Jackpot, upon arrival at the course, prior to kennelling.

Bruce Tycoon was slow to begin.  Major Jackpot, Hush Now and Linco Bale collided soon after the start
checking Hush Now and Linco Bale.  Dyna Irminus, Wise Harvey and Major Jackpot collided on the first
turn severely checking Major Jackpot.  Bruce Tycoon checked off Major Jackpot approaching the second
turn.  Major Jackpot and Helga Bale collided approaching the second turn checking Major Jackpot.  Bruce
Tycoon checked off Major Jackpot on the second turn.  Linco Bale checked off Bashir entering the back
straight checking Wise Harvey.

Major Jackpot was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 11
MEADOWS CONF. & EVENTS CUP

PRELIM. 8
10:50 pm

525m
Special Event

Elite Enfield was slow to begin.  Spring Bumblebee, Cashin' In, Marley Bale and Allen Marky collided soon
after the start checking Spring Bumblebee.  Elite Enfield and Maximum Mak collided on the first turn.
 Marley Bale and Allen Marky collided on the first turn.  Zoe and Mystery Ride collided approaching the
second turn checking Mystery Ride.  Zoe and Mystery Ride collided on the third turn checking Cashin' In
and Mystery Ride. Mystery Ride and Allen Marky collided approaching the home turn checking Mystery
Ride.  Cashin' In and Marley Bale collided on the home turn.




