
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 18 Sep 2013

Weather conditions: SHOWERY

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: H.MONTGOMERY

Stewards: D.PYERS, B.BLOOD

Judges: B.LOUDON/A.ROWLAND

Lure Drivers: R.PHILLIPS

Starter: D.KEIRL

Kennel Supervisor: S.BONACCURSO

Kennel Attendants: J.LOUDON

Veterinarian: DR. L.WRIGHT

Race 1
R & J BATTERIES HT1

6:57 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Quara Bale was quick to begin. Tequila Rocket and Exodus Bale were slow to begin.

Exodus Bale and Athena Goddess collided soon after the start checking Exodus Bale. Tequila Rocket, Dan
Beringer and Quik Step collided approaching the first turn checking Dan Beringer. Tequila Rocket and Quik
Step collided approaching the first turn checking Tequila Rocket. Exodus Bale and Athena Goddess
collided approaching the home turn checking Exodus Bale. Exodus Bale and Athena Goddess collided on
the home turn checking both greyhounds. Super Leggera and Just Vivacious collided on the home turn.
Super Leggera checked off Just Vivacious in the home straight. Dan Beringer raced wide in the home
straight.

Tequila Rocket was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to both
triceps. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 2
SASHA'S BLEND HT2

7:19 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Lektra Nikki, Little Blue Chic and Wood Cutter Stan were slow to begin.

Lektra Nikki and Wood Cutter Stan collided soon after the start. Atlas Profit and Fang Larky collided
approaching the first turn severely checking Fang Larky. Fang Larky checked off Lektra Nikki on the first
turn. Fang Larky and Run Bun Bun collided on the first turn severely checking Run Bun Bun and Little Blue
Chic, Run Bun Bun fell as a result. Atlas Profit and Wood Cutter Stan collided approaching the home turn
checking Atlas Profit. Lektra Nikki and Wood Cutter Stan collided entering the home straight. Atlas Profit
and Wood Cutter Stan collided in the home straight.

Little Blue Chic was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the
right triceps and right back muscle. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Run Bun Bun was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the
left triceps, left chest muscle, left triangle muscle and left back muscle. A 21 day stand down period was
imposed.

Race 3
BMD CONSTRUCTIONS HT3

7:38 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Red Fang was quick to begin. Mitchell's Girl and Silent Flame were slow to begin.

Multi King checked off El Jay Torana on the first turn. Silent Flame and Mitchell's Girl collided on the first
turn. Dyna Carnage clipped the heels of Red Fang on the home turn causing Red Fang to become
unbalanced and fall as a result, checking Lektra Luther and severely checking Multi King. Silent Flame
checked off El Jay Torana in the home straight.

Multi King was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury.

Red Fang was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the left
shoulder. A 28 stand down period was imposed.

Race 4
ZAGAME'S BALLARAT HT4

7:58 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Ground Shaker was slow to begin.

Mr. Shaw and Behan collided approaching the first turn checking Behan. Weekend Gangster and
Seabrook Girl collided approaching the first turn checking Seabrook Girl and Behan. Seabrook Girl raced
wide in the home straight. Tequila Sun checked off Lektra Happy in the home straight.

Race 5
TOPCAT VIDEO

8:18 pm
450m

Grade 5

Maybe Vegas crossed to the rail soon after the start checking Ping King and Like James. Mr. Donatello and
Maybe Vegas collided approaching the first turn checking Mr. Donatello. Mr. Donatello and Like James
collided on the first turn. Elegant Chick checked off Kolora Morpheus approaching the home turn. Mr.
Donatello checked off Maybe Vegas approaching the home turn checking Ping King. Ping King checked off
Like James in the home straight. Mr. Donatello and Elegant Chick collided several times in the home
straight.



Elegant Chick was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left triceps. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 6
COSMIC CHIEF @ STUD

8:38 pm
545m

Mixed 4/5

A pre race sample was taken from Arising.

Arising and Extreme Twist were slow to begin.

Major League and Extreme Twist collided soon after the start. Mahogany Royale checked off Cloak Of Gold
on the first turn. Jethro checked off Cloak Of Gold entering the back straight. Arising and Extreme Twist
collided in the back straight checking Extreme Twist.

Race 7
MEGA MERCH

8:58 pm
545m

Grade 5

Da Cartel, Tashelle Lea and Rampant Lion collided soon after the start checking Tashelle Lea. Rampant
Lion and Da Cartel collided on the first turn.

Stewards spoke to trainer Mr. S. Gibilisco, regarding his difficulty in boxing the greyhound Storm Of
Mayhem. Stewards directed that Storm Of Mayhem be boxed first in future events.

Race 8
LION QUALITY PRODUCTS

9:18 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

A pre race sample was taken from Cee Ronaldo.

Santa Storm and Steve Allen were slow to begin.

Cosmic Black and Santa Storm collided soon after the start checking Santa Storm. Paw Licking and
Cosmic Black collided on the first turn checking Cosmic Black. Santa Storm raced wide on the home turn
and again entering the home straight.

Paw Licking was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injury to the
left shoulder and a spike wound to the left hind. A 14 day stand down period was imposed.

Danni Monelli was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to both
triceps and a spike wound to the left hind. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 9
NAB HT5
9:38 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Tiger Pride and Hector Bale were slow to begin and collided soon after the start. Tee Kay Ess and De Fonc
collided soon after the start. Bar's Open crossed to the outside approaching the first turn and collided with
Black Beard, Tee Kay Ess and De Fonc. Black Beard, Tee Kay Ess, Bar's Open and Lektra Lois collided on
the first turn checking Bar's Open and Tiger Pride. De Fonc and Hector Bale collided entering the home
straight checking both greyhounds. Bar's Open raced wide in the home straight.

Race 10
BALLARAT COURIER HT6

9:58 pm
390m

Maiden Heat

Diane's Lass was slow to begin.

Arm Bar Rousey and Direct Current collided soon after the start checking Direct Current. Pogo Pogo and
Cally's Alone collided approaching the first turn. Diane's Lass and Hit Pay Dirt collided approaching the
first turn checking Diane's Lass. Cally's Alone checked off Arm Bar Rousey on the first turn checking Cally's
Alone and Direct Current. Silent Showman and Explosive Lass collided on the home turn. Silent Showman,
Explosive Lass, Pogo Pogo and Arm Bar Rousey collided entering the home straight checking all four
greyhounds. Silent Showman eased in the home straight and collided with Explosive Lass and Pogo Pogo.
Silent Showman and Explosive Lass collided in the home straight.

Silent Showman was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury. Mr. T.
Comensoli, handler of the greyhound, declined to have the greyhound revetted. Acting under GAR(1)(b)
stewards charged Silent Showman with failing to pursue the lure with due commintment and suspended
the greyhound for 28 days (Ballarat) and directed that the greyhound perform a Satisfactory Trial (all
tracks), pursuant to GAR69(2)(a) before any future nomination will be accepted.

Race 11
103.1 POWER FM

10:18 pm
450m

Grade 5

La Porsche was slow to begin.

Flying Bale, Cosmic Jim, La Porsche, Galba Flame and Regal Diamonds collided soon after the start
checking La Porsche, Galba Flame and Cosmic Jim. Regal Diamonds checked off Kyah Dane
approaching the first turn. La Porsche, Cosmic Jim and Regal Diamonds collided on the first turn checking
Cosmic Jim. La Porsche checked off Kyah Dane in the home straight.

Race 12
BALLARAT GAS & PLUMBING

10:37 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre race sample was taken from Jordan Allen.

Jordan Allen and Twin Terra collided soon after the start severely checking Jordan Allen. Hurricane Yella
checked off Rhode House approaching the first turn. Dyna Paul, Dyna Gray and Twin Terra collided on the
first turn checking Dyna Gray and Twin Terra. Dyna Paul and Fantasy Rhode collided approaching the
home turn. Twin Terra checked off Dyna Paul approaching the home turn. Dyna Paul, Fantasy Rhode and
Twin Terra collided on the home turn checking Fantasy Rhode and Twin Terra. Jordan Allen crossed to the
outside in the home straight severely checking Dyna Paul. Regal Gladiator and Dyna Gray collided
approaching the winning post.






