
STEWARD'S REPORT

Shepparton
Monday, 20 Jul 2015

Weather conditions: FINE

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: D. VERBERNE

Stewards: C. GENT/M. HILL

Judges: K MCMAHON/ M HYNES

Lure Drivers: B. GROOM/G. GLASS

Starter: J. CAMPBELL

Kennel Supervisor: G. GLASS

Kennel Attendants: L. HARRIS/ E FOTHERGILL

Veterinarian: DR. R. CAMERON

Race 1
GRV VBIS MAIDEN S/F1

7:13 pm
450m

Maiden Semi Final

OFFICIALS FOR MEETING:

Steward In Charge:  D Verberne

Assistant Stewards:  C Gent / M Hill

Judges:  R McMahon / M Hynes

Lure Drivers:  B Groom / G Glass

Starter:  J Campbell

Kennel Supervisor:  G Glass

Kennel Assistant:  L Harris / E Fothergill

Veterinarian:  Dr R Cameron

Roll 'Em Mighty and Dynamic Heat were slow to begin and collided soon after the start.  Limited Vision
crossed to the rail soon after the start, checking Limited Vision and She's No Manic.  Desperate Pete
checked off Moreira approaching the first turn.  Crave and Four Secrets collided several times on the first
turn, checking both greyhounds.  She's No Manic contacted the running rail approaching the home turn.

A sample was taken from Moreira - the winner of the event.

Race 2
GRV VBIS MAIDEN S/F2

7:30 pm
450m

Maiden Semi Final

She's Dee Rocket and Avatar Sandee were quick to begin.  El Evie Jimber was very slow to begin (4
lengths).  Unlawful Entry, Jive Time and Roll 'Em High collided soon after the start, checking Jive Time and
Roll 'Em High.  Unlawful Entry and Avatar Sandee collided approaching the first turn.  Lee Brilliance, Break
The Code, Unlawful Entry and She's Dee Rocket collided on the first turn, checking Break The Code and
She's Dee Rocket.  Jive ime and Avatar Sandee collided on the first turn and again approaching the home
turn, checking both greyhounds.  Jive Time galloped on the heels of She's Dee Rocket approaching the
home turn, checking both greyhounds.  El Evie Jimber galloped on the heels of Avatar Sandee
approaching the home turn, checking El Evie Jimber.  Avatar Sandee and Roll 'Em High collided in the
home straight.

She's Dee Rocket was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained superficial
spike wounds to the left fore and hind feet.  No stand down period was imposed.

A sample was taken from Unlawful Entry - the winner of the event.

Race 3
GRV VBIS MAIDEN S/F3

7:47 pm
450m

Maiden Semi Final

Lektra Oscar was slow to begin.  Dr. Rollo and Redhot Pursuit collided soon after the start, checking Dr.
Rollo.  Dr. Valhalla and Absolute Silence collided soon after the start.  Betts Goes Bang and Jumbo Jack
collided soon after the start.  Dr. Valhalla, Absolute Silence, Betts Goes Bang and Jumbo Jack collided
approaching the first turn, checking Absolute Silence and Betts Goes Bang.  Dr. Rollo and Absolute Silence
collided on the first turn, checking Dr. Rollo.  Lektra Oscar and Jumbo Jack collided on the first turn.
 Absolute Silence was held up for a run and checked off Dr. Valhalla approaching the home turn.  Dr.
Lachie raced wide entering the home straight.

A sample was taken from Redhot Pursuit - the winner of the event.

Dr. Rollo was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 4
SHEPPARTON VETERINARY CLINIC

8:07 pm
450m

Grade 7

Full Of Boloney and Finchy were slow to begin.  Asa Baby, Teecee Raider and Patrice Bale collided soon
after the start, checking Teecee Raider.  Teecee Raider checked off Patrice Bale approaching the first turn.
 Smokester, Zipping Laura and Asa Baby collided approaching the first turn, checking Finchy and severely
checking Smokester.  Zipping Laura, Asa Baby and Pendles Power collided on the first turn, checking
Zipping Laura and severely checking Asa Baby.  Full Of Boloney contacted the running rail on the first turn.



Race 5
JADE MEDIA PHOTOGRAPHY

8:28 pm
450m

Grade 5

Pursuant to GAR 104 (6) Lure Driver G Glass did not act in any official capacity for this event.

Dark Jameson and Ultima Bale were slow to begin.  Duomo Bale and Acola Rosebud collided soon after
the start, and again approaching the first turn, checking Avola Rosebud.  Premier Hawk and Lambda Bale
collided approaching the first turn.  Avola Rosebud and Bejay The Dejay collided approaching the first turn,
checking both greyhounds.  Ultima Bale, Ibrox Digger and Dark Jameson collided on the first turn,
checking Ibrox Digger and Dark Jameson.  Premier Hawk checked Duomo Bale on the home turn.  Premier
Hawk and Ibrox Digger collided on the home turn, and again entering the home straight.  Bejay The Dejay
checked off Dark Jameson in the home straight.

Ultima Bale was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained a cut to the right
ear, a 3 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 6
MARKET MEATS

8:48 pm
450m

Mixed 3/4

Punk Panther and Dyna Alchemist were slow to begin.  Roman Baroque, Xtreme Knocka and Morello
collided approaching the first turn.  Xtreme Knocka, Morello and Motangi collided on the first turn, checking
Xtreme Knocka, Morello and Punk Panther.  Roman Baroque and Punk Panther collided approaching the
home turn.

Race 7
ELITE COLLARS & LEADS

9:05 pm
450m

Grade 5

Pursuant to GAR 104 (6) Lure Driver G Glass did not act in any official capacity for this event.

Danda Flash was very slow to begin (3 lengths).  Adaman, Jordy Shiack and Fancy Assassin collided soon
after the start, checking Jordy Shiack.  Adaman and Fancy Assassin collided approaching the first turn,
checking Adamant.  Danda Flash and All Inn Ky collided on the first turn, checking All Inn Ky.  Adamant
checked off Jordy Shiack on the first turn.  Fancy Assassin and Ronaldo Magic collided on the home turn.

Race 8
FINER FRUITS (GOBIS REG ONLY)

9:26 pm
450m

Special Event

Big Ticket and Stop Moochin' collided soon after the start.  Punk Pirate and Ima Fairytale collided soon after
the start.  Stop Moochin' and Kraken Soupy collided approaching the first turn.  Cette Away and Big Ticket
collided approaching the first turn, checking both greyhounds.  Punk Pirate and Ima Fairytale collided on
the first turn, checking Ima Fairytale.  Kraken Soupy and Ima Fairytale collided on the home turn.  Cette
Away and Kraken Soupy collided entering the home straight.

A sample was taken from Grand Intention - the winner of the event.

Race 9
MANISH GUPTA ACCOUNTANTS

9:46 pm
390m

Mixed 4/5

Locked Out and Allen Malik collided approaching the first turn.  Two Forty Volt and Hawka Tron collided on
the first turn, checking Two Forty Volt and severely checking Warrior King, causing Call Me Shelby to fall as
a result.  Two Forty Volt and Allen Malik collided approaching the home turn.

Call Me Shelby was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained soreness to
the left foreleg, a strain to the left triceps, a broken left dew claw and superficial spike wounds to the right
hock, a 10 day stand down period was imposed.

Warrior King was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 10
BYERS ELECTRICAL

10:11 pm
450m

Grade 6

Zipping Simmo was slow to begin.  Zipping Tazz and Zipping Chrystal collided soon after the start.  Houso
galloped on the heels of Dr. Klaas approaching the first turn, checking Dr. Klaas, Zipping Simmo and
Houso.  Kaptain Tyne and Zipping Tazz collided approaching the first turn.  Zipping Tazz and Roll 'Em
Maggie collided on the first turn.  Zipping Simmo, Dr. Klaas, Kaptain Tyne and Houso collided on the first
turn, checking Zipping Simmo, Kaptain Tyne and Houso.  Zipping Simmo and Dr. Klaas collided on the
home turn.

Race 11
BRIAN BEARD PLUMBING

10:30 pm
450m

Grade 7

Crackerjack Bill was quick to begin.  Smashing Wild and Magic Buddie were slow to begin.  Smashing Wild
and Tat Molly collided approaching the first turn, checking Smashing Wild.  Magic Buddie checked off
Bullboar approaching the first turn.  Roll 'Em Zac and Tat Molly collided approaching the first turn, checking
both greyhounds.  Magic Buddie checked off Bullboar on the first turn and collided with Smashing Wild,
checking Smashing Wild.  Magic Buddie and Hanify's Jaxon collided on the home turn.

Hanify's Jaxon was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Stewards issued a warning to Mr W McMahon, the trainer of Hanify's Jaxon regarding the greyhound’s
racing manners in the home straight.

Race 12
SHEPPARTON NEWS

10:47 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

A pre race sample was taken from Draper Bale.

Kosmikos, Draper Bale and Northern Ghost collided soon after the start, checking Northern Ghost.  Electro
Bale and Who Told Lindylu collided approaching the first turn and again on the first turn, checking Who Told
Lindylu, Benson, Kosmikos, Draper Bale and Northern Ghost.   Better Beware checked off Who Told
Lindylu approaching the home turn.  Better Beware, Benson and Draper Bale collided on the home turn,
checking all three greyhounds.  Draper Bale marred the running of Better Beware in the home straight,
checking Better Beware.

Draper Bale was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.



Stewards spoke to Mr B Shillington, the handler of the greyhound Draper Bale regarding the greyhounds
racing manners in the home straight.  Acting under GAR 69(1) stewards charged Draper Bale with marring.
Mr B Shillington pleaded guilty to the charge, Draper Bale was found guilty and suspended for 28 days at
Shepparton and directed that the greyhound perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks), pursuant to GAR 69(2)
(a) before any future nomination will be accepted.




