
STEWARD'S REPORT

Ballarat
Wednesday, 27 Jul 2016

Weather conditions: Showers

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: A Blackmore

Stewards: M. Blood / A. Fewell & B.Blood

Judges: J. Loudon/ B. Loudon

Lure Drivers: R Phillips & S Bull

Starter: G. White

Kennel Supervisor: C. Hon

Kennel Attendants: R.O'Connor / M.McKenna

Veterinarian: Dr.H. Hodgson

Race 1
LATROBE STREET MEGA MEATS

6:58 pm
450m

Maiden

Osaka Bale was quick to begin. Jamba Lad went up with the lids at box rise and was slow to begin. Osaka
Bale crossed to the rail approaching the first turn, checking Nitro Reactor. Nukstar and Quina Bale collided
approaching the first turn. Nukstar checked off Quina Bale approaching the first turn, checking Jamba Lad.
Nitro Reactor brushed the running rail on the first turn. Jamba Lad and Nitro Reactor collided approaching
the home turn, checking Nitro Reactor. Julie Flash and Quina Bale collided approaching the winning post. 

A sample was taken from Manie Flash - the winner of the event. 

Nitro Reactor was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found. 

Race 2
ENERGIS SMART ENERGY

SOLUTIONS
7:18 pm
450m

Grade 7

Mr. T. Dailly, representative of Oscorp Bale declared a new weight of 35.3kg for the greyhound in
accordance with GAR 39(2). Oscorp Bale last raced at 33.6kg.

Lani Bale, Nawala Ginto and Celica Bale collided approaching the first turn, checking Nawala Ginto. Lani
Bale checked off Celica Bale approaching the first turn, checking Nawala Ginto. Nawala Ginto and Big
Cold Burst collided approaching the first turn. Baron Charlie and Super Smarty collided on the first turn.
Lani Bale checked off Joffa's Oldboy on the first turn. Lani Bale checked off Super Smarty on the home
turn. 

Race 3
EUREKA CONCRETE FINAL

7:38 pm
390m

Grade 7 Final

The Club Veterinary Surgeon examined Push The Trolley and no illness was detected. The greyhound was
a late scratching at 6:02PM due to weight variation (GAR 39). A 10 day stand down period was imposed.
Trainer Mr. B. Cook was fined the sum of $100.

Allen Clown and Captain Pete were slow to begin. Fiery Felix, Krisbar Fly Half and Elrond Bale collided
soon after the start. Krisbar Fly Half, Elrond Bale and Allen Clown collided on the first turn, checking Krisbar
Fly Half and Hillbilly Hell. Hillbilly Hell and Dane Daisy collided approaching the winning post. 

A sample was taken from Fiery Felix - the winner of the event. 

Race 4
R & J BATTERIES

7:58 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7

Lektra Timon and Vancouver Star collided soon after the start, checking Vancouver Star. Bingo Sally
checked off Vancouver Star approaching the first turn. Adelaide Bale and Vancouver Star collided
approaching the first turn. Logistic Kid checked off Menindee on the first turn. Adelaide Bale and Vancouver
Star collided approaching the home turn. Vancouver Star and Golden Planet collided approaching the
home turn, checking Golden Planet. Spring Recall checked off Logistoc Kid approaching the home turn.
Menindee checked off Lektra Timon approaching the home turn, checking Adelaide Bale. Logistic Kid and
Menindee collided on the home turn. Bingo Sally raced wide entering the home straight. 

A sample was taken from Lektra Timon - the winner of the event. 

Race 5
BRENDAN DODD SIGNS

8:18 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Showtime Mystery.

Eumeralla Donny and Spritely Boy were slow to begin. Cash In Looper checked off Penelopes Cruzn soon
after the start. Tronnie Oldfield checked off Penelopes Cruzn approaching the first turn. Cash In Looper
checked off Tronnie Oldfield approaching the first turn. Penelopes Cruzn and Dynamo's Gift collided
approaching the home turn. Dynamo's Gift checked off Tronnie Oldfield in the home straight. Tronnie
Oldfield, Penelopes Cruzn and Showtime Mystery collided in the home straight. 

A sample was taken from Nymeria - the winner of the event. 

Race 6 Dyna Peanut and Made First collided soon after the start. Smart Maxwell and Usain I'm Nutty collided on



BOTTLE-O
8:38 pm
545m

Mixed 4/5

the first turn. Eaton Bale checked off Djays Larry approaching the second turn. Dyna Peanut checked off
Smart Maxwell on the second turn. Usain I'm Nutty, Smart Maxwell and Eaton Bale collided approaching
the home turn. Smart Maxwell checked off Usain I'm Nutty approaching the home turn. Eaton Bale checked
off Smart Maxwell on the home turn, checking Dyna Peanut. Usain I'm Nutty and Smart Maxwell collided in
the home straight. 

A sample was taken from Louisiana Lil - the winner of the event. 

Race 7
LYNETTE'S FLORIST

8:59 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Allen Jeer.

Allen Jeer and Stefanovic collided soon after the start. Farmer Brown and Avatar Fox collided soon after
the start. Percy's Rebel and Elsa Bale collided aproaching the first turn, checking Elsa Bale. Home Runner
checked off Percy's Rebel approaching the first turn. Percy's Rebel, Farmer Brown and Avatar Fox collided
on the first turn, checking Farmer Brown. Absolute Roarer, Avatar Fox, Percy's Rebel and Stefanovic
collided on the first turn, checking Avatar Fox and Stefanovic. Farmer Brown and Avatar Fox collided
approaching the home turn, checking Avatar Fox and Home Runner. Home Runner checked off Avatar Fox
approaching the home turn, checking Home Runner. Home Runner and Stefanovic raced wide in the home
straight. 

Race 8
STRIDES FUNCTION CENTRE

9:19 pm
450m

Mixed 4/5

To The Galo's, Monaleen Deejay and Fabstar collided approaching the first turn. Sonic Dash checked off
Darpa Bale approaching the first turn. Sonic Dash, Lyka Allen and Monaleen Deejay collided on the first
turn, checking Lyka Allen. Sonic Dash and Monaleen Deejay collided approaching the home turn. Lyka
Allen raced wide on the home turn. 

Lyka Allen was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained split webbing to the
left hind foot, a ten day stand down period was imposed. 

Race 9
LIL DICKIE

9:37 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Marley Sprite.

Aggi Den was quick to begin. Chief Bale and Honouring Percy collided soon after the start. Suspicious Lee
and Nero Joe collided approaching the first turn. Suspicious Lee and Honouring Percy collided on the first
turn, checking Suspicious Lee. Suspicious Lee and Chief Bale collided on the first turn. Aggi Den and
Interlaken collided approaching the home turn, checking both greyhounds. Honouring Percy checked off
Interlaken on the home turn. Aggi Den raced wide in the home straight. Evening Major and Interlaken
collided several times in the home straight. 

Race 10
TOPCAT VIDEO

9:58 pm
390m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Harlon.

Harlon and Maximum Bella collided soon after the start, checking both greyhounds. Miss Tron and Shifty
Jack collided soon after the start, checking Miss Tron. Harlon and Maximum Bella collided approaching the
first turn. Midnight Ride and Shifty Jack collided on the first turn, checking Midnight Ride and Jackie Baxter.
Miss Tron and Harlon collided on the first turn, checking Miss Tron. Midnight Ride, Jackie Baxter and Iyliss
Bale collided approaching the home turn, checking Midnight Ride and Jackie Baxter. Miss Tron, Harlon
and Maximum Bella collided on the home turn, checking Miss Tron. 

A sample was taken from Bide Time - the winner of the event. 

Miss Tron was vetted following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.  

Race 11
MEGA MERCH RURAL & PET

10:24 pm
390m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Amlin's Magic.

Satin Ice was quick to begin. Best Shared was slow to begin. Shades Of Sassy and Best Shared collided
soon after the start. Amlin's Magic and Best Shared collided approaching the first turn. Lady Juar galloped
on the heels of Satin Ice approaching the home turn. Satin Ice raced wide in the home straight. Best
Shared crossed to the outside in the home straight. Call Me Deita and Lady Juar collided approaching the
winning post. 

Race 12
TAB - MORE THAN JUST WINNING

10:42 pm
390m

Grade 5

Stewards spoke to Mr,J.Gigliotti the trainer of Parsnip regarding the length of time the greyhound has had
between races.  Parsnip last raced on 2/04/2016.  Mr Gigliotti stated that the greyhound was returning to
racing after a Broken Hinh Toe.

Sketchy Nick was a late scratching at 10.36PM on the advice of the Club’s Veterinary Surgeon due to
injury. A fourteen day stand down period was imposed.

A pre-race sample was taken from Pretty Machine.

Dom Daisy ckecked off Girder Fork on the first turn. Daryl Dixon, Parsnip and Mark's Boy collided
approaching the home turn, checking Daryl Dixon and Mark's Boy. Dom Daisy and Parsnip raced wide in
the home straight. Pretty Machine and Samsara Lass collided approaching the winning post, checking
Samsara Lass. 




