
STEWARD'S REPORT

Horsham
Tuesday, 26 Jul 2016

Weather conditions: OVERCAST

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: J REA

Stewards: D COOKSON / P WATSON /B.TUCKER

Judges: R DUMESNEY / J MIBUS

Lure Drivers: R HAMILTON / S ARNOLD

Starter: N BERGEN

Kennel Supervisor: R.TURMINE

Kennel Attendants: R.PARFETT / S.JANCOVIC

Veterinarian: Dr G NURSE

Race 1
CRYMELON KENNELS HT1

3:47 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

The track curator advised that the track was medium harrowed on Wednesday 20th July 2016.

A pre-race sample was taken from Rangiora upon arrival at the course, prior to kennelling.

Vectis Secret and Calvadoss were quick to begin.  Rangiora and Zero Zephyr were slow to begin.  Forever
Merry raced wide soon after the start.  Calvadoss and Podium Sensation collided approaching the first turn,
checking Calvadoss.  Hi Ho Geronimo and Yeah Mint collided approaching the first turn, checking Yeah
Mint and Zero Zephyr and causing Zero Zephyr to race wide.  Hi Ho Geronimo checked off Forever Merry
on the first turn.  Rangiora and Hi Ho Geronimo collided on the home turn. 

A sample was taken from Vectis Secret - the winner of the event.

Race 2
FIG TREE CAFE HT2

4:09 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

Ollie Aztec was very slow to begin (3L).  Podium Babe was slow to begin.  Crackerjack Boof checked off
Quiet Talk soon after the start.  Magic Karma, Cosmic Wave and Col's Wallett collided soon after the start,
checking Cosmic Wave.  Crackerjack Boof and Podium Babe collided approaching the first turn.  Podium
Babe checked off Quiet Talk on the first turn, checking Marcus Daking.  Cosmic Wave and Podium Babe
collided approaching the home turn.  Ollie Aztec checked off Crackerjack Boof on the home turn.  Quiet Talk
tired over the concluding stages and was vetted following the event.

Quiet Talk was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 3
3WM/MIXX FM HT3

4:24 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

A pre race sample was taken from Rayvon.

Good Boloney, Fabregas Lara and Red Lagoon were slow to begin.  Rayvon and Rosie's Gift collided soon
after the start.  Rosie's Gift, Surf In Vane and Red Lagoon collided approaching the first turn, checking
Rosie's Gift.  Good Boloney raced wide throughout the event.

Red Hot Summer was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 4
WILKIE COURIERS PTY. LTD. HT4

4:44 pm
410m

Maiden Heat

A pre race sample was taken from Miss Pie.

Johnny Jaffa, Podium Express and I'll Be Black collided soon after the start.  Work Mate, Witch Kilty, I'll Be
Black and My Sirion collided on the first turn, checking I'l Be Black, Johnny Jaffa and Podium Express.
 Podium Express checked off Johnny Jaffa in the home straight.

Race 5
OLSEN & CARTER PTY LTD

5:08 pm
480m

Mixed 6/7

Just Tooie and Laboomba were slow to begin.  Amigo and Sooty Epsom collided on the first turn.  Sooty
Epsom and Just Tooie collided on the home turn.  Laboomba raced wide in the home straight.

Race 6
GRV VIC BRED (0-6 WINS) DISTANCE

FINAL
5:23 pm
570m

Restricted Win Final

This event was hand started.

Jasmine Lilly, Mi Diablo, Where's Dex Star, Heaps Of Boloney and Lord Kitchener collided soon after the
start, checking Heaps Of Boloney, Lord Kitchener, Mi Diablo and Jasmine Lilly.  Mi Diablo checked off
Heaps Of Boloney entering the back straight.  Casanova checked off Zero Knockin' approaching the
second turn.



A sample was taken from Zero Knockin' - the winner of the event.

Race 7
STAGGER AT STUD

5:45 pm
410m

Free For All

Bigbad Fiji was quick to begin.  Tail Pipe was slow to begin.  Smart Action and Tail Pipe collided soon after
the start.  Smart Action and Handsome Cosmo collided soon after the start, checking Handsome Cosmo.
 Hollywood Jones and Smart Action collided approaching the first turn, checking Smart Action and Tail
Pipe.  Bigbad Fiji and Bills Back collided on the first turn, checking Bills Back.  Hollywood Jones raced wide
in the home straight.

Race 8
OSCAR FURNITURE

6:05 pm
480m

Mixed 4/5

A pre race sample was taken from Mepunga Treasure.

Irish Whip, Cashin' In and Twist Of Thunder collided soon after the start, checking Irish Whip and Cashin In.
 Greysynd Chief and Twist Of Thunder collided approaching the first turn. Dream Of Fame faltered
approaching the first turn. Mepunga Treasure and Shotgun Doll collided on the first turn.  Greysynd Chief,
Twist Of Thunder and Noosa Jet collided on the first turn, checking Twist Of Thunder and Greysynd Chief.
 Twist Of Thunder checked off Mepunga Treasure entering the home straight.  Mepunga Treasure and Twist
Of Thunder collided approaching the winning post.  

Dream Of Fame was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injured
right hindleg back muscle and right foreleg shoulder muscle, a 28 day stand down period was imposed.

Race 9
THE WEEKLY ADVERTISER

6:21 pm
410m

Grade 7

Stewards spoke to Mr M Chilcott, the trainer of Greysynd Hawk, regarding the length of time the greyhound
has had between races.  Greysynd Hawk last raced on 28 February 2016.  Mr Chilcott stated that the
greyhound was resuming racing following an injury to the right hock.

Gundy's Gold was quick to begin.  Yipy Mississippi, Pop Do It and Greysynd Hawk were slow to begin.
 Gundy's Gold, Jazzy Diva and Pop Do It collided approaching the first turn, checking Gundy's Gold, Pop
Do It, Jazzy Diva and Mighty Duck.  Jazzy Diva checked off Pop Do It approaching the home turn.  Yipy
Mississippi and Greysynd Hawk collided approaching the home turn.  Gundy's Gold and Mighty Duck
raced wide entering the home straight.

Race 10
DELLAR'S BARBEQUES GALORE (2-3

WINS)
6:40 pm
410m

Restricted Win

A pre-race sample was taken from Moltisanti.

Miss Lumens was slow to begin.  Superstar Jatt, Tills Henry and Nirranda Ripper collided soon after the
start, checking Tills Henry.  Lemon Chicken, Superstar Jatt and Pacific Magic collided on the first turn,
checking Lemon Chicken, Brahma's Pride, Tills Henry and Miss Lumens.

Tills Henry was vetted following the event.  It was reported that there was no apparent injury found.

Race 11
WHITE HART HOTEL

7:05 pm
410m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race sample was taken from Colden Star.

Colden Star was very slow to begin (3L).  Dynamic Spin and Beyond The Vally were slow to begin.
 Beyond The Vally checked off Watta Rush soon after the start.  Watta Rush checked off Uptown Funk
approaching the first turn.  Beyond The Vally and Colden Star collided on the first turn.  Just Be Patient,
Dynamic Spin and Rylee's Marshall collided on the first turn, checking Rylee's Marshall, Dynamic Spin and
Beyond The Vally.  Uptown Funk checked off Batty Allen approaching the winning post.

A sample was taken from Just Be Patient - the winner of the event.

Colden Star was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained injured right
foreleg bicep, right and left foreleg shoulders and right foreleg chest muscle, a 14 day stand down period
was imposed.

Stewards spoke to Mrs P Bryant, the trainer of Colden Star, and reminded her of her responsibilities in
regards to ensuring that she fully clears the lead from the greyhound prior to placing it in the boxes.

Stewards issued a warning to Mrs P Bryant, the trainer of Colden Star, regarding the greyhound's racing
manners approaching the home turn.

Race 12
WIMMERA TROPHIES & GIFTS

7:25 pm
410m

Grade 5

A pre-race sample was taken from Here's The Trump.

Pingu was slow to begin.  Here's The Trump checked off Brazen Fool approaching the first turn.  Mortal Sin
and Here's The Trump collided on the first turn, checking Mortal Sin.  Rowchester Star and Red Hot Bella
collided on the first turn, checking Pingu.  Red Hot Bella raced wide on the home turn and in the home
straight.

Mortal Sin was vetted following the event.  It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injured left
hindleg thigh, a five day stand down period was imposed.




