
STEWARD'S REPORT

Shepparton
Monday, 28 Oct 2024

Weather conditions: Fine

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: R.Fazulla

Stewards: H.Harvey, D.Barber & I.Taylor

Judges: T.Morrison

Lure Drivers: S.Baldwin

Starter: G.Willis

Kennel Supervisor: J.Jubb

Kennel Attendants: N.Groom, J.LaRosa, K.Stevens & M.Fotherfill

Veterinarian: Dr N.DeSilva

Race 1
13 RACES TODAY

2:55 pm
450m

Maiden

Trickle and Too Cold were quick to begin. One Word Answer and Aston Nelson were slow to begin. 

Race 2
GRV VICBRED MAIDEN FINAL

3:17 pm
450m

Maiden Final

Panadero Star, Overland Boy and Honey Bunny were quick to begin. Feikuai Calvin was slow to begin. 

A post–race urine sample was taken from Panadero Star – the winner of the event. 

Race 3
SPORTSBET GREEN TICKS

3:37 pm
390m

Grade 5

Cocktail was slow to begin. Ace Redeemer was very slow to begin. 

Race 4
DREAMCHASERS - TICKETS ON SALE

NOW
3:52 pm
390m

Grade 5

No More Issues was quick to begin. Tropic Man and Causing Rubble were slow to begin. 

Race 5
NORTHERN DISTRICTS CUP HT1

4:07 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Aston Kennedy was slow to begin.

A post–race urine sample was taken from Aston Kennedy – the winner of the event. 

Race 6
NORTHERN DISTRICTS CUP HT2

4:27 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Deputy Fred and City Limit were slow to begin.

A post–race urine sample was taken from Rhythmic Energy – the winner of the event. 

Race 7 Noctilucent was quick to begin. Coconut Carter and Demon Kysaiah were slow to begin.



NORTHERN DISTRICTS CUP HT3
4:47 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Spoken (checked on the first turn and lost ground) underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was
found to have a right pencil muscle injury. A 5 day stand down period was imposed. - no apparent injury
was reported.

Red Ed – Stewards were satisfied with the boxing of the greyhound and removed the boxed first
endorsement for future events, in accordance with GAR 106.

A post–race urine sample was taken from Noctilucent – the winner of the event. 

Race 8
NORTHERN DISTRICTS CUP HT4

5:09 pm
450m

S/E Heat

Aston Aurelia – Late scratching at 10:51am when Ms Michelle Mallia reported the greyhound to have a
illness (GAR 76). A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards will require a veterinary certificate
pursuant to GAR 19(3)(w) before any future nominations will be accepted.

Crypto Royalty was quick to begin. Tat Leah and Missin' The Bug were slow to begin.

Tat Leah (faltered on the first turn and subsequently tailed off) underwent a post-race veterinary
examination and was found to have a dislocation and ruptured ligament to the right hind toe and a
dislocated right hock. A 28 day stand down period was imposed.

A post-race urine sample was taken from Kraken Whisky - the winner of the event. 

Following the running of this event, Stewards inspected the track on the first turn and deemed it
satisfactory for racing.

Race 9
ELITE COLLARS & LEADS

5:25 pm
450m

Mixed 6/7

Bag Of Snags – Late scratching at 10:28am due to non–arrival (GAR 86 and LR 39). A 28 day stand down
period was imposed. Mr R.Clark informed Stewards that he had a vehicle breakdown on–route to the track.
Stewards advised Mr Clark that evidence of the breakdown will need to be submitted, to the satisfaction of
Stewards, within 72 hours of the occurrence that caused the non–arrival. The matter will be re–evaluated
upon receipt of this evidence.

A pre–race urine sample was taken from Jaimandy Frank.

Up Hill Shiloh was quick to begin. Lucky Lisa and Judgemental were slow to begin. 

Race 10
RSN GREY AREAS - WEDNESDAY &

FRIDAY
5:47 pm
390m

Mixed 6/7

Represent was slow to begin.

Custard Art (checked and fell on the first turn) underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was
found to have a right hip injury. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Soda Pheonix (checked and fell on the first turn) underwent a post-race veterinary examination - no
apparent injury was reported. 

Race 11
SPORTSBET MAKE IT LOOK EASY 

6:11 pm
390m

Mixed 3/4

Oriental Ophelia – Late scratching at 10:28am due to non–arrival (GAR 86 and LR 39). A 28 day stand
down period was imposed. Mr R.Clark informed Stewards that he had a vehicle breakdown on–route to the
track. Stewards advised Mr Clark that evidence of the breakdown will need to be submitted, to the
satisfaction of Stewards, within 72 hours of the occurrence that caused the non–arrival. The matter will be
re–evaluated upon receipt of this evidence.

Artemis One was slow to begin. 

Race 12
ONE MORE RACE TO GO

6:27 pm
450m

Grade 5

Rashid -  Late scratching at 6:21pm on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 92) due to
dehydration. A 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Sha Tin King was quick to begin. 

On High Alert (marred Buck Shines approaching the home turn) underwent a post-race veterinary
examination and was found to have a laceration to the left hind toe. A 5 day stand down period was
imposed. Stewards spoke to Ms Karen Pitt regarding On High Alert’s racing manners approaching the
home turn. Acting under the provisions of GAR 123, On High Alert was charged with marring. Ms. Pitt
pleaded guilty to the charge. On High Alert was suspended for 28 days at Shepparton and must perform a
Satisfactory Trial in accordance with GAR 127, and pursuant to GAR 132, before any future nomination will
be accepted.

Race 13
SHEPPARTON RACE 13

6:45 pm
450m

Grade 5

A pre-race urine sample was taken from Especial Pip.

Arts Inferno and Especial Pip were quick to begin. Catch My Drift was slow to begin.




