
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Monday, 02 Feb 2015

Weather conditions: OVERCAST

Track condition: GOOD

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: C.Scott

Stewards: B. JINKS/T.FISH/G. BROMLEY

Judges: R DREW/ S ETTRIDGE

Lure Drivers: D. MAYE/T. DEMPSEY

Starter: P.Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: N. Hutchinson

Kennel Attendants: S.Ettridge / S.Ferguson

Veterinarian: Dr. S.KARAMATIC

Race 1
www.tab.com.au

3:52 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Officials for Meeting

Steward In Charge: C. Scott

Assistant Stewards: B. Jinks, T. Fish & G. Bromley

Judges: R. Drew & S. Ettridge

Lure Drivers: D. Maye & T. Dempsey

Starter: P. Nicholls

Kennel Supervisor: N. Hutchinson 

Kennel Attendants: S. Ettridge & S. Ferguson

Veterinarian: Dr. S. Karamatic

Meeting Comments:

Re-Vetted Greyhound - Senorita Daphne was presented for a re-vet at the conclusion of kennelling and
was Not Cleared to race. Acting under GAR83, Stewards directed that a urine sample be taken from the
greyhound.

Dyna Nodoka was presented for a veterinary examination after being requested by Stewards after failing to
be vetted at the Shepparton meeting on 31/1/15. It was reported the greyhound sustained injuries to the
neck and right shoulder, a 5 day stand down period was imposed.

Brandy's Puzzle was quick to begin. Patty And Eye, Sacramento Sal and Watta Genius were slow to begin.
Blue Boy Hudson checked off Che Road soon after the start. Yarn Bale, Che Road and Can Of Coke
collided approaching the first turn, checking Che Road. Patty And Eye and Che Road collided on the first
turn, checking Patty And Eye, Che Road and Watta Genius. 

A sample was taken from Sacramento Sal - winner of the event. 

Race 2
THE BECKLEY CENTRE GEELONG

4:14 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Super Dot was slow to begin. Still Bluffing and Dynamic Dash collided soon after the start. Maple Close
and Marmion Star collided on the first turn. Super Dot contacted the running rail on the first turn. Super Dot
checked off Still Bluffing in the home straight and stumbled. Super Dot checked off Feral Beryl in the home
straight. 

Race 3
BECKLEY PARK COMMUNITY

MARKET
4:32 pm
460m

Tier 3 - Maiden

Queen Elma, Destini Diamond and Louisiana Lil were slow to begin. Stylish Gun and Why Not Lisa
collided on the first turn, checking Why Not Lisa, Destini Diamond and severely checking Stylish Gun.
Destini Diamond and Louisiana Lil raced wide in the home straight. 

Race 4
P & R FOOD SERVICES

4:54 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 7

Ragtime Lucy was quick to begin. Just Gracie was slow to begin. Ragtime Lucy, Bullet Express and Jem's
Princess collided on the first turn, checking Bullet Express. Klaus Bale and Just Gracie collided on the first
turn, checking Just Gracie. Froffies and Bullet Express collided approaching the home turn. Mini Hawk and
Jem's Princess collided several times approaching the home turn. Mini Hawk checked off Jem's Princess
on the home turn, checking Klaus Bale. Bullet Express and Froffies collided entering the home straight. 



Race 5
MERV JENNINGS SIGNS

5:12 pm
460m

Mixed 6/7

Georgia's Osti checked off Galloping Betsy soon after the start. Cruisy Surprise, Run Sophie Run and
Dawn Cruise collided approaching the first turn, checking Run Sophie Run, Hit Star and Galloping Betsy.
Galloping Betsy checked off Hit Star approaching the home turn, checking Georgia's Osti and causing
Galloping Betsy to stumble. Cruisy Surprise and Beljay Belle collided approaching the home turn, checking
Cruisy Surprise.

Race 6
KROCK
5:34 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

Cruisy's Gift was quick to begin. Angel's Chief was slow to begin. Mighty Hulk and Precious Pink collided
soon after the start. Ruby Dutchess and Cruisy's Luck collided on the first turn, checking Ruby Dutchess,
Angel's Chief and Wally Portelli. Cruisy's Luck and Ruby Dutchess collided in the home straight. Cruisy's
Luck checked off Le Doyen approaching the winning post. 

Race 7
SITA AUSTRALIA

5:52 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Thrashing Osti was slow to begin. Disruptive Spin and One Bad Wrist collided soon after the start. Hot
Carbon and Mermaid Princess collided on the first turn. Schmoo, Usain Buzza and Disruptive Spin collided
on the first turn, checking Usain Buzza. Hot Carbon checked off Wait Til Dark approaching the home turn.
Wait Til Dark checked off One Bad Wrist on the home turn. Usain Buzza and Disruptive Spin collided on the
home turn.

A sample was taken from One Bad Wrist - winner of the event.

Race 8
BUXTON REAL ESTATE - GEELONG

6:16 pm
460m

Grade 5 T3

Civil Pursuit was slow to begin and checked off Regal Gladiator soon after the start. Renewable Energy
checked off How Time Fly's on the first turn. Kifinti and El Roscoe collided on the first turn. Regal Gladiator
checked off Civil Pursuit approaching the home turn. 

A sample was taken from Velloway - winner of the event. 

Race 9
GEELONG AUSTRALIA

6:32 pm
400m

Tier 3 - Grade 6

Kitty's Dream and Soul Man collided soon after the start. Where's Exford and Just Push On collided soon
after the start. Soul Man, Mermaid Millie and Red Bomber collided on the first turn. Where's Exford raced
wide in the home straight. Where's Exford and Stylish Fantasy collided approaching the winning post. 

Race 10
XTREME TECHNOLOGY

6:56 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

A pre race sample was taken from Volcanic Rock.

Artic Osti was slow to begin. Regal Villain and Key Largo Prince collided approaching the first turn,
checking Regal Villain, Giants Dance, Mind Bender and Artic Osti. Key Largo Prince checked off Volcanic
Rock approaching the home turn. Key Largo Prince checked off Stylish Chips approaching the home turn.
Volcanic Rock checked off Stylish on the home turn, checking Key Largo Prince. Giants Dance and Artic
Osti raced wide in the home straight. 

Stewards spoke to Ms M. Brealey, the handler regarding her difficulty in boxing the greyhound Regal
Villain. Stewards directed that Regal Villain be boxed first in future events.

 

Race 11
MILLERS MUZZLES

7:19 pm
400m

Grade 5 T3

Ivy Lane, Go Hootie and Osti's Explorer were slow to begin. Strike Me Mad and Black Gypsy collided soon
after the start. Ivy Lane and Go Hootie collided on the first turn. Strike Me Mad checked off Osti's Explorer
on the first turn. Osti's Explorer and Suspicious Tessa collided on the home turn. 

Satisfactory Trial Results - Elite Lucy trialled over the 460m from box 7, weight 28.3, the greyhound was
placed 1st in a field of 4. The time of the trial was 26:72, the greyhound won by a margin of 3 lengths. Elite
Lucy was Cleared. 

Satisfactory Trial Results - Elbo Bale trialled over the 460m from box 1, weight 33.2, the greyhound was
placed 3rd in a field of 4. The time of the trial was 26:72, the greyhound beaten by a margin of 5.5 lengths.
Elbo Bale was Cleared. 




