
STEWARD'S REPORT

Healesville
Sunday, 05 Jan 2025

Weather conditions: Overcast

Track condition: Good

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge: J. Jeffery

Stewards: J. Smith & D. Makohon

Judges: L. Gough

Lure Drivers: B. Rogers

Starter: S. Aquilina

Kennel Supervisor: B. Harrison

Kennel Attendants: C. Wilson, S. Preston, S. Aquilina & T. Varchione

Veterinarian: Dr. Andrew Kalinowski

Race 1
RIDE FOR LUCY

10:32 am
350m

Maiden

In accordance with the GRV Hot Weather Policy, this meeting was deemed ‘Heat Affected’. At the
commencement of kennelling, the outside temperature was 27.7 degrees and the kennel temperature was
19.9 degrees. Stewards continually monitored the temperature at the venue, as per the GRV Hot Weather
Policy.

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

That's My Type - New declared weight of 38.3kg, last raced at 37.2kg. 

Clyde and Mrs. Who were quick to begin.

Mr. Fortitude went up with the lids at box rise, was slow to begin, collided with Bonta on multiple occasions
in-running and ultimately performed below market expectation. A post-race veterinary examination
revealed a right long head triceps muscle injury as well as bruising on the right metatarsal region. A 7 day
stand down period was imposed. 

Stewards spoke to Mr. Daniel Turnley regarding the difficulty in boxing Mr. Fortitude in this event. A warning
was issued pursuant to GAR 106(2), and Stewards will continue to monitor the box manners of Mr.
Fortitude at future starts.

A post-race urine sample was taken from Clyde - winner of the event. 

Race 2
"THE SHED" @ Healesville Greys

10:47 am
300m

Mixed 6/7

Caped Crusader, Bull Durham and Sidra Holland were slow to begin.

A post–race urine sample was taken from Butterfly Girl – the winner of the event.

Race 3
MONTROSE IGA LIQUOR VETERANS

11:06 am
300m

S/E Veteran

Ulna – Late scratching at 9:53am on the advice of the On–Track Veterinarian (GAR 92) due to a sesamoid
injury on the left fore. A 7 day stand down period was imposed.

Crackerjack Jet - New declared weight of 31.9kg, last raced at 30.3kg.

A pre-race urine sample was taken from Reverse Sweep. 

Fibularis was slow to begin. 

Bumpy's Dad Roy attempted to shift out on multiple occasions in-running. Stewards spoke to Mr. Gary
Cowcher regarding the racing manners of Bumpy's Dad Roy. After hearing submissions from Mr. Cowcher,
viewing the available race footage, and having their own observations, Stewards took no further action.

Stewards conferred with the judges regarding the margin and finishing times for 2nd place between
Fibularis and Bumpy's Dad Roy. A margin was visible in the photo finish image with the actual finishing
time for Fibularis being 16.8335 compared to 16.8340 for Bumpy's Dad Roy. However, as FastTrack is
limited to displaying three decimal places, both times were automatically rounded to 16.834, and as such
no margin is displayed in FastTrack.

Race 4
RSN GREY AREAS - WEDNESDAY &

FRIDAY
11:22 am

350m
Mixed 6/7

Frenzy Attack crashed to the rail at box rise and railed throughout the event.



Race 5
CENTRAL SCAFFOLDS

11:37 am
350m

Grade 5

Glorious Glory was quick to begin. Chop and Minh Georgy were slow to begin. 

Race 6
SPORTSBET FINAL (1-4 WINS)

11:57 am
350m

Restricted Win Final

The start was delayed by approximately three minutes due to operational activities.

Ivory Narwhal was slow to begin.

Talk Is Cheap raced ungenerously and shifted out on multiple occasions between the 200m and 100m
markers before ultimately colliding with Sailaway Gin. A post-race veterinary examination revealed a right
long head triceps muscle injury. A 10 day stand down period was imposed. Stewards spoke to Kennel
Represenative Mr. Martin Galea regarding the racing manners of Talk Is Cheap. After hearing submissions
from Mr. Galea, viewing the available race footage and having their own observations, a warning was
issued.

Race 7
CROYDON HOMING PIGEON CLUB

12:14 pm
300m

Free For All

Pursuant to GAR 75(6), C. Wilson, Club Official, did not act in any official capacity that may have, in any
way, affected the outcome of this event.

Posh Paws was quick to begin. 

Destini Paladin raced wide. 

Race 8
GORSKI ENGINEERING 

12:29 pm
350m

Mixed 4/5

A pre-race urine sample was taken from High End Cash. 

High End Cash, Invictus Harry and Applicant were slow to begin. Aston Tommy was slow to begin. 

Aston Tommy (Handler's Request) underwent a post-race veterinary examination and was found to have a
laceration on its upper lip. A 7 day stand down period was imposed. 

Race 9
PITSTOP MOWER REPAIRS

12:48 pm
350m

Grade 5

Blonde Mustang was slow to begin and raced wide. 

Race 10
MR HUMMER LIMOS DAMSELS DASH

1:07 pm
350m

Grade 5

A pre-race urine sample was taken from Sweet Valentine. 

Kelly Jane and Aston Pace were slow to begin. 

Race 11
JASON McKEOWN PHOTOGRAPHY

1:25 pm
300m

Grade 5

A pre-race urine sample was taken from Sonic Diesel. 

Cruella and Sonic Diesel were quick to begin.

Race 12
SPORTSBET NOBODY DOES IT

EASIER
1:44 pm
300m

Grade 5

Demon Kysaiah was slow to begin.




