
STEWARD'S REPORT

Shepparton
Monday, 01 Dec 2003

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
VETSEARCH HT1

7:07 pm
440m

Maiden Heat

Deekay's Duke slow out. Cambah checked off the heels of Panorama Bud soon after start. Cambah
checked off the heels of Deekay's Duke approaching first turn. Panorama Bud checked off the heels of
Highland's Run approaching home turn checking Deekay's Duke. Highland's Run checked off the heels of
Panorama Bud approaching home turn. Stan Nollie and Highland's Run collided home turn. Vetted:
Cambah (Slight tear right hind triangle stand down 10 days)

Race 2
TRUEDATA HT2

7:26 pm
440m

Maiden Heat

Deekays Blackie, Storm Pattern and Witchery Woman slow out. Falling Leaves crossed to inside soon after
start checking Deekay's Blackie, Natural Havoc, Storm Pattern, Sassy Sibel, Bubbles Ahoy, Witchery
Woman and Jye's Legacy. Natural Havoc and Falling Leaves collided first turn, home turn and again
entering home straight. Natural Havoc and Storm Pattern collided home straight.

Race 3
FINER FRUITS FINAL (GOBIS)

7:46 pm
440m

Maiden Final

Knockabout Fred and Carbon Bale slow out. Knockabout Fred checked off the heels of Lighting Action
soon after start. Lighting Action, Fort Stroller and Wild Jorgia collided first turn checking Fort Stroller,
Carbon Bale and Wild Jorgia. Lighting Action, Knockabout Fred, Cazzez Best and Bertundy Wright collided
and checked approaching home turn. Lighting Action fell as a result. Vetted: Lighting Action (Right thigh
strain, stand down 7 days.) Samples: Cape Awesome (Winner of event)

Race 4
SHEPPARTON NEWS HT3

8:06 pm
440m

Maiden Heat

Xia Storm, Devon Duchess, Chewbacka Jacka and Crank Up Liz slow out. Xia Storm and Iron Eyes Cody
collided and checked first turn. Iron Eyes Cody and Crank Up Liz collided home turn and again entering
home straight.

Race 5
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT1

8:26 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Dusty McLaren (Late scratching 8:03pm due to injury) Selma, Pure Method and Rogue Warrior slow out.
Pure Method, Twilight Opal and Rapid Deception checked approaching first turn. Lady Lilabel checked off
the heels of Big Ginger Park first turn checking Twilight Opal and Rapid Deception. Lady Lilabel and Rapid
Deception collided home turn.

Race 6
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT2

8:46 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Run Injected, Baltic Ice and Claretown Crisis slow out. Patient Penny and Bradbury Bale collided soon
after start checking Bradbury Bale, Backlash Country and Baltic Ice. Bradbury Bale fell as a result. Vetted:
Bradbury Bale - Spike wound right fore leg slight strain right carpys, stand down 10 days.

Race 7
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT3

Zephyr, Deekay's Romeo, Wyuna Playboy and Exciting Bundy slow out. Deekay's Romeo checked off the
heels of Like Lava first turn. Denise Bale checked off the heels of Born A Jewel first turn. Denise Bale
checked off the heels of Montoya Magic home turn, severely checking Wyuna Playboy. Samples: Zephyr



9:06 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

(Winner of race)

Race 8
PARUMBA STUD

9:26 pm
440m

Mixed 3/4

Booma Queen, Tat Bear and Some Ability slow out. Thorpe Bale and Dainty Jack collided soon after start
checking Thorpe Bale. Tat Bear and Some Ability collided approaching first turn, checking Some Ability.
Take The Prize crossed to inside first turn checking Booma Queen, Tat Bear, Some Ability, Thorpe Bale and
Dainty Jack.

Race 9
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT4

9:46 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Metho's Magic, Viking Jack, Bobby's County and Clutha Bale slow out. War Chest and China's Fire collided
approaching first turn checking China's Fire. Metho's Magic checked off the heels of Viking Jack first turn.
Rotkara Tiger and Ever Clear collided first turn checking Ever Clear. Ever Clear and Clutha Bale collided
approaching home turn. Ever Clear and Bobby's County collided and wide home turn. Rotkara Tiger wide
home straight.

Race 10
INSULCO
10:06 pm

340m
Mixed 4/5

Bear Beware, Heza Sizzler, Drury's Boy and Jemalong Peter slow out. Heza Sizzler galloped on the heels
of Codie Garison soon after start checking Codie Harrison. Heza Sizzler galloped on the heels of Drury's
Boy first turn checking Drury's Boy. Master Harkie checked off the heels of Hot Doll approaching home turn.

Race 11
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT5

10:26 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Mr Starbuck and Kudu Irish slow out. Benara Grace and Gozo Bellissomo collided soon after start checking
Benara Grace. Mr Starbuck checked off the heels of Star Of Camelot first turn. Benara Grace and Eldorado
Dancer collided approaching home turn, checking both greyhounds. Mr Startbuck and Twilight Invader
collided entering home straight and again in home straight. Star Of Camelot raced wide home straight.

Race 12
LOCKWOOD FLOATS HT6

10:45 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Arle Lad and Ruffles Bale slow out. Drive Way Sue checked off the heels of Twilight Jessica first turn. Arle
Lad and Miss Melodeon collided home straight. Arle Lad and Ruffles Bale slow out. Drive Way Sue
checked off the heels of Twilight Jessica first turn. Arle Lad and Miss Melodeon collided home straight.




