
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sandown Park
Thursday, 25 May 2006

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
KINGSTON TROPHIES FINAL (GOBIS)

7:08 pm
515m

Maiden Final

Finally Found was slow out. Tidal River, Rufus Stone and Unon Grande collided soon after the start. Halle
crossed to the rail approaching the first turn. Benito's Legend and Vite Cheval collided approaching the first
turn, Finally Found and Token Brooke collided on the first turn checking Finally Found. Benito's Legend
checked off the heels of Finally Found on the first turn checking Vite Cheval and severely checking Benito's
Legend and Rufus Stone. Samples were taken from Halle winner of the event.

Race 2
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT1

7:25 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Sharp, Ollie Collinda, Kobble Flex, Cromlah Bale and Kev's Future were slow out. Josh's Whisky crossed to
the rail soon after the start checking Ollie Collinda, Kobble Flex and Cromlah Bale. Sharp, Ollie Collinda
and Cromlah Bale colided approaching the first turn. Sharp and Cromlah Bale collided approaching the
first turn checking Sharp, Ollie Collinda, Kobble Flex and Cromlah Bale. Sharp checked off the heels of
Cromlah Bale approaching the second turn. Sharp and Ollie Collinda collided on the home turn. Following
the event Now And Then(31.0kg)Box 3 trialled over the 515 Metres. The sectional times were recorded as
followed: 5.25 19.34 30.10

Race 3
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT2

7:44 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Bewdy Mahte was slow out. Dutchy's Reward and Sir Edward collided several times soon after the start
checking both greyhounds. Redding Bale, Cliston Jenna, Dutchy's Reward and Sie Edward collided on the
first turn checking Cliston Jenna and Dutchy's Reward and severely checking Sie Edward and Bewdy
Mahte. Redding Bale and Cliston Jenna collided approaching the second turn checking Cliston Jenna.
Dutchy's Reward and Bewdy Mahte collided in the back straight. Missimo checked off the heels of Collapse
on the third turn. Sir Edward checked off the heels of Dutchy's Reward approaching the home turn. Sir
Edward and Bewdy Mahte collided approaching the home turn. Missimo and Syonic Storm collided on the
home turn.

Race 4
GARY LECHTE NISSAN

8:08 pm
715m

Grade 5

Snowie Jones, Brandeen Lee and Apache Bronx were slow out. Samrakan and Proven Grand collided on
the first turn. Brandeen Lee and Snowie Jones collided on the first turn. Grand Emperor checked off the
heels of Proven Grand on the third turn. Grand Emperor and Proven Grand colldied approaching the fourth
turn. Brandeen Lee checked off the heels of Proven Grand on the fourth turn. Samples were taken from
Samrakan winner of the event. Proven Grand Vetted:Pain both triceps 7 days stand down. Brandeen Lee
Vetted:Left calf soreness 5 days stand down.

Race 5
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT3

8:28 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Where's Nikki, Red Legend and Saint Amber were slow out. Where's Nikki and Saint Amber collided soon
after the start. Fear and Scorchin' collided soon after the start. Fear, Scorchin' and Greenlea Gold collided
on the first turn checking Fear, Scorchin' and Kazar Bale. Where's Nikki raced wide on the first turn.
Scorchin' checked off the heels of Kazar Bale on the second turn checking Trojan Boy. Red Legend raced
wide approaching the second turn. Saint Amber checked off the heels of Scorchin' entering the back
straight. Trojan Boy galloped on the heels of Fear on the third turn checking Trojan Boy and severely
checking Fear. Red Legend raced wide approaching the home turn. Scorchin' raced wide on the home
turn.

Race 6
RADIO SPORT 927

8:52 pm
515m

Grade 4

Bush Flyer, Batten Boom and Prince Lyric were slow out. Bush Flyer and Batten Boom collided soon after
the start. Cash Up galloped on the heels of Zulu Zepha on the first turn causing Zulu Zepha, Batten Boom,
Smurfs Candidate, Youth Worker and Cash Up to collided severely checking Zulu Zepha and causing
Cash Up to fall as a result. Prince Lyric checked off the heels of Bush Flyer in the back straight. Smurfs
Candidate checked off the heels of Bush Flyer on the third turn. Prince Lyric and Youth Worker collided on
the home turn. Cash Up Vetted:Right and left fore and triceps and grazes right inner calf 5 days stand
down. Samples were taken from Dyna Redbull winner of the event.



Race 7
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT4

9:11 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Extremo, Fred's Grando, Nita's Puzzle and Kakadu Allen were slow out. Impishlee crossed to the rail soon
after the start checking Jaimandy Coops. Jaimandy Coops checked off the heels of Impishlee on the first
turn checking Fred's Grando. Fred's Grando, Kakadu Allen and Linton's Title collided entering the back
straight severely checking Fred's Grando. Kakadu Allen and Linton's Title collided approaching the third
turn. Ellie's Diamond checked off the heels of Impishlee approaching the home turn. Ellie's Diamond and
Impiahlee collided on the home turn checking Impishlee. Kakadu Allen clipped the heels of Nita's Puzzle
on the home turn checking both greyhounds.

Race 8
SCHWEPPES

9:35 pm
515m

Free For All

Corzac was slow out. Trewly Special and Azzaneed Ispeed collided on the first turn. Vapour Whirl and
Fenceline collided on the first turn and again aprroaching the second turn. Sleek Physique and Corzac
collided entering the back straight checking Sleek Physique. Schalken and Fenceline collided collided
approaching the home turn. Samples were taken from Fenceline winner of the event.

Race 9
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT5

9:55 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Devil Jet and Lady Chase were slow out. Dubai Flex, Petite Mamselle, Greywinds Raven and Torque Bale
collided soon after the start checking Petite Mamselle and Greywinds Raven. Petite Mamselle, Greywinds
Raven and Devil Jet collided on the first turn checking Greywinds Raven. Token Mike and Lady Chase
collided approaching the second turn. Token Mike raced wide on the second turn. Greywinds Raven
checked off the heels of Devil Jet in the back straight. Dubai Flex and Slamm collided on the third turn.
Devil Jet checked off the heels of Petite Mamselle on the third turn.

Race 10
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT6

10:12 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Handsome Harry, Inside Idol and Itza Bee were slow out. Deitz Bale, Blinman Hero and It's Just Me collided
approaching the second turn checking It's Just Me. Inside Idol checked off the heels of Handsome Harry
approaching the second turn. Deitz Bale and Blinman Hero collided on the second turn. Itza Bee checked
off the heels of Blinman Hero on the third turn.

Race 11
SANDOWN CLUB NIGHTS HT7

10:35 pm
515m

Grade 5 Heat

Brindle Trent, Family Fued and Grand Duchess collided soon after the start. Vegout Jaack and All The
Moves collided approaching the first turn. Brindle Trent, Family Fued, Vegout Jack and All The Moves
collided on the first turn checking Brindle Trent, Family Fued, Grand Duchess and All The Moves. Geoff's
Mate checked off the heels of Family Fued approaching the second turn. Grand Duchess and Vegout Jack
collided on the second turn and again on the third turn checking Vegout Jack. Annoying and Louson Rules
collided approaching the home turn.




