
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Saturday, 25 Jun 2005

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
CLIPSAL HT1

7:15 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Stewards extended the kennelling time to close at 7.15pm to allow several Trainers to arrive on course
after a major motor vehicle accident on the Tullamarine Freeway caused lengthy traffic delays. Drop The
Hammer and Hollywood Wish were slow out. Honlee Pilli and Love A Gossip collided soon after the start.
Love A Gossip, Drop The Hammer and Hollywood Wish collided approaching the first turn checking Drop
The Hammer. Honlee Pilli and Girrawarra Niper collided on the first turn checking Tyler Flex. Drop The
Hammer checked off the heels of Hollywood Wish on the first turn. Love A Gossip checked off the heels of
Hollywood Wish approaching the second turn. Girrawarra Niper checked off the heels of Tyler Flex on the
third turn checking Honlee Pilli and Drop The Hammer. Love A Gossip raced wide approaching the home
turn.

Race 2
TOP CAT VIDEO HT2

7:35 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Baywood Warrior was slow out. Garfield Flyer and Valeri collided soon after the start. Ambria Flex and
Cawbourne Court collided on the first turn checking Cawbourne Court and Valeri. Baywood Warrior
checked off the heels of Ambria Flex approaching the second turn. Baywood Warrior and Valeri collided in
the back straight checking both greyhounds. Ambria Flex and Cawbourne Court collided on the home turn.

Race 3
AWM ELECTRICAL HT3

7:57 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Lillipilli Power and Cosmic Bullet were slow out. Dewana Feel Good and Sports Supremo collided soon
after the start. Lillipilli Power clipped the heels of Boomeron on the first turn and stumbled. Lillipilli Power,
Boomeron and Sports Supremo collided on the first turn checking Lillipilli Power. Express Checkout and
Dewana Feel Good collided approaching the second turn and again in the back straight. Express
Checkout checked off the heels of Dewana Feel Good on the third turn checking Cosmic Bullet. Lillipilli
Power and Express Checkout collided on the home turn. Lillipilli Power was vetted following the Event and
Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's Veterinary Surgeon, reported that he could find no injury apparent with the
greyhound.

Race 4
LOCKWOOD FLOATS

8:15 pm
600m

Mixed 4/5

Billy Young was withdrawn by Stewards at 6.05pm kennelling time after Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's
Veterinary Surgeon, reported that the greyhound was presented for racing with a slight tear to the left
triangle muscle. Acting on a recommendation from Dr. Bell and in accordance with GAR 18(4), the
Stewards will stand Billy Young down from competing for 7 days. Supa Snoop, Beilharz Gold and It's Just
Me were slow out. Liquid Fire raced wide on the first turn. It's Just Me and Ourgirl Joyce collided
approaching the second turn. Beilharz Gold and Ourgirl Joyce collided approaching the third turn. Supa
Snoop checked off the heels of Sisco Buzz on the fourth turn. Liquid Fire raced wide on the fourth turn. A
swab sample was taken from Tiger Strong, the winner of the Event.

Race 5
SPORT 927

8:37 pm
525m

Grade 4

Trewly Hot, Flex Padilla and Junior's Gypsy were slow out. Majestic Flex and Tidal Prince collided soon
after the start. Majestic Flex, Trewly Hot and Junior's Gypsy collided on the first turn checking Trewly Hot
and Billane Boy. Shanlyn Trent checked off the heels of Majestic Flex approaching the second turn
checking Trewly Hot and Flex Padilla. Sand Bag City and Junior's Gypsy collided approaching the home
turn and again on the home turn. Flex Padilla and Shanlyn Trent collided on the home turn. A swab sample
was taken from Junior's Gypsy, the winner of the Event.

Race 6
BROADFORD BOWLING HT4

8:57 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Albarta Prince and Lika Magician were slow out. Fenceline and Leefull collided approaching the first turn.
Fenceline checked off the heels of Shanlyn Junior on the second turn checking Walkaway Free. Cheyne
Royale and Ebony Fix collided on the third turn. Walkaway Free and Leefull collided on the third turn
causing both greyhounds to fall and severely check Lika Magician as a result. Walkaway Free was vetted
following the Event and Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's Veterinary Surgeon, reported that he could find no
injury apparent with the greyhound. Leefull was also vetted following the Event and Dr. Bell reported that
the greyhound sustained injuries to the right shoulder. Acting on a recommendation from Dr. Bell, the



Stewards will stand Leefull down from competing for 5 days.

Race 7
DARLEY JUNIOR FOOTY CLUB HT5

9:20 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Girrawarra Minny, Fireside Osti and Dixie Dunbar were slow out. Girrawarra Minny and Fireside Osti
collided soon after the start. Girrawarra Minny checked off the heels of Fireside Osti approaching the first
turn. Fireside Osti and Dixie Dunbar collided on the first turn. Kick That Goal and Greenlea Gold collided
approaching the home turn checking Amos Flex and Kick That Goal. Kick That Goal and Ultimate Prize
collided on the home turn.

Race 8
CARDINIA TRANSIT

9:42 pm
525m

Mixed 2/3

Sun Alert and Trew Touch were slow out. Timeing, Sun Alert and Trew Touch collided soon after the start
causing Trew Touch to fall. Jemalong Dooby and Kola's Gift collided on the first turn causing Kola's Gift to
fall severely checking Timeing. General Deano and Gun Striker collided on the first turn checking General
Deano. Kola's Gift was vetted following the Event and Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's Veterinary Surgeon,
reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the right shoulder. Acting on a recommendation from Dr.
Bell, the Stewards will stand Kola's Gift down from competing for 5 days. General Deano was vetted
following the Event and Dr. Bell reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the right monkey muscle.
Acting on a recommendation from Dr. Bell, the Stewards will stand General Deano down from competing
for 21 days. Trew Touch was also vetted following the Event and Dr. Bell reported that he could find no
injury apparent with the greyhound.

Race 9
PITSTOP MOWERS HT6

10:05 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Fastbola and Call Me Donna were slow out. Caneater, Fastbola and Heitiki's Champ collided approaching
the first turn checking Caneater and Fastbola. Caneater and Fastbola collided on the first turn. Chad
Waters and Traction Control collided entering the back straight. Chad Waters checked off the heels of
Delete on the third turn checking both greyhounds. Caneater raced wide in the home straight.

Race 10
RACING IN THE NORTH HT7

10:27 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Farm Glory and Weak Spring were slow out. Mister Rubble crossed to the rails soon after the start checking
Hunk. Tess Jones, Mister Rubble and Dalton Doolin collided on the first turn. Farm Glory checked off the
heels of Mister Rubble approaching the second turn checking Dalton Doolin. Camdale Barny checked off
the heels of Weak Spring on the second turn and raced wide. Farm Glory and Mister Rubble collided
entering the home straight. Hunk and Dalton Doolin collided entering the home straight checking Dalton
Doolin.

Race 11
AJS WINDOW CLEANING HT8

10:50 pm
525m

Grade 5 Heat

Brindle Trent was a late scratching at 8.50 a.m. due to illness. Acting in accordance with GAR 18(4), the
Stewards will stand Brindle Trent down from competing for 10 days. Fair Go Amigo and Sonic Bob were
slow out. Gold Fever and White Magic collided soon after the start. Gold Fever, White Magic and Maori May
collided approaching the home turn and again on the home turn checking all three greyhounds.




