
STEWARD'S REPORT

The Meadows
Saturday, 19 Feb 2005

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
THE PET SHED AUSTRALIAN CUP

HT1
7:12 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Try Rex and Mr. Momentum were slow out. Mr. Momentum and Stanton collided soon after the start. Karl
checked off the heels of Royal Donna on the first turn. Mr. Momentum and Stanton collided on the first turn
and again approaching the second turn checking Mr. Momentum. Karl and Try Rex collided on the second
turn. Dyna Kayne and Try Rex collided approaching the home turn and again entering the home straight.
Mr. Momentum checked off the heels of Karl approaching the finishing line. Following the running of the
Event, White River (weight 35.4kgs) trialled over 525 metres starting from Box 2. The sectional times
recorded by the Judge were as follows: 5.13: 18.01: 30.15.

Race 2
LOCKWOOD FLOATS AUSTRALIAN

CUP HT2
7:35 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Trew Touch and Greg were slow out. Knockabout Merle and Trew Touch collided soon after the start. Teddy
Allfire and Mr. Ayejay collided soon after the start. Greg and Hollywood Wish collided soon after the start.
Smurf's Tiger, Teddy Allfire and Mr. Ayejay collided approaching the first turn checking Smurf's Tiger and
Teddy Allfire. Knockabout Merle, Trew Touch, Greg and Hollywood Wish collided approaching the first turn
checking Knockabout Merle, Trew Touch and Greg. Knockabout Merle and Trew Touch collided on the
second turn. Greg was held up for a run on the third turn. Following the running of the Event, Pure Evil
(weight 32.2kgs) trialled over 525 metres starting from Box 2. The sectional times recorded by the Judge
were as follows: 5.17: 18.17: 30.65.

Race 3
DOWNTOWN CLEANING AUSTRALIAN

CUP HT3
7:55 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Gozo Zeppa was slow out. Smack Wallop and Mepunga Jet collided on the first turn. Regal Danny, Bourne
Saintly, Mr. Starbuck, Chewy Rumballs and Gozo Zeppa collided on the first turn checking Mr. Starbuck,
Chewy Rumballs and Gozo Zeppa. Bourne Saintly, Mr. Starbuck and Chewy Rumballs collided
approaching the second turn checking Mr. Starbuck. Regal Danny, Bourne Saintly and Chewy Rumballs
collided on the third turn checking Chewy Rumballs. Gozo Zeppa galloped on the heels of Regal Danny
approaching the home turn. Regal Danny and Chewy Rumballs collided on the home turn. Regal Danny
and Bourne Saintly collided approaching the finishing line. Following the running of the Event, Ceejay's
Vixen (weight 28.8kgs) trialled over 525 metres starting from Box 2. The sectional times recorded by the
Judge were as follows: 5.22: 18.06: 30.17.

Race 4
KLAD SPORT AUSTRALIAN CUP HT4

8:15 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Starriffic was slow out and collided with Tuqiri soon after the start. Cynthia Bale, Major Glory, Tuqiri, Ambria
Flex and Lansley Princess collided approaching the first turn checking Ambria Flex and Lansley Princess.
Cynthia Bale and Ambria Flex collided on the first turn. Cynthia Bale, Ambria Flex and Lansley Princess
collided approaching the second turn checking Cynthia Bale and Lansley Princess. Ambria Flex brushed
the running rail on the second turn. Ambria Flex and Lansley Princess collided entering the back straight
and again on the third turn. Ambria Flex was vetted following the Event and Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's
Veterinary Surgeon, reported that the greyhound sustained injuries to the right shoulder. Acting on a
recommendation from Dr. Bell, the Stewards will stand Ambria Flex down from competing for 5 days.
Subsequent to the Event, Spiritual Rumble (weight 25.8kgs) trialled over 525 metres starting from Box 4.
The sectional times recorded by the Judge were as follows: 5.20: 18.04: 30.29.

Race 5
THE ROOKIE REBEL

8:35 pm
600m

S/E Group 3

Malfoy was slow out. Flex Padilla, All Style and Young Junior collided soon after the start causing All Style
to stumble. Kalimna Rose and Little Things collided entering the front straight. All Style and Young Junior
collided on the third turn. Kalimna Rose checked off the heels of Hunk on the fourth turn. All Style, Young
Junior and Kalimna Rose collided approaching the home turn. Young Junior checked off the heels of All
Style on the home turn checking Kalimna Rose. Swab samples were taken from placegetters - Malfoy (1st)
and Little Things (2nd).

Race 6
THE ZOOM TOP

8:55 pm

Triple Trio, Arvo's Athena and Rubble were slow out. Triple Trio and Sleeveless collided approaching the
second turn. Last Quoted and Triple Trio collided entering the home straight. Rubble raced wide throughut
the Event. Swab samples were taken from placegetters - Rocky (1st) and Master Lightfoot (2nd).



730m
S/E Group 3

Race 7
CADWALLADERS ACCOUNTANTS

AUST CUP HT5
9:20 pm
525m

S/E Heat

Whiplash Smile and Knockabout Cher were slow out. Dyna Caitlan and Whiplash Smile collided soon after
the start. Dazzling Jet and Flex Appeal collided on the first turn causing Flex Appeal to fall. Knockabout
Cher checked off the heels of Harvey Bale approaching the home turn. Flex Appeal was vetted following
the Event and Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's Veterinary Surgeon, reported that he could find no injury
apparent with the greyhound.

Race 8
THE TEMLEE

9:40 pm
525m

S/E Group 3

Trewly Special went up with the lids at box rise and was slow to begin. Whisky Assassin and Eiffella were
slow out and collided soon after the start. Ben's Fury and Go Forever collided on the first turn checking Go
Forever. Whisky Assassin and Eiffella collided on the first turn, on the second turn and again entering the
back straight. Swab samples were taken from the placegetters - Paua To Burn (1st), Ben's Fury (2nd) and
Collide (3rd).

Race 9
HOPPERS CROSSING SECURITY

AUST CUP HT6
10:05 pm

525m
S/E Heat

Mrs. King, Willalaneil, Just Cool and Knockabout Wilma were slow out. Curly Eno and Mrs. King collided
soon after the start. Curly Eno, Mrs. King and Willalaneil collided on the first turn. Mrs. King raced wide in
the home straight. Knockabout Wilma was vetted following the Event and Dr. Michael Bell, the Club's
Veterinary Surgeon, reported that he could find no injury apparent with the greyhound.

Race 10
TOP CAT VIDEO AUSTRALIAN CUP

HT7
10:27 pm

525m
S/E Heat

Larappin Rain was slow out and collided with Amaroo Gypsy on the first turn. Al's Place checked off the
heels of Mouyong Magic on the home turn checking Connemara Wish and Fletcher Bale. Larappin Rain
checked off the heels of Al's Place approaching the finishing line. Following the running of the Event,
Weetbix (weight 29.2kgs) trialled over 525 metres starting from Box 2. The sectional times recorded by the
Judge were as follows: 5.14: 17.84: 29.79.

Race 11
THE WATCHDOG AUSTRALIAN CUP

HT8
10:51 pm

525m
S/E Heat

Hampden Roar, Zed Hot and Lucky Nero were slow out. Hampden Roar and Wolfy Leigh collided soon
after the start. Hampden Roar, Wolfy Leigh, Lucky Nero and Una Bale collided on the first turn checking
Hampden Roar, Lucky Nero and Una Bale. Jemalong Dooby and Thadeus collided entering the back
straight checking Thadeus. Wolfy Leigh and Lucky Nero collided approaching the third turn. Zed Hot was
held up for a run approaching the third turn. Wolfy Leigh, Lucky Nero and Una Bale collided on the third
turn. Thadeus and Una Bale collided approaching the home turn. Wolfy Leigh and Lucky Nero collided on
the home turn.




