
STEWARD'S REPORT

Geelong
Friday, 01 Dec 2006

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
STRAUTMANN AUSTRALIA HT1

7:08 pm
457m

Maiden Heat

Little Maisey and Desi's Delight were slow out. Cool Diva and Our Daisy Duke collided on the first turn,
checking Our Daisy Duke. Buzz Light Beer and Our Daisy Duke collided approaching the home turn,
checking both greyhounds. Little Maisey raced wide in the home straight. Ballistic Bartos and Great Secret
collided approaching the winning post.

Race 2
BLUSH MANGOES ARE HERE HT2

7:27 pm
457m

Maiden Heat

My Kingdom and Bickle's Taxi were slow out. Casside's Prince was very slow out. My Kingdom and Bickle's
Taxi crossed to the outside soon after the start. Burra Trendy and Lord Barwon collided approaching the
first turn. Burra Trendy and Lord Barwon collided on the first turn, checking Lord Barwon, Trump's Gift and
Lord Barwon collided as a result, checking Goldarra. Trump's Gift checked off Lord Barwon approaching
the home turn, checking Goldara and Bickle's Taxi. My Kingdom raced wide entering the home straight and
again in the home straight. Trump's Gift raced wide in the home straight.

Race 3
WAREHOUSE SALES FINAL

7:50 pm
347m

Maiden Final

Tom Baxter was slow out. Duwanna Hand and Mr. Stake Wart collided approaching the first turn, checking
Duwanna Hand. Level Five checked off Divine Line on the first turn, checking Level Five, Our Miss Lily and
Longshot Wally. Level Five, Duwanna Hand and Mr. Stake Wart collided on the home turn, checking Mr.
Stake Wart. Tom Baxter raced wide on the home turn. Our Miss Lily and Longshot Wally collided entering
the home straight. A sample was taken from Divine Line - the winner of the event.

Race 4
GEELONG ADVERTISER FOR SPORT

8:08 pm
457m

Grade 5

Grandin Bale and McRyan Bale were slow out. Call Me Lewey and Foolish Fella collided soon after the
start, checking Foolish Fella. Spring Hawk, Lorenzo Bale and Twisted Teddy collided on the first turn,
checking Lorenzo Bale and Call Me Lewey, severely checking Spring Hawk, Grandin Bale and Foolish
Fella, Foolish Fella stumbled and Spring Hawk fell as a result. Spring Hawk was vetted following the event.
It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injured right shoulder. A stand down period of 21 days was
imposed.

Race 5
MUMS THE WORD

8:27 pm
457m

Grade 5

Bentley Bale and Turbo Charlie collided soon after the start, checking Turbo Charlie. Geonnie, Bowman
Flex and Summer Bale collided approaching the first turn, checking Brother Wolf. Geonnie checked off
Bentley Bale approaching the home turn. Reproducer and Silent Aviator collided approaching the home
turn. Silent Aviator galloped on the heels of Reproducer and Geonnie in the home straight, checking
Bentley Bale. Reproducer, Silent Aviator and Bentley Bale collided approaching the winning post.

Race 6
WHISKY ASSASSIN 25:12

8:48 pm
457m

Grade 4

Cole Miner and Chief Braveheart were slow out. Ekala Impact checked off Witch Magic soon after the start,
Ekala Impact and Ring Top collided as a result, checking Ekala Impact. Vendredi checked off Dutch Deal
soon after the start. Dutch Deal checked off Cool Effort on the first turn. Ring Top and Cole Miner collided
on the first turn, Cole Miner lost ground as a result. Cole Miner raced wide on the home turn. Vendredi lost
ground in the home straight. Vendredi was vetted following the event and re-vetted following Event 8. It was
reported that the greyhound sustained an injured left wrist. A stand down period of 5 days was imposed.
Cole Miner was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained an injured right
metatarsal. A stand down period of 10 days was imposed. A sample was taken from Witch Magic - the
winner of the event.



Race 7
BENDIGO BANK

9:08 pm
600m

Mixed 4/5

Larrah Jean was slow out. Ekala Man, Sadie Sage, Springbok Red, Free Loader and Flying Titan collided
on the first turn, severely checking Springbok Red, Free Loader and Fying Titan, Sadie Sage and Keatstar
fell as a result. Larrah Jean checked off Sweet Leigh approaching the second turn. Ekala Man and
Springbok Red raced wide in the back Sadie Sage was vetted following the event. It was reported that no
apparent injury was found. Keatstar was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound
sustained an injured right hip. A stand down period of 10 days was imposed.

Race 8
MERV JENNINGS SIGNS

9:28 pm
457m

Free For All

Trewly Hot, Classic Sage and Franklin Shadow were slow out. Classic Sage and Franklin Shadow collided
soon after the start. Franklin Shadow checked off Dyna Bogut on the first turn, severely checking Franklin
Shadow and Crossfire Bale. Serious and Trewly Hot collided on the home turn.

Race 9
TOP CAT VIDEO

9:48 pm
347m

Mixed 4/5

Meyhem and Vegout Jack were slow out. Vegout Jack and Fool's Cash collided soon after the start,
checking Fool's Cash. Meyhem and Go Jess Go collided soon after the start. Budding Lass crossed to the
rail on the first turn, severely checking Chynna Solaire, Go Jess Go and Bengal Spur. Chynna Solaire and
Bengal Spur collided on the home turn, checking Chynna Solaire and causing Go Jess Go to race wide.

Race 10
XMAS PACKAGES @ GEELONG

10:08 pm
457m

Grade 5

Mater Dater was slow out. Magna Jet, Mater Dater and Mr. Demon collided soon after the start. Straight On,
Kitara and Silent Samauri collided on the first turn, checking Straight On and Mater Dater. Multi Grip
checked off Straight On approaching the home turn. Straight On raced wide on the home turn, checking
Multi Grip.

Race 11
PALAIS BINGO

10:28 pm
457m

Grade 5

Ocean Rock, Pixel Bale and Performance Inc were slow out. Dance The Tango stumbled soon after the
start. Ocean Rock checked off Pixel Bale on the first turn. Banga Chukchi and Bomber Elite collided on the
first turn. Major Lee clipped the heels of Dance The Tango on the first turn. Pixel Bale and Major Lee
collided approaching the home turn, checking Major Lee. Dance The Tango checked off Banga Chukchi
approaching the home turn. Major Lee was vetted following the event. It was reported that the greyhound
sustained an injured right digital flexor. A stand down period of 5 days was imposed.

Race 12
PITSTOP MOWERS

10:52 pm
347m

Grade 5

Cinderella Man, Crazy Hand and Brock's Girl were slow out. Forrester Inc and Cinderella Man collided on
the first turn, checking Cinderella Man. Crazy Hand checked off Alydar on the first turn. Kickback Black and
Alydar collided approaching the home turn, checking Alydar. Kickback Black and Brock's Girl raced wide
on the home turn. Kickback Black and Cinderella Man collided entering the home straight and again in the
home straight.




