
STEWARD'S REPORT

Bendigo
Monday, 11 Apr 2005

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
BENDIGO BANK HT1

7:05 pm
430m

Maiden Heat

Tickle The State and Sava Lee collided soon after the start checking Tickle The State. Adonis Ablaze, It's
Mine and Beautiful Eyes collided soon after the start checking Beautiful Eyes. Kirra Vin checked off Adonis
Ablaze approaching the first turn. Expire checked off Sava Lee on the first turn. Expire checked off Adonis
Ablaze on the first turn. Beautiful Eyes, Kirra Vin, Tickle The State and April Fools Day collided approaching
the home turn. Sava Lee vetted: no apparent injury.

Race 2
RAPIDVITE HT2

7:26 pm
430m

Maiden Heat

Ourboy Milo was slow out. Ourboy Milo checked off Bowl Over soon after the start. Golden Gams checked
off Belinda's Vin on the first turn checking Directs The Best, Dyna Merlin and Bowl Over. Directs The Best
and Golden Gams collided approaching the home turn. Bowl Over and Dyna Merlin collided on the home
turn. Ourboy Milo raced wide in the home straight. Ourboy Milo eased several times in the home straight.
Ourboy Milo vetted: left back muscle, stand down 10 days. Acting under A.G.R.R 82.1(d), stewards charged
Ourboy Milo with failing to pursue the lure with due commitment (by reason of injury) and directed that the
greyhound perform a Satisfactory Trial (all tracks) before any furture nomination will be accepted.

Race 3
TOP CAT VIDEO HT3

7:46 pm
430m

Maiden Heat

One Force was a late scratching at 5:50PM due to weight variation. Ourgirl Rose was slow out. Cameron
Allen and Rather Be First collided approaching the first turn checking Rather Be First. Gear Change and
Alpha Apollo collided on the first turn checking Alpha Apollo. Littlewhite Bull checked off Mystical Cass on
the first turn. Cameron Allen and Mystical Cass collided in the home straight.

Race 4
WINNING EDGE

8:06 pm
430m

Grade 5

Nobody's Promise, Dyna Domino and Gunnabee Bulger were slow out. Gunnabee Bulger checked off
Grand Havoc approaching the first turn. Grand Havoc checked off Peter Lehmann on the first turn. Peter
Lehmann galloped on the heels of Manalu Jess on the first turn checking Peter Lehmann, Dyna Domino
and Manulu Jess. Manalu Jess galloped on the heels of Dyna Domino approaching the home turn
checking Dyna Domino, severely checking Manalu Jess which stumbled as a result. Dyna Domino and
Gunnabee Bulger collided entering the home straight. Grand Havoc and Gunnabee Bulger collided in the
home straight.

Race 5
NATURE VET

8:26 pm
430m

Grade 5

Awesome Harry and Magic Trance were slow out. Cleary Bale and Goomerah Bale were checked
approaching the first turn. Magic Trance and Dotaye You collided approaching the home turn. Booma
Queen, Awesome Harry, Cleary Bale and Goomerah Bale collided on the first turn checking Cleary Bale
and Goomerah Bale. Magic Trance and He's Offski collided entering the home straight.

Race 6
BENDIGO ADVERTISER

8:46 pm
430m

Mixed 3/4

Must Be Keen and Stormy Lodge were slow out. Dyna Bradford crossed to the inside approaching the first
turn checking Farrason, Awesome Music and Scorchin' Bale. Scorchin' Bale contacted the rail on the first
turn checking Must Be Keen, Scorchin' Bale lost considerable ground as a result. Stormy Lodge checked
off Dyna Snow on the first turn. Farrason contacted the rail approaching the home turn. Stormy Lodge
raced wide on the home turn. Farrason checked off Dyna Bradford in the home straight. Scorchin' Bale
vetted: left quad, stand down 14 days.

Hare Chaser was slow out. Bail Up checked off Bahama Thunder approaching the first turn. Half A Grand



Race 7
WAREHOUSE SALES

9:06 pm
430m

Mixed 4/5

checked off Hare Chaser on the first turn. Master Antonio brushed the running rail on the first turn. Bahama
Thunder galloped on the heels of Hare Chaser on the home turn checking both greyhounds. Shawcross
and Half A Grand collided on the home turn. Half A Grand and Excella Bale collided entering the home
straight. Shawcross and Half A Grand collided in the home straight.

Race 8
EAGLE PAK FINAL (GOBIS)

9:26 pm
430m

Grade 5 Final

Pre-race samples were taken from Zac's Legend. Rollins Rocket and Mr. Starbuck were slow out. Light Of
Vin checked off Charred Chili approaching the first turn checking Rollins Rocket, Bootman and Mr.
Starbuck. Light Of Vin and Vanilli collided on the first turn. Fortified Charm checked off Zac's Legend on the
first turn.

Race 9
WIN TELEVISION

9:46 pm
545m

Mixed 4/5

Dyna Ricky, Carlyle Encore and Ultraflex were slow out. No Speed Limit and Cheeky Meleeky collided
soon after the start. Dyna Ricky faltered on the first turn and lost ground as a result. Ourboy Blue checked
off Nonna Nancy on the second turn. No Speed Limit and Cheeky Meleeky collided approaching the home
turn. Carlyle Encore raced wide on the home turn. No Speed Limit and Cheeky Meleeky collided entering
the home straight. Dyna Ricky faltered in the home straight. Dyna Ricky vetted: fractured metacarpal, stand
down 28 days.

Race 10
EAT WELL LIVE WELL

10:06 pm
430m

Grade 5

Pre-race samples were taken from Rymill. Rymill crossed to the inside aproaching the first turn checking
Be Part Of, Secret Package and Bahama Tiki. Bahama Tiki checked off Be Part Of on the first turn.
Marlena's Vin checked off Rymill on the first turn, Marlena's Vin lost ground as a result. Go Robber raced
wide entering the home straight.

Race 11
BRIAN DUNN FORD

10:25 pm
430m

Grade 5

Dyna Matrix, Sisco Lady, Golden Ring and Sarah Lindsay were slow out. Sisco Lady, Famous and Sarah
Lindsay collided soon after the start. Dyna Matrix, Sisco Lady, Famous and Sarah Lindsay collided on the
first turn checking Sisco Lady, Golden Ring, Famous and Sarah Lindsay. Dyna Matrix and Terasaki Storm
collided entering the home straight. Golden Ring raced wide on the home turn.

Race 12
FLIGHT CENTRE BENDIGO

10:40 pm
430m

Grade 5

Joveda and Brother wolf were slow out. Kangarilla Road and Dainty Queen collided soon after the start.
Jaydee Power and Bourne Smokey collided soon after the start, approaching the first turn and on the first
turn checking Jaydee Power. Sun Downer galloped on the heels of Brother Wolf on the first turn severely
checking both greyhounds. Jaydee Power checked off Brother Wolf on the home turn. Bourne Smokey and
Allen Leslie collided in the home straight. Kangarilla Road crossed to the inside approaching the winning
post checking Dainty Queen.




