
STEWARD'S REPORT

Sale
Sunday, 20 Aug 2006

Weather conditions:

Track condition:

Officials for Meeting

Steward in Charge:

Stewards:

Judges:

Lure Drivers:

Starter:

Kennel Supervisor:

Kennel Attendants:

Veterinarian:

Race 1
MORELLI HOME FURNITURE FINAL

(GOBIS)
5:20 pm
440m

Maiden Final

Ty O'Mac, Callum's Spirit, Wild Aimz and Be Mental were slow out. Bridget Jones, Dr. Wiggins and Be
Mental collided on the first turn checking Dr. Wiggins. Callum's Spirit and Wild Aimz collided on the first
turn. Ty O'Mac and Bridget Jones collided on the first turn checking Bridget Jones. Callum's Spirit and Wild
Aimz collided approaching the home turn. A sample was taken from Jamazz - the winner of the event.

Race 2
SALE - MAFFRA VET CENTRE

5:40 pm
440m

Grade 5

Tymalu Mystery, Remain Silent and Chalana Storm were slow out. Tymalu Mystery and Quick Pick collided
approaching the first turn checking Quick Pick. Quick Pick and Blue Eyed Boy collided on the first turn
checking Blue Eyed Boy. Shamus Delight clipped off the heels of Tymalu Mystery on the first turn causing
Shamus Delight to fall and severely checking Chalana Storm. Remain Silent and Tymalu Mystery collided
approaching the home turn checking Tymalu Mystery. Quick Pick and Tymalu Mystery collided on the home
turn. Quick Pick and Chalana Storm collided approaching the winning post. Blue Eyed Boy was vetted
following the event. It was reported that there was no apparent injury found. Shamus Delight was vetted
following the event. It was reported that the greyhound sustained multiple small cuts to the mouth. No stand
down period was applied.

Race 3
WIN TV (1-2 WINS) HT1

6:00 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Ultimate Lad, Nistevo and Loan Archie were slow out. Nistevo and Ultimate Lad collided soon after the
start causing Ultimate Lad to contact the running rail. Loan Archie, Come 'N' See and Nistevo collided on
the first turn severely checking Come 'N' See and Nistevo. Parumba Girl, Morgan's Me Mum and Dr.
Talesha collided in the home straight. Ultimate Lad was vetted following the event. It was reported that
there was no apparent injury found.

Race 4
COCA COLA (1-2 WINS) HT2

6:20 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Dr. Laycock, Shell Belle, Arvo's Ramona and Mr. Schmick were slow out. Drak, Bomber Elite, Mr. Schmick
and Shell Belle collided on the first turn checking Bomber Elite and severely checking Shell Belle. Contra
Waters and Arvo's Ramona collided approaching the home turn. Contra Waters and Arvo's Ramona
collided in the home straight. Dr. Laycock and Mr. Schmick collided in the home straight.

Race 5
BENDIGO BANK (1-2 WINS) HT3

6:40 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Carlisle Way was slow out and Harlequinn Jack was very slow out. Clod Case, Caribbean Flash and See
Ya There collided on the first turn checking Caribbean Flash. Cold Case and See Ya There collided
approaching the home turn. Caribbean Flash and Carlisle Way collided in the home straight.

Race 6
SALE GREYHOUND BINGO

7:05 pm
520m

Grade 5

Leo's Mark, Taco Belle and Rustys Return were slow out. Taco Belle, Rustys Return and Burnout Blue
collided on the first turn checking Taco Belle and Rustys Return. Maybe A Diva and Ebony Duchess
collided on the first turn. Taco Belle and Rustys Return collided on the second turn checking Leo's Mark.
Maybe A Diva checked off the heels of Ebony Duchess approaching the home turn. A sample was taken
from Ima Prize - the winner of the event.



Race 7
SMOLENAARS PLUMBING

7:25 pm
440m

Grade 4

Felicity's Zoe, Salegrey Tabaret and Ship To Shore were slow out. Magnetic Charm and Cherry Flame
collided soon after the start checking Magnetic Charm. Salegrey Tabaret and Ship To Shore collided
approaching the first turn checking Salegrey Tabaret. Teddy Evil, Dr. Schellenberg and Felicity's Zoe
collided on the first turn checking Felicity's Zoe. Teddy Evil, Salegrey Tabaret and Ship To Shore collided on
the first turn checking Ship To Shore.

Race 8
G & T SHARP PLASTERING

7:50 pm
440m

Free For All

Feel The Fury and Devil Jet were slow out. Blue Bonnie, Malthouse, Barwidgee John, Smurfs Candidate
and Sharp collided approaching the first turn checking Blue Bonnie, Malthouse and Barwidgee John.
Malthouse and Barwidgee John collided on the first turn. Blue Bonnie and Feel The Fury collided
approaching the home turn.

Race 9
BSG AUSTRALIA (1-2 WINS) HT4

8:10 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Intent On Gold, Dr. Willoughby and Arvo's Dionne were slow out. Brother Waters, Elite Mancunian and
Miami Molly collided approaching the first turn checking Elite Mancunian and Dr. Willoughby and severely
checking Intent On Gold. Design Glory, Elite Mancunian, Miami Molly and Dare To Defy collided on the first
turn checking Elite Mancunian and Dare To Fly. Arvo's Dionne and Miami Molly collided approaching the
home turn. Miami Molly checked off the heels of Arvo's Dionne on the home turn. Design Glory and Dare To
Fly collided entering the home straight.

Race 10
MACLEOD PRINTING (1-2 WINS) HT5

8:30 pm
440m

Grade 5 Heat

Craig Is Away and Smurf's Voyager were slow out. Parumba Drum and Craig Is Away collided approaching
the first turn checking Parumba Drum. Dr. Abigail, Smurf's Voyager, Junior Rockette and Craig Is Away
collided on the first turn checking Dr. Abigail. Junior Rockette and Smurf's Voyager collided approaching
the home turn. Junior Rockette, Smurf's Voyager and Craig Is Away collided entering the home straight
checking Junior Rockette and Craig Is Away. Tamikanne raced wide entering the home straight.




